We cerllfy this is a true, correct

Purchasing Form #10 BID TABULATION . Abstract of all bids received.
PAGE 1 OF 2 PAGES DEKALB COUNTY - DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING AND CONTRACTING Canetta Petty .
COMMODITY: Trash Bags (REVISED) : Opened & Read By:
INVITATION NO: 3003345 Imani Marley-Husban_ds
Tabutated By:
DATE OF OPENING; November 12, 2014 TIME: 3:00 P.M. ¥
Addendum
JNO.| . . —... NAME OF BIDDER. . Discount| Delivery [ No of co 1 - ltem1 itam 2 {tem 3 {tem 4 Item& | -ltam B Itam 7 itam 8 [tem 9 item10 | Form18- | - - Remarks
1 [Dyna Pak Corp Net30 | 10days 2 No No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 24.59 Mo Bld | NoBid | NoBid No Bld 17.35
2 |Central Poly-Bag Corp. Net30 | 10days 2 Yes 1240 | 2040 | 28.10 2410 | 2300 | 3800 | 1980 | 1590 | 21.90 15.00
3 Ale_ph Industry . MNet 30 10 days 2 Yas 21.00 38.85 40,32 31.92 26.88 27.81 15.58 16.96 23.94 12.65
4 |Fordion Pkag., Ltd. Net 30 10 days 2 No 11.66 22.65. 25.80 18.83 18,84 47.72 9,78 14.86 17.79 16.70
10-20 ’
5 {All I_-\merican Poly Net 30 |days ARD 2 Yas 10.78 20.28 29.42 23,39 18.40 72,52 12.50 14.26 18.04 16.91
6_|Freeman Forms & Supplies, Inc. Net3o | 1o0days [ 2 Yes 2275 | 4292 | 4351 | 3452 | 2020 | 3e22 | sael | 1641 [ 2580 | 24.00
19,344 36.48A | 3B8.98A 2934A | 24.82A | 33.34A | 49.82A | 16.24A | 21.84A 20.48A
15.328 28,688 | 29.34B 21.34B 17.488 | 26.828 | 34.34B | 13.98B 18.48B 17488
12.48C 2282C | 23.82C 18.68C | 15.82C | 24.84C | 29.72C | 11.94C | 14.34C 12.84C
7-10 days 9.94D 18.88D | 19.98D 16.84D 12,980 | 21.68D | 23.32D | 10.74D | 11.48D 10.820
7 linterbo Packing Corp . 01 Net 30] ARO 2 Yes 3,34 18.98E 18.98E 14.84E 10.34E | 21.68E | 17.84E | 10.74E 9.82E 10.82E
. 10 days .
8 |WasteZero, [ng. Net 30 ARQ 2 Yes No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bld | NoBid 18.04 No Bid 21.38
10 days /
g |Calico Industries, Inc. Net 30 ARQ 2 Yes 10.64 23.89 23.34 20.42 20.07 No Bid 11.44 12.94 1748 17.78 ’

Number of Solicitations Recevied: 9 ‘
Numberof Notifications Sent: 77 Appfoved For Award By Board of Commissloners
Numbar of No Bids Racelved: 0

Director / Assistant Director
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INVITATION-NO: 3003345
|DATE OF OPENING: November 12, 2014 TIME: 3:00 P.M.

BID TABULATION

DEKALB COUNTY - DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING AND CONTRACTING

COMMODITY: Trash Bags (REVISED)

itemn 17 ftem 18 [tem 19 Item 20 Total Amount

NO. NAME OF BIDDER Item 11 Iltem 12 ltem 13 ftem 14 Iltem 15 Item 16

1 |Dyria Pak Coip™ 16.93 NoBid | NoBid | NoBid 30.69 MoBid | NoBid | MoBid | NoBid | MNoBid |$ 801,438.60

2_|Central Poly-Bag Corp. 16.00 | 18.30 28.00 20.10 23.80 20.80 13,80 22.90 13.90 2200 |§ 853,800.00

3 |Aleph Industry 13.00 25.50 38.85 40.32 31.92 19.33 13.54 24.19 15.44 2350 |$ 785,771.90

4 |Fordion Pkg., Ltd. 1582 |- 11.25 29.88 27.90 . | 2288 19.86 15.88 18.25 15.94 No Bid No Bid

5 |All American Poly 21.51 24.86 24.40 36.78 22.72 18.76 13.88 24.86 13.23 NoBid | § 1,036,533.40

8_|Freeman Forms & Supplies, Inc. 25.86 20.99 41.15 24.09 25.88 20.99 4118 28.02 17.32 3261 |3 1,977,097.35
21.98A | 17.84A | 34.98A | 37.84A | 20.94A | 1690A | 17.94A | 23824 | 1472A | 27.72A $ 4,887,112.60A
1882B | 15.34B | 30.20B | 31.74B | 2582B | 1690B | 15.34B | 18.34B | 1232B { 22.348 $ 4,887,112.60B
13.84C | 11.48C | 26.18C | 28.84C | 2272C | 16.90C | 13.32C | 16.74C | 10.24C | NoBidC $ 4,8687,112.60C
10.94D 8.48D 23.34D | 20720 | 18.82D | 16.80D | 13.32D | NoBidD | NoB8idD | NoBid D 0.00D

7_[Interbo Packing Corp. 9.98E 8.48E 19.34E 15.84E 15.84E 18.90E | 13.32E | NoBidE | MoBidE | NoBidE 0.00 E

8 |WasteZero, Inc. 21.50 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 15.86 25.25 14.23 1857 |$ 024 508.50

9 |Calico Industries, Inc. 18.70 13.74 25.10 23.34 20.42 16.44 15.95 24.35 13.25 NoBid | $ 725,391.20




