
ITB No. 18-100988 DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING AND CONTRACTING Bid Opening: 10/5/2018

ITB Name: Sewer System Cleaning BID TABULATION Price Schedule Opening: 10/15/2018

Agent: Randy Webb

ITEM DESCRIPTION

ESTIMATED NUMBER 

OF UNITS UNIT OF MEASURE UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED 

AMOUNT UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED 

AMOUNT UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED 

AMOUNT UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED 

AMOUNT UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED 

AMOUNT UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED 

AMOUNT UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED 

AMOUNT UNIT PRICE

EXTENDED 

AMOUNT

1
6-INCH THROUGH 12-INCH SEWER INSIDE THE RIGHT OF 

WAY/HIGHWAY/UTILITY EASEMENT
2,000,000 LF  $             1.30  $    2,600,000.00 1.20$                              2,400,000.00$       1.70$             3,400,000.00$     1.25$             2,500,000.00$    1.30$             2,600,000.00$ 1.25$             2,500,000.00$    1.44$             2,880,000.00$      1.25$            2,500,000.00$    

2
6-INCH THROUGH 12-INCH SEWER OUTSIDE THE RIGHT OF 

WAY/HIGHWAY/UTILITY EASEMENT
1,000,000 LF  $             1.40  $    1,400,000.00 1.20$                              1,200,000.00$       1.70$             1,700,000.00$     1.28$             1,280,000.00$    1.25$             1,250,000.00$ 1.25$             1,250,000.00$    1.44$             1,440,000.00$      1.65$            1,650,000.00$    

3
15-INCH THROUGH 24-INCH SEWER INSIDE THE RIGHT OF 

WAY/HIGHWAY/UTILITY EASEMENT
15,000 LF  $             1.46  $         21,900.00 1.30$                              19,500.00$            1.70$             25,500.00$          1.25$             18,750.00$          0.40$             6,000.00$        1.35$             20,250.00$         1.44$             21,600.00$           2.50$            37,500.00$         

4
15-INCH THROUGH 24-INCH SEWER OUTSIDE THE RIGHT OF 

WAY/HIGHWAY/UTILITY EASEMENT
30,000 LF  $             1.58  $         47,400.00 1.30$                              39,000.00$            1.70$             51,000.00$          1.28$             38,400.00$          0.50$             15,000.00$      1.35$             40,500.00$         1.44$             43,200.00$           4.00$            120,000.00$       

5 6-15 FEET DEEP 6,000 EA  $           55.00  $       330,000.00 10.00$                            60,000.00$            70.00$           420,000.00$        20.00$           120,000.00$       12.00$           72,000.00$      68.35$           410,100.00$       73.00$           438,000.00$         70.00$          420,000.00$       

6 >16  FEET DEEP 400 EA  $           55.00  $         22,000.00 10.00$                            4,000.00$              75.00$           30,000.00$          20.00$           8,000.00$            12.00$           4,800.00$        *$86.85 34,740.00$         73.00$           29,200.00$           80.00$          32,000.00$         

 $    4,421,300.00 3,722,500.00$       5,626,500.00$     3,965,150.00$    3,947,800.00$ 4,255,590.00$    4,852,000.00$      4,759,500.00$    

7 6-INCH THROUGH 12-INCH SEWER 10,000 LF  $             1.30  $         13,000.00 No bid No bid 8.00$             80,000.00$          No bid 4.50$             45,000.00$      2.50$             25,000.00$         4.00$             40,000.00$           2.00$            20,000.00$         

8 15-INCH THROUGH 24-INCH SEWER 8,000 LF  $             1.30  $         10,400.00 No bid No bid 11.00$           88,000.00$          No bid 7.50$             60,000.00$      6.50$             52,000.00$         6.00$             48,000.00$           2.50$            20,000.00$         

 $         23,400.00 
---

168,000.00$        
---

105,000.00$    77,000.00$         88,000.00$           40,000.00$         

 $    4,444,700.00 
---

5,794,500.00$     
---

4,052,800.00$ 4,332,590.00$    4,940,000.00$      4,799,500.00$    

9

Regular labor rate per hour

If an option, Bidder shall also state regular labor hours worked by firm:

N/A

hour  $              115.00 No bid 175.00$               No bid 70.00$             68.50$                54.66$                  85.00$                 

10

Overtime labor rate per hour

If an option, Bidder shall also state overtime labor hours worked by firm:
N/A

hour  $              115.00 No bid 325.00$               No bid 105.00$           99.55$                79.37$                  110.00$              

11

Bidder shall state discount (as a percentage) from Materials/Parts List for 

special materials/parts requirements. 

(Do not state the discount in the form of cost-plus. Stating the discount in 

the form of cost-fails to tell the County the percentage that it will save.)

N/A EA

0% No bid 0% No bid 0% N/A 0.5% 0%

Yes Yes Yes

Graham & Associates Southeast Pipe Survey Performance Contracting Inc.

Number of Bids Received:  8 

SUBTOTAL:

BIDDER ADDS AMOUNT TOTAL FOR ITEMS 7 THROUGH 8 AND ENTERS RESULTS

Yes

Woolpert Inc. Crawford Enterprises

Yes Yes Yes Yes

Yes

Yes

Company Pipe Logistics The Renee Group

Yes

*In the initial Bid Tabulation, Southeast Pipe Survey's price for Item No. 6 was incorrectly listed as $68.35. Please note that the correct price for this line item is $86.85 each.

Yes Yes

NOTES -  DETAIL JUSTIFICATION

Yes Yes

Yes Yes

LSBE Participation Benchmark/GFE

Attendance at the Mandatory LSBE Meeting (Yes/No)

Separate Sealed Price Schedule (Yes/No)

Yes

Yes Yes Yes Yes

Yes

Yes

Enviro-Waste Services Group

LUMP SUM TOTAL:

BIDDER ADDS AMOUNT TOTAL FOR ITEMS 1 THROUGH 6 AND ENTERS RESULTS

GRAND TOTAL:

BIDDER ADDS AMOUNT TOTAL FOR ITEMS 1 THROUGH 8 AND ENTERS RESULTS

Form Revised 03/01/18

The Bid Tabulation for ITB 18-100988 was revised on 10/22/2018.




