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DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING AND CONTRACTING

DeKalb County QUOTE TABULATION
RFQ No.: 19-3003678 RFQ Due Date: April 18, 2019
RFQ Name: Workplace Leadership and Development Agent Name: Sophia Thomas
CRM -
Spexcell The Leadership : VCIT
P&A Albert imizati . L ITS . . Fly High
o Optimization 1 514 g\siness | Focus7, | Training & | simply HR, | Relmagine | Institute at YN A iplenetworking, | Progressive | Solutions, [ Flenory &
COMPANY Training | Management | Group, LLC/ The - Enterprises, Coaching, X Company,
Soluti G Becoming Proiect Services, LLC LLC Employment | LLC ATL, Inc. | Columbus State LLC LLC Techniques, Inc.| Inc. DBA LLC
olutions roup Ingc ject, Services nc. University TargetlT
Total Bid $ 19,800.00] $ 20,000.00| $ 24,000.00| $ 24,000.00| $ 14,000.00| $ 19,400.00 | $ 23,862.00 | $ 18,000.00 | $ 11,300.00 | $  24,000.00 | $ 23,600.00 | $ 24,000.00 | $  24,000.00 | $ 24,000.00 No Bid
Average Cost Per Participant $ 99.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 12000 | $ 120.00 | $ 70.00 | $ 97.00|$ 11931 ]$% 90.00 | $ 56.50 | $ 12000 | $ 118.00] $ 120.00 | $ 120.00 | $  200.00 No Bid
Total number of Participants Served 200 200 200 200 200 200 200 200 200 No Bid 200 200 200 200 No Bid
Bidder read and acknowledges
Attachments B, C and D (Circle One) Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes — — Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes —
. ‘The Impact
Da\'\//:ﬁgierlerC Prmlz?;nm Skydos ) Sherisse . Experience, | ey Solutions
COMPANY DBA Zoe GLaVouLIIIiaC K(e:dra S{;e aks Counseling & H Jordaln Int GrotL_Jp | SI nlvtl_e W Forrest eTrainers.org Traslnlr:jg by égg‘ljr-rzst LLC DBA Gipsy Czr::uﬁ::ls g::sagzr Get tlc:] ::ka’
Training & roup, onsulting Consulting, ouse, Inc. | International, olutions Consulting eeds g Learning Solutions 9 '
. LLC Group of
Consulting LLC
Metro
Total Bid $ 22,500.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 19,600.00 | $ 21,000.00 | $ 20,000.00 | $ 19,994.00 | $ 21,400.00 | $ 24,000.00 | $ 21,200.00 | $ 21,500.00 | $ 22,520.00 | $  18,000.00 | $ 20,800.00 | $21,600.00
Average Cost Per Participant $ 11250 | $ 100.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 98.00 | $ 105.00| $ 100.00 | $ 9997 |$ 107.00] $ 12000 | $ 106.00 | $ 10750 ] $ 113.00 | $ 90.00|$ 104.00]% 108.00
Total number of Participants Served 200 200 200 200 200 20 200 200 200 200 200 200 200 200 200
Bidder read and acknowledges
Attachments B, C and D (Circle One) Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes - Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Notes - Detail Justification
JK Flenory & Company, LLC did not include quote form.
* The "=" indicates no response given.

Tawana T. Hardn

Digitally signed by Tawana T.

ett Hardnett

Date: 2019.05.07 10:19:18 -04'00"

Witness Signature:

Agent Signature:

Sophia Thomas

igi
DN: cn:
ou

Digtally signed by Sophia Th

u=Te:
Date: 2019,05.07 10:39:18 0400

Digitally signed by Cathryn Horner
Date: 2019.05.09 14:35:05 -04'00'

Cathryn Horner

Form Revised 03/01/18
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