

ITB No. 21-101475		PURCHASING AND				Bid Opening: 02/16/2022									
ITB Nam		Right of Way Mowing and Lawn Maint.				Price Schedule Opening 3/18/2022									
		Annual Contract with 2 Options to Renew				Agent: Marion Dean									
				LET US LOVE YOUR LAWN, INC		FLEX LANDSCAPING, LLC		PROCUTTERS LANDSCAPES, INC		WORLDSCAPES, LLC		EXECUTIVE REALTY SOLUTIONS		ABSOLUTE QUALITY SERVICES, LLC	
Item #	Mowing Location	Proximity Service Area Length (in Miles)	Proximity Service Area Width (in Feet)	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required
1	Rockbridge Road, includes: islands and medians, cement medians. (N. Clarendon Ave. to Hwy 124)	12.01	5'-10'	\$18,000.00	N/A	\$5,824.85	N/A	\$6,605.50	N/A	\$3,420.00	N/A	\$4,560.00	N/A	\$2,100.00	N/A
2	Booker Avenue (Kelly St. to Dead End)	0.04	5'-10'	\$2,400.00	N/A	\$19.40	N/A	\$22.00	N/A	\$285.00	N/A	\$20.00	N/A	\$50.00	N/A
3	Kelly Street (N. Clarendon Ave. to Reed St.)	0.17	5'-10'	\$2,400.00	N/A	\$82.45	N/A	\$93.50	N/A	\$285.00	N/A	\$65.00	N/A	\$75.00	N/A
4	Proctor Avenue (Kelly St. to Dead End)	0.48	5'-10'	\$2,400.00	N/A	\$232.80	N/A	\$264.00	N/A	\$285.00	N/A	\$190.00	N/A	\$100.00	N/A
5	Rowland Road (Rockbridge Rd. to S. Indian Creek Dr.)	2.03	5'-10'	\$4,800.00	\$2,400.00	\$974.40	\$10.15	\$1,116.50	\$355.25	\$570.00	\$250.00	\$770.00	\$100.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
6	Allgood Circle (Rockbridge Rd. to Dead End.)	2	5'-10'	\$4,800.00	N/A	\$970.00	N/A	\$1,100.00	N/A	\$570.00	N/A	\$760.00	N/A	\$350.00	N/A
7	Allgood Road (Rockbridge Rd. to Redan Rd.)	1.9	5'-10'	\$4,800.00	\$2,400.00	\$911.50	\$10.00	\$1,045.00	\$332.50	\$570.00	\$250.00	\$750.00	\$90.00	\$350.00	\$350.00
8	Elam Road (Rowland Rd. to S. Hairston Rd.)	0.9	5'-10'	\$2,400.00	N/A	\$436.50	N/A	\$495.00	N/A	\$285.00	N/A	\$370.00	N/A	\$175.00	N/A
9	Ellis Road (Rowland Rd. to Redan Rd.)	0.64	5'-10'	\$2,400.00	\$2,400.00	\$305.40	\$5.00	\$352.00	\$112.00	\$285.00	\$200.00	\$245.00	\$75.00	\$100.00	\$150.00
10	Sheppard Road (Rockbridge Rd. to the Stn. Mtn. City Limit)	1	5'-10'	\$2,400.00	N/A	\$485.00	N/A	\$550.00	N/A	\$285.00	N/A	\$380.00	N/A	\$175.00	N/A
11	Hambrick Road, includes: islands and medians (See Note 5) (E. Ponce de Leon Ave. to Rockbridge)	3.82	5'-10'	\$9,600.00	\$4,800.00	\$1,833.60	\$19.10	\$2,101.00	\$668.50	\$1,140.00	\$250.00	\$1,410.00	\$175.00	\$700.00	\$500.00
12	Rays Road (E. Ponce de Leon Ave. to Rockbridge Rd.)	4.52	5'-10'	\$12,000.00	\$6,000.00	\$2,168.60	\$22.60	\$2,486.00	\$791.00	\$1,425.00	\$325.00	\$1,665.00	\$250.00	\$875.00	\$600.00
13	Alford Road (Stephenson Rd. to S. Deshon Rd.)	1.63	10'-15'	\$4,800.00	N/A	\$790.55	N/A	\$896.50	N/A	\$570.00	N/A	\$595.00	N/A	\$390.00	N/A
14	Stephenson Road (See Note 5) (Rockbridge Rd. to Rock Mtn. Rd.)	9.44	10'-15'	\$24,000.00	N/A	\$4,578.40	N/A	\$5,192.00	N/A	\$2,850.00	N/A	\$3,500.00	N/A	\$1,950.00	N/A
15	S. Deshon Road (See Note 5) (Stephenson Rd. to Wellborn Rd.)	6.4	10'-15'	\$16,800.00	N/A	\$3,104.00	N/A	\$3,520.00	N/A	\$1,995.00	N/A	\$2,400.00	N/A	\$1,216.00	N/A
16	N. Deshon Road (Rockbridge Rd. to the County Line)	1.5	10'-15'	\$4,800.00	N/A	\$727.50	N/A	\$825.00	N/A	\$570.00	N/A	\$555.00	N/A	\$285.00	N/A
17	Bermuda Road (N. Deshon Rd. to the County Line)	3.38	5'-10'	\$9,600.00	N/A	\$1,639.30	N/A	\$1,859.00	N/A	\$1,140.00	N/A	\$1,250.00	N/A	\$642.20	N/A

				LET US LOVE YOUR LAWN, INC		FLEX LANDSCAPING, LLC		PROCUTTERS LANDSCAPES, INC		WORLDSCAPES, LLC		EXECUTIVE REALTY SOLUTIONS		ABSOLUTE QUALITY SERVICES, LLC	
Item #	Mowing Location	Proximity Service Area Length (in Miles)	Proximity Service Area Width (in Feet)	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required
18	Pleasant Hill Road (Hwy 124 to the County Line)	5.7	10'-20'	\$28,800.00	\$14,400.00	\$2,736.00	\$28.50	\$3,135.00	\$997.50	\$1,710.00	\$150.00	\$2,100.00	\$275.00	\$1,225.50	\$750.00
19	Rogers Lake Road (See Note 5) (1270 Rogers Lake Rd. to S. Deshon Rd.)	2.3	5'-10'	\$7,200.00	N/A	\$1,115.50	N/A	\$1,265.00	N/A	\$855.00	N/A	\$850.00	N/A	\$402.50	N/A
20	Asbury Drive (Stephenson to Hwy 124)	1.44	5'-10'	\$4,800.00	N/A	\$698.40	N/A	\$792.00	N/A	\$570.00	N/A	\$530.00	N/A	\$252.00	N/A
21	Union Grove Road (Pleasant Hill Rd. to DeKalb County Line and Hwy 124 to Rockdale County Line)	6.0	10'-20'	\$28,800.00	N/A	\$2,910.00	N/A	\$3,300.00	N/A	\$1,710.00	N/A	\$2,220.00	N/A	\$1,290.00	N/A
22	Norris Lake Road (Gwinnett County Line to Gwinnett County Line)	1.3	5'-10'	\$4,800.00	N/A	\$630.50	N/A	\$715.00	N/A	\$570.00	N/A	\$480.00	N/A	\$227.50	N/A
23	Norris Lake Drive (Norris Lake Rd. to Pleasant Hill Rd.)	0.74	5'-10'	\$2,400.00	N/A	\$358.90	N/A	\$407.00	N/A	\$570.00	N/A	\$270.00	N/A	\$175.00	N/A
24	Smith James Road (Pleasant Hill Rd. to Norris Lake Dr.)	0.5	5'-10'	\$2,400.00	N/A	\$242.50	N/A	\$275.00	N/A	\$570.00	N/A	\$185.00	N/A	\$175.00	N/A
25	Giles Road (Wellborn Rd. to Phillips Rd.)	1.34	5'-10'	\$4,800.00	N/A	\$649.90	N/A	\$737.00	N/A	\$570.00	N/A	\$495.00	N/A	\$234.50	N/A
26	S. Stone Mtn. Lithonia Road (Rockbridge Rd. to City Limit)	12.7	10'-20'	\$62,400.00	NO BID	\$6,096.00	\$63.50	\$6,985.00	\$2,222.50	\$3,705.00	\$750.00	\$4,700.00	\$600.00	\$2,730.50	\$1,365.25
27	N. Stone Mtn. Lithonia Road (Rockbridge Rd. to Cross Railroad)	6.3	10'-20'	\$33,600.00	N/A	\$3,055.50		\$3,465.00	N/A	\$1,995.00	N/A	\$2,300.00	N/A	\$1,354.50	N/A
28	King Road (Walker Rd. to Panola Rd.)	1.57	10'-20'	\$9,600.00	N/A	\$761.45	N/A	\$863.50	N/A	\$570.00	N/A	\$580.00	N/A	\$337.55	N/A
29	Sheppard Place (Redan Rd. to Dead End)	0.45	10'-20'	\$4,800.00	N/A	\$218.25	N/A	\$247.50	N/A	\$570.00	N/A	\$165.00	N/A	\$175.00	N/A
30	Redan Road (Covington Hwy to S. Sin Mtn Lithonia Rd.)	6.13	10'-20'	\$28,800.00	\$14,400.00	\$2,942.40	\$30.65	\$3,371.50	\$1,072.75	\$1,995.00	\$350.00	\$2,265.00	\$200.00	\$1,317.95	\$800.00
31	Glenwood Rd./Glenwood Ave. (Covington Hwy and Wilkinson Dr./I-20)	12.4	5'-10'	\$31,200.00	N/A	\$6,014.00	N/A	\$6,820.00	N/A	\$3,705.00	N/A	\$4,580.00	N/A	\$2,170.00	N/A
TOTAL (GROUP I: #1-31)				\$382,800.00	\$46,800.00	\$53,513.55	\$189.50	\$60,901.50	\$6,552.00	\$36,195.00	\$2,525.00	\$41,205.00	\$1,765.00	\$21,950.70	\$4,865.25
				Sub Total		Sub Total		Sub Total		Sub Total		Sub Total		Sub Total	
GROUP II				LET US LOVE YOUR LAWN, INC		FLEX LANDSCAPING, LLC		PROCUTTERS LANDSCAPES, INC		WORLDSCAPES, LLC		EXECUTIVE REALTY SOLUTIONS		ABSOLUTE QUALITY SERVICES, LLC	
Item #	Mowing Location	Proximity Service Area Length (in Miles)	Proximity Service Area Width (in Feet)	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Edging As Needed Only	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Edging As Needed Only	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Edging As Needed Only	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Edging As Needed Only	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Edging As Needed Only	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Edging As Needed Only
32	McDaniel Street (Conyers St. to Dead End)	0.54	10'-20'	\$4,800.00	N/A	\$261.90	N/A	\$297.00	N/A	\$285.00	N/A	\$190.00	N/A	\$190.00	N/A
33	Conyers Street (Turner Hill Rd. to Rock Chapel Rd.)	0.86	10'-20'	\$4,800.00	N/A	\$417.10	N/A	\$473.00	N/A	\$285.00	N/A	\$300.00	N/A	\$190.00	N/A
34	Rhodes Street (Conyer Rd. to Dead End)	0.11	5'-10'	\$2,400.00	N/A	\$53.35	N/A	\$60.50	N/A	\$285.00	N/A	\$40.00	N/A	\$175.00	N/A

				LET US LOVE YOUR LAWN, INC		FLEX LANDSCAPING, LLC		PROCUTTERS LANDSCAPES, INC		WORLDSCAPES, LLC		EXECUTIVE REALTY SOLUTIONS		ABSOLUTE QUALITY SERVICES, LLC	
Item #	Mowing Location	Proximity Service Area Length (in Miles)	Proximity Service Area Width (in Feet)	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required
35	Silver Hill Road (Hugh Howell Rd. to E. Ponce de Leon Ave)	2.77	10'-20'	\$14,400.00	N/A	\$1,343.45	N/A	\$1,523.50	N/A	\$855.00	N/A	\$970.00	N/A	\$595.55	N/A
36	Lilburn S. Mtn Road (Silver Hill Rd. to Gwinnett County Line)	3.4	10'-20'	\$19,200.00	N/A	\$1,649.00	N/A	\$1,870.00	N/A	\$1,140.00	N/A	\$1,190.00	N/A	\$731.00	N/A
37	Mountain View Connector (Mtn. View Dr. to W. Mtn. St.)	0.42	10'-20'	\$4,800.00	N/A	\$203.70	N/A	\$231.00	N/A	\$285.00	N/A	\$145.00	N/A	\$175.00	N/A
38	Central Drive (Cimmarron Dr. to Goldsmith)	2.59	5'-10'	\$7,200.00	\$3,600.00	\$1,243.20	\$12.95	\$1,424.50	\$453.25	\$855.00	\$250.00	\$905.00	\$30.00	\$453.23	\$250.00
39	Brer Rabbit Road (See Note 5) (Stonegate Ind. Blvd. to Hambrick Rd.)	1.46	5'-10'	\$4,800.00	N/A	\$708.10	N/A	\$803.00	N/A	\$570.00	N/A	\$500.00	N/A	\$255.50	N/A
40	Kensington Road (Redan Rd. to Memorial Dr.)	5.2	10'-20'	\$28,800.00	\$14,400.00	\$2,496.00	\$26.00	\$2,860.00	\$910.00	\$1,710.00	\$425.00	\$1,800.00	\$30.00	\$1,118.00	\$600.00
41	Porter Road (Kensington Rd. to Covington Hwy)	1.34	5'-10'	\$4,800.00	N/A	\$649.90	N/A	\$737.00	N/A	\$570.00	N/A	\$460.00		\$275.00	N/A
42	Durham Parkway (Kensington Rd. to S. Indian Creek Dr.)	0.64	10'-20'	\$4,800.00	N/A	\$310.40	N/A	\$352.00	N/A	\$285.00	N/A	\$224.00	N/A	\$150.00	N/A
43	George Luther Drive (Memorial Dr. to Durham Park Dr.)	1	10'-30'	\$7,200.00	\$3,600.00	\$480.00	\$5.00	\$550.00	\$175.00	\$285.00	\$185.00	\$350.00	\$30.00	\$400.00	\$400.00
44	Memorial College Avenue (Memorial Ave. to Durham Park Ave.)	0.92	10'-20'	\$4,800.00	N/A	\$446.20	N/A	\$506.00	N/A	\$285.00	N/A	\$320.00	N/A	\$190.00	N/A
45	Norman Road (Rays Rd. to Church St.)	0.65	5'-10'	\$2,400.00	N/A	\$315.25	N/A	\$357.50	N/A	\$285.00	N/A	\$225.00	N/A	\$175.00	N/A
46	North Indian Creek Drive (Montreal Rd. to Memorial Dr.)	1.7	5'-10'	\$4,800.00	N/A	\$824.50	N/A	\$935.00	N/A	\$570.00	N/A	\$595.00	N/A	\$297.50	N/A
47	Snapfinger Road (Austin Dr. to Columbia to Snapfinger Wood Dr.)	3.22	10'-20'	\$19,200.00	\$9,600.00	\$1,561.70	\$16.10	\$1,771.00	\$563.50	\$1,140.00	\$350.00	\$1,125.00	\$30.00	\$850.00	\$500.00
48	Amsler Road (Flakes Mill Rd. to Scarborough Rd.)	1.45	5'-10'	\$4,800.00	N/A	\$703.25	N/A	\$797.00	N/A	\$570.00	N/A	\$505.00	N/A	\$253.75	N/A
49	Shadow Rock Drive (S. Stn. Mtn. Lithonia Rd. to S. Stn. Mtn. Lithonia Rd.)	3.37	5'-10'	\$9,600.00	N/A	\$1,634.45	N/A	\$1,853.50	N/A	\$1,140.00	N/A	\$1,175.00	N/A	\$839.00	N/A
50	Stewart Mill Road (Rockbridge Rd. to Bermuda Rd.)	0.75	10'-30'	\$7,200.00	N/A	\$363.75	N/A	\$412.50	N/A	\$285.00	N/A	\$260.00	N/A	\$1,290.00	N/A
51	Swift Street (Covington Hwy. to Max Cleland Blvd.)	1.14	5'-10'	\$4,800.00	N/A	\$552.90	N/A	\$627.00	N/A	\$570.00	N/A	\$400.00	N/A	\$199.50	N/A
52	Railroad Avenue (Brockett Rd. to Lynburn Dr.)	1.36	10'-20'	\$9,600.00	N/A	\$659.60	N/A	\$748.00	N/A	\$570.00	N/A	\$476.00	N/A	\$258.40	N/A
53	Briarcliff Road (See Note 5) (Henderson Mill Rd. to N. Druid Hill Rd.)	8.54	5'-10'	\$21,600.00	N/A	\$4,141.90	N/A	\$4,697.00	N/A	\$2,565.00	N/A	\$2,990.00	N/A	\$1,494.50	N/A
54	Briarcliff Way (Briarcliff Rd. to Henderson Mill Rd.)	0.31	5'-10'	\$2,400.00	N/A	\$150.35	N/A	\$170.50	N/A	\$285.00	N/A	\$108.00	N/A	\$100.00	N/A

				LET US LOVE YOUR LAWN, INC		FLEX LANDSCAPING, LLC		PROCUTTERS LANDSCAPES, INC		WORLDSCAPES, LLC		EXECUTIVE REALTY SOLUTIONS		ABSOLUTE QUALITY SERVICES, LLC	
Item #	Mowing Location	Proximity Service Area Length (in Miles)	Proximity Service Area Width (in Feet)	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required
55	Biltmore Drive (Clifton Rd. to Lavista Rd.)	1.4	5'-10"	\$4,800.00	N/A	\$679.00	N/A	\$770.00	N/A	\$570.00	N/A	\$490.00	N/A	\$245.00	N/A
56	Mercer University Drive (Chamblee Tucker Rd. to Henderson Mill Rd.)	1.45	10'-20"	\$9,600.00	N/A	\$703.25	N/A	\$797.50	N/A	\$570.00	N/A	\$500.00	N/A	\$275.00	N/A
57	Old Stn. Min. Rd. (Lilburn-Stn. Mtn. Rd. to Gwinnett County Line)	2.4	10'-20"	\$14,400.00	N/A	\$1,164.00	N/A	\$1,320.00	N/A	\$855.00	N/A	\$840.00	N/A	\$456.00	N/A
58	S. Hairston Rd. (Wesley Chapel Rd. to Rockbridge Rd.)	16.8	10'-20"	\$81,600.00	\$40,800.00	\$8,064.00	\$84.00	\$9,240.00	\$2,940.00	\$4,845.00	\$750.00	\$5,880.00	\$30.00	\$3,192.00	\$1,900.00
59	N. Hairston Rd. (Rockbridge Rd. to E. Ponce de Leon Ave.)	8.1	10'-20"	\$38,400.00	\$19,200.00	\$3,888.00	\$40.50	\$4,455.00	\$1,417.50	\$2,280.00	\$425.00	\$2,335.00	\$30.00	\$1,539.00	\$980.00
TOTAL (GROUP II: #32-59)				\$ 348,000.00	\$ 91,200.00	\$ 35,668.20	\$ 184.55	\$ 40,639.00	\$ 6,459.25	\$24,795.00	\$2,385.00	\$25,298.00	\$180.00	\$16,362.93	\$4,630.00
				Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total
GROUP III		Proximity Service Area	Proximity Service Area	LET US LOVE YOUR LAWN, INC		FLEX LANDSCAPING, LLC		PROCUTTERS LANDSCAPES, INC		WORLDSCAPES, LLC		EXECUTIVE REALTY SOLUTIONS		ABSOLUTE QUALITY SERVICES, LLC	
Item #	Mowing Location	Proximity Service Area Length (in Miles)	Proximity Service Area Width (in Feet)	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Edging As Needed Only	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Edging As Needed Only	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Edging As Needed Only	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Edging As Needed Only	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Edging As Needed Only	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Edging As Needed Only
60	Marjan Drive (Presidential Pkwy to Dead End)	0.31	5'-10"	\$2,400.00	N/A	\$150.35	N/A	\$170.50	N/A	\$285.00	N/A	\$115.00	N/A	\$175.00	N/A
61	Northlake Parkway (Henderson Mill Rd. to Lawrenceville Hwy.)	2.64	10'-20"	\$14,400.00	\$7,000.00	\$1,267.20	\$13.20	\$1,457.50	\$462.00	\$855.00	\$230.00	\$975.00	\$200.00	\$501.60	\$250.00
62	Northcrest Road (Chamblee Tucker Rd. to Oakcliff Rd.)	1.21	5'-10"	\$4,800.00	\$2,400.00	\$580.80	\$10.00	\$665.50	\$211.75	\$570.00	\$200.00	\$445.00	\$100.00	\$300.00	\$180.00
63	Pleasantdale Road (Tucker Norcross Rd. to I-85)	5.61	10'-20"	\$28,800.00	\$14,400.00	\$2,692.80	\$28.05	\$3,085.50	\$981.75	\$1,710.00	\$250.00	\$2,075.00	\$200.00	\$1,065.90	\$780.00
64	Presidential Parkway (Chamblee Tucker Rd. to Buckeye Rd.)	2.16	10'-20"	\$14,400.00	N/A	\$1,047.60	N/A	\$1,188.00	N/A	\$855.00	N/A	\$800.00	N/A	\$410.40	
65	Pangborn Road (Lavista Rd. to Frazier Rd.)	2.55	5'-10"	\$7,200.00	N/A	\$1,236.75	N/A	\$1,402.50	N/A	\$855.00	N/A	\$945.00	N/A	\$446.25	N/A
66	Montreal Road (See Note 5) (N. Indian Creek Dr. to Lawrenceville Hwy. to Lavista Rd.)	6.16	10'-20"	\$38,600.00	\$19,300.00	\$2,956.80	\$30.80	\$3,388.00	\$1,078.00	\$1,995.00	\$250.00	\$2,275.00	\$200.00	\$1,170.40	\$860.00
67	Montreal Circle (Montreal Rd. to Montreal Rd.)	0.63	10'-20"	\$4,800.00	N/A	\$305.55	N/A	\$346.50	N/A	\$285.00	N/A	\$230.00	N/A	\$190.00	N/A
68	Montreal Court (Montreal Cir. To Dead End)	0.3	5'-10"	\$2,400.00	N/A	\$145.50	N/A	\$165.00	N/A	\$285.00	N/A	\$110.00	N/A	\$175.00	N/A
69	North Druid Hills Road. Note: The parameter of North Druid Hills is from Valley Brook to I-85 bridge ONLY. (See Note 5) (Lawrenceville Hwy to Briarcliff Rd.)	7.47	5'-10"	\$19,200.00	\$9,600.00	\$3,585.60	\$37.35	\$4,108.50	\$1,307.25	\$2,280.00	\$350.00	\$2,765.00	\$200.00	\$1,560.00	\$880.00

				LET US LOVE YOUR LAWN, INC		FLEX LANDSCAPING, LLC		PROCUTTERS LANDSCAPES, INC		WORLDSCAPES, LLC		EXECUTIVE REALTY SOLUTIONS		ABSOLUTE QUALITY SERVICES, LLC	
Item #	Mowing Location	Proximity Service Area Length (in Miles)	Proximity Service Area Width (in Feet)	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required
70	Valley Brook Road, includes: islands and medians (E. Ponce de Leon Ave. to Lawrenceville Hwy)	2.9	5'-10"	\$7,200.00	\$3,600.00	\$1,392.00	\$14.50	\$1,595.00	\$507.50	\$855.00	\$285.00	\$1,070.00	\$200.00	\$507.50	\$393.00
71	DeKalb Ind. Way (Lawrenceville Hwy to N. Arcadia)	2.31	5'-10"	\$7,200.00	\$3,600.00	\$1,108.80	\$11.55	\$1,270.50	\$404.25	\$855.00	\$285.00	\$855.00	\$200.00	\$438.90	\$175.00
72	Winn Way (DeKalb Ind. Blvd. to N. Arcadia Ave)	0.71	5'-10"	\$2,400.00	\$1,200.00	\$339.35	\$10.00	\$390.50	\$124.25	\$285.00	\$185.00	\$265.00	\$200.00	\$175.00	\$150.00
73	North Arcadia Ave.: County owned plot is located at the corner of Springdale St. and N. Arcadia Ave. contractor can mow further into this lot to ensure it is kept in good order. (DeKalb Ind. Way to Sam Crossing)	0.5	5'-10"	\$2,400.00	\$1,200.00	\$237.50	\$5.00	\$275.00	\$87.50	\$285.00	\$185.00	\$185.00	\$100.00	\$175.00	\$87.00
74	Buckeye Road (Chamblee Tucker Rd. to Presidential Pkwy)	0.23	5'-10"	\$2,400.00	N/A	\$111.55	N/A	\$126.50	N/A	\$285.00	N/A	\$85.00	N/A	\$175.00	
75	Chamblee-Tucker Road, includes: islands and medians. Note: Contractor shall pay extra attention to shrubbery in the islands and medians. (I-85 to Lavista Rd.)	11.1	10'-20'	\$57,600.00	\$28,800.00	\$5,328.00	\$55.50	\$6,105.00	\$1,942.50	\$3,135.00	\$425.00	\$4,105.00	\$200.00	\$3,109.00	\$1,100.00
76	Cooledge Road (E. Ponce de Leon Ave. to Lawrenceville Hwy)	1.84	5'-10"	\$4,800.00	N/A	\$892.40	N/A	\$1,012.00	N/A	\$570.00	N/A	\$680.00	N/A	\$175.00	N/A
77	Brockett Road (E. Ponce de Leon Ave. to Hwy 78)	3.32	5'-10"	\$9,600.00	N/A	\$1,610.20	N/A	\$1,826.00	N/A	\$1,140.00	N/A	\$1,225.00	N/A	\$581.00	N/A
78	Bancroft Circle (Fellowship Rd. to Railroad Ave)	0.32	5'-10"	\$2,400.00	N/A	\$155.20	N/A	\$176.00	N/A	\$285.00	N/A	\$115.00	N/A	\$175.00	N/A
79	Fellowship Road (Lavista Rd. to Lawrenceville Rd.)	2	5'-10"	\$4,800.00	\$2,400.00	\$960.00	\$10.00	\$1,100.00	\$350.00	\$570.00	\$225.00	\$740.00	\$100.00	\$400.00	\$180.00
80	McLendon Drive (E. Ponce de Leon Ave. to Lawrenceville Hwy)	1.4	5'-10"	\$4,800.00	N/A	\$679.00	N/A	\$770.00	N/A	\$570.00	N/A	\$515.00	N/A	\$260.00	N/A
81	Juliette Road - Include Medians (E. Ponce de Leon Ave. to Dead End)	4.5	10'-20'	\$24,000.00	N/A	\$2,182.50	N/A	\$2,475.00	N/A	\$1,425.00	N/A	\$1,665.00	N/A	\$787.50	N/A
82	East Ponce de Leon Avenue (Sam Crossing to N. Hairston Rd.)	7.1	10'-30'	\$57,600.00	\$28,800.00	\$3,408.00	\$35.50	\$3,905.00	\$1,242.50	\$1,995.00	\$425.00	\$2,625.00	\$200.00	\$1,526.50	\$672.00
83	Idlewood Road (E. Ponce de Leon Ave. to Lawrenceville Hwy)	4.31	5'-10"	\$12,000.00	N/A	\$2,090.35	N/A	\$2,370.50	N/A	\$1,425.00	N/A	\$1,595.00	N/A	\$754.25	N/A
84	Sarr Parkway (See Note 5) (Idlewood Rd. to Mtn. Ind. Blvd)	1.62	10'-20'	\$9,600.00	N/A	\$785.70	N/A	\$891.00	N/A	\$570.00	N/A	\$600.00	N/A	\$300.00	N/A
85	Roadhaven Drive (E. Ponce de Leon Ave. to Greer Cir.)	1.34	5'-10"	\$4,800.00	N/A	\$649.90	N/A	\$737.00	N/A	\$570.00	N/A	\$495.00	N/A	\$275.00	N/A
86	Belvedere Lane (Columbia Dr. to Rupert Rd.)	0.77	5'-10"	\$2,400.00	N/A	\$373.42	N/A	\$423.50	N/A	\$285.00	N/A	\$285.00	N/A	\$175.00	N/A

				LET US LOVE YOUR LAWN, INC		FLEX LANDSCAPING, LLC		PROCUTTERS LANDSCAPES, INC		WORLDSCAPES, LLC		EXECUTIVE REALTY SOLUTIONS		ABSOLUTE QUALITY SERVICES, LLC	
Item #	Mowing Location	Proximity Service Area Length (in Miles)	Proximity Service Area Width (in Feet)	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required
87	Bouldercrest Road (See Note 5) (Atl. City Limit to Henry County Line)	8.04	10'-20'	\$43,200.00	\$21,600.00	\$3,859.20	\$40.20	\$4,422.00	\$1,407.00	\$2,280.00	\$425.00	\$2,975.00	\$200.00	\$1,527.00	\$823.00
88	Glenwood Rd./Glenwood Ave. (Covington Hwy and Wilkinson Dr./I-20)	12.4	10'-20'	\$62,400.00	\$31,200.00	\$5,952.00	\$62.00	\$6,820.00	\$2,170.00	\$3,705.00	\$425.00	\$4,585.00	\$200.00	\$2,170.00	\$1,100.00
TOTAL (GROUP III: #60-88)				\$ 458,600.00	\$ 175,100.00	\$ 46,084.02	\$ 363.65	\$ 52,668.00	\$ 12,276.25	\$ 31,065.00	\$4,145.00	\$35,400.00	\$2,500.00	\$19,681.20	\$7,630.00
				Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total	\$	Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total
GROUP IV				LET US LOVE YOUR LAWN, INC		FLEX LANDSCAPING, LLC		PROCUTTERS LANDSCAPES, INC		WORLDSCAPES, LLC		EXECUTIVE REALTY SOLUTIONS		ABSOLUTE QUALITY SERVICES, LLC	
Item #	Mowing Location	Proximity Service Area Length (in Miles)	Proximity Service Area Width (in Feet)	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Edging As Needed Only	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Edging As Needed Only	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Edging As Needed Only	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Edging As Needed Only	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Edging As Needed Only	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Edging As Needed Only
89	Cedar Grove Road (Bouldercrest Rd. to Moreland Ave)	2	10'-20'	\$9,600.00	\$4,800.00	\$960.00	\$10.00	\$1,100.00	\$350.00	\$570.00	\$225.00	\$680.00	\$100.00	\$400.00	\$227.00
90	Constitution Road (See Note 5) (Bouldercrest Rd. to Bailey St.)	3.35	10'-20'	\$19,200.00	N/A	\$1,624.75	N/A	\$1,842.50	N/A	\$1,140.00	N/A	\$1,140.00	N/A	\$586.25	N/A
91	Fayetteville Road (See Note 5) (Bouldercrest Rd. to Glenwood Rd. to Moreland Ave)	3.7	10'-20'	\$19,200.00	\$9,600.00	\$1,776.00	\$18.50	\$2,035.00	\$647.50	\$1,140.00	\$300.00	\$1,250.00	\$270.00	\$703.00	\$410.00
92	Key Road (See Note 5) (Bouldercrest Rd. to Fayetteville Rd.)	1.79	5'-10'	\$4,800.00	N/A	\$868.15	N/A	\$984.50	N/A	\$570.00	N/A	\$600.00	N/A	\$313.25	N/A
93	East Conley Road (Cedar Grove Rd. to County Line)	1.45	10'-20'	\$9,600.00	N/A	\$703.25	N/A	\$797.50	N/A	\$570.00	N/A	\$490.00	N/A	\$275.00	N/A
94	Conley Road (Moreland Ave. to County Line)	1.51	10'-20'	\$9,600.00	N/A	\$732.35	N/A	\$830.50	N/A	\$570.00	N/A	\$515.00	N/A	\$286.90	N/A
95	Moore Road (Bouldercrest Rd. to Cedar Grove Rd.)	1.76	10'-20'	\$9,600.00	N/A	\$853.60	N/A	\$968.00	N/A	\$570.00	N/A	\$600.00	N/A	\$334.00	N/A
96	Henrico Road (Moore Rd. to Moreland Ave)	3.7	10'-20'	\$19,200.00	N/A	\$1,794.50	N/A	\$2,035.00	N/A	\$1,140.00	N/A	\$1,255.00	N/A	\$703.00	N/A
97	West Side Place (Henrico Rd. to Dead End)	0.15	5'-10'	\$2,400.00	N/A	\$72.75	N/A	\$82.50	N/A	\$285.00	N/A	\$50.00	N/A	\$175.00	N/A
98	Koppers Road (Henrico Rd. to Dead End)	0.29	5'-10'	\$2,400.00	N/A	\$140.65	N/A	\$159.50	N/A	\$285.00	N/A	\$100.00	N/A	\$175.00	N/A
99	Oakvale Road (River Rd. to Panthersville Rd.)	1.4	10'-20'	\$9,600.00	\$4,800.00	\$672.00	\$10.00	\$770.00	\$245.00	\$570.00	\$225.00	\$45.00	\$40.00	\$190.00	\$100.00
100	Panthersville Road (See Note 5) (Flat Shoal Pkwy to Bouldercrest Rd.)	3.73	10'-20'	\$19,200.00	\$9,600.00	\$1,790.40	\$18.65	\$2,051.50	\$652.75	\$1,140.00	\$300.00	\$125.00	\$270.00	\$825.00	\$750.00
101	River Road (See Note 5) (Bouldercrest Rd. to Hwy 155)	10.78	10'-30'	\$79,200.00	\$39,600.00	\$5,174.40	\$53.90	\$5,929.00	\$1,886.50	\$3,135.00	\$425.00	\$3,665.00	\$1,000.00	\$3,317.00	\$1,400.00
102	Linecrest Road (Bouldercrest Rd. to River Rd.)	3.62	10'-20'	\$19,200.00	\$9,600.00	\$1,737.60	\$18.10	\$1,991.50	\$633.50	\$1,140.00	\$300.00	\$1,230.00	\$320.00	\$1,125.00	\$960.00
103	Ward Lake Road (Bouldercrest Rd. to Linecrest Rd.)	1.83	10'-20'	\$9,600.00	N/A	\$887.55	N/A	\$1,006.50	N/A	\$570.00	N/A	\$280.00	N/A	\$867.00	N/A

				LET US LOVE YOUR LAWN, INC		FLEX LANDSCAPING, LLC		PROCUTTERS LANDSCAPES, INC		WORLDSCAPES, LLC		EXECUTIVE REALTY SOLUTIONS		ABSOLUTE QUALITY SERVICES, LLC	
Item #	Mowing Location	Proximity Service Area Length (in Miles)	Proximity Service Area Width (in Feet)	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required
104	Waldrop Road (River Rd. to Flat Shoal Pkwy)	1.33	10'-20'	\$9,600.00	N/A	\$645.05	N/A	\$731.50	N/A	\$570.00	N/A	\$450.00	N/A	\$252.70	N/A
105	Lombard Road (Panola Rd. to River Rd.)	2.9	10'-20'	\$14,400.00	N/A	\$1,406.50	N/A	\$1,595.00	N/A	\$855.00	N/A	\$985.00	N/A	\$770.00	N/A
106	Mosley Road (Old River Rd. to Dead End)	0.26	5'-10'	\$2,400.00	N/A	\$126.10	N/A	\$143.00	N/A	\$285.00	N/A	\$85.00	N/A	\$75.00	N/A
TOTAL (GROUP IV: #89-106)				\$ 368,800.00	\$ 78,000.00	\$ 21,965.60	\$ 129.15	\$ 25,053.00	\$ 4,415.25	\$ 15,105.00	\$ 1775.00	\$13,545.00	\$ 2,000.00	\$11,373.10	\$3,847.00
				Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total
GROUP V				LET US LOVE YOUR LAWN, INC		FLEX LANDSCAPING, LLC		PROCUTTERS LANDSCAPES, INC		WORLDSCAPES, LLC		EXECUTIVE REALTY SOLUTIONS		ABSOLUTE QUALITY SERVICES, LLC	
Item #	Mowing Location	Proximity Service Area Length (in Miles)	Proximity Service Area Width (in Feet)	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Edging As Needed Only	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Edging As Needed Only	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Edging As Needed Only	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Edging As Needed Only	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Edging As Needed Only	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Edging As Needed Only
107	Weclunee Road (River Rd. to Dead End back to Flakes Mill Rd.)	1.6	10'-20'	\$14,400.00	N/A	\$776.00	N/A	\$880.00	N/A	\$570.00	N/A	\$560.00	N/A	\$304.00	N/A
108	Line Street (Glenwood Rd. to Memorial Dr.)	0.97	10'-20'	\$7,200.00	N/A	\$470.45	N/A	\$533.50	N/A	\$285.00	N/A	\$350.00	N/A	\$190.00	N/A
109	White Oak Drive (Capistrana Pl. to Candler Rd.)	1.84	5'-10'	\$4,800.00	N/A	\$892.40	N/A	\$1,012.00	N/A	\$570.00	N/A	\$645.00	N/A	\$322.00	N/A
110	Midway Road (Covington Hwy to Memorial Dr. and Columbia Dr. to S. Candler St.)	5.8	10'-20'	\$28,800.00	\$14,400.00	\$2,784.00	\$29.00	\$3,190.00	\$1,015.00	\$170.00	\$425.00	\$2,030.00	\$30.00	\$1,102.00	\$725.00
111	Mercer Road (Covington Hwy to Malibu Dr.)	0.98	5'-10'	\$2,400.00	N/A	\$475.30	N/A	\$539.00	N/A	\$285.00	N/A	\$350.00	N/A	\$175.00	N/A
112	Ripplewater Drive (See Note 5) (Skyhaven Rd. to Eastland Rd.)	0.53	5'-10'	\$2,400.00	N/A	\$257.05	N/A	\$291.50	N/A	\$285.00	N/A	\$185.00	N/A	\$175.00	N/A
113	Thompson Mill Road (Snappfinger Rd. to 4645 Thompson Mill Rd.)	3.69	5'-10'	\$9,600.00	\$4,800.00	\$1,771.20	\$18.45	\$2,029.50	\$645.75	\$1,140.00	\$300.00	\$1,200.00	\$30.00	\$700.00	\$500.00
TOTAL (GROUP V: #107-113)				\$ 69,600.00	\$ 19,200.00	\$ 7,426.40	\$ 47.45	\$ 8,475.50	\$ 1,660.75	\$4,845.00	\$725.00	\$5,320.00	\$60.00	\$2,968.00	\$1,225.00
				Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total	Sub Total
GRAND TOTAL (GROUP I -V)				\$1,527,800.00	\$ 410,300.00	164,657.77	\$ 914.30	187,737.00	\$ 31,363.50	\$112,005.00	\$11,555.00	\$120,768.00	\$6,505.00	\$72,335.93	\$22,197.25
Optional Locations				LET US LOVE YOUR LAWN, INC		FLEX LANDSCAPING, LLC		PROCUTTERS LANDSCAPES, INC		WORLDSCAPES, LLC		EXECUTIVE REALTY SOLUTIONS		ABSOLUTE QUALITY SERVICES, LLC	
Item #															
114	Cost per Mile to Service Mowing on Other County Right-of-Way Locations	1 Mile	5'-10'	\$2,400.00		\$485.00		\$550.00		\$350.00		\$450.00		\$175.00	
115	Cost per Mile to Service Edging on Other County Right-of-Way Locations	1 Mile	5'-10'	\$1,200.00		NO BID		\$175.00		\$350.00		\$100.00		\$175.00	
116	Cost per Mile to Apply Herbicide on Other County Right-of-Way Locations	1 Mile	5'-10'	\$1,800.00		NO BID		\$250.00		\$300.00		\$200.00		\$135.00	

				LET US LOVE YOUR LAWN, INC		FLEX LANDSCAPING, LLC		PROCUTTERS LANDSCAPES, INC		WORLDSAPES, LLC		EXECUTIVE REALTY SOLUTIONS		ABSOLUTE QUALITY SERVICES, LLC	
Item #	Mowing Location	Proximity Service Area Length (in Miles)	Proximity Service Area Width (in Feet)	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required	Cost Per 6 Wk Cycle (mowing & herbicide)	Cost of Edging If Required
117	Cost per Mile for One Time Clean-up and Edging (See Note 4)	1 Mile	5'-10'	\$4,800.00		NO BID		\$750.00		\$350.00		\$250.00		\$500.00	
118	Type of growth regulator			RANGER		T-NEX Plant Growth Regulator for Turf Growth Management		PALISADE EC - PRIMOMAXX		T-NEX OR PODIUM		T-NEX (QUALI-PRO) & TRIMMEC 992		PANORAMIC, ETIHEPHON 2SL	
119	Please indicate number of crews available for this contract. (Minimum crew personnel requirement: 4-5.)			5 CREWS		15		5 CREWS		2 - FOUR PERSON CREWS		4 INDIVIDUAL CREWS OF 4 - 5 PERSONNEL ON EACH TRUCK		3 X 4 OR 5	
Mathematical error with Let Us Love Your Lawn. Error with Cost Per Cycle Grand Total Group (I-V), submitted \$1,471,600.00. Error with Edging Grand Total (I-V), submitted \$370,900.00.															
Mathematical error with Flex Landscaping. Error with Cost Per Cycle Grand Total Group (I-V), submitted \$164,657.80. Flex Landscaping acknowledged the error and have agreed to honor the correct amount.															
Mathematical error with ProCutters. Error with Cost Per Cycle Grand Total Group (I-V), submitted \$187,737.50. Error with Edging Grand Total (I-V), submitted \$31,463.50. ProCutters have acknowledged the error and have agreed to honor the correct amount.															
Mathematical error with Worldsapes, LLC. Error with Cost Per Cycle Grand Total Group (I-V), submitted \$12,575.00. Error with Edging Grand Total (I-V), submitted \$11,840.00															
Mathematical error with Executive Realty Solutions with Cost Per Cycle Grand Total Group (I-V), submitted \$120,798.00. Executive Realty Solutions acknowledged the error and have agreed to honor the correct amount.															
Mathematical error with Absolute Quality Services. Error with Cost Per Cycle Grand Total Group (I-V), submitted \$72,156.23. Error with Edging Grand Total (I-V), submitted \$22,197.00. Absolute Quality Services acknowledged the error and have agreed to honor the correct amount.															
Number of Bids Received:		7 (1-Non-Responsive)													
LSBE Participation/Benchmark GFE				100%		20%		20%		20%		95%		20%	
Attendance at the Non-Mandatory Pre-Bid Conference? (Yes or No)				Yes		No		Yes		No		Yes		Yes	
Vendor submitted in cost in separate sealed sealed envelope? (Yes/No)				Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes		Yes	
Vendor included cost in other areas outside of separate sealed envelope? (Yes/No)				No		No		No		No		No		No	
Federal Debarment				No		No		No		No		No		No	
NOTES - DETAIL JUSTIFICATION															
Recommend Award to the lowest, responsive, responsible bidder(s).															

Witness Signature: *Tynia Inu Umoru*

Agent Signature: *Marion Dean*