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ITB No. 18-101022 Bid Opening: 10/22/2018
ITB 
Name:

Right of Way Mowing 
and Lawn Maint. BID TABULATION Price Schedule Opening: 10-30-18
Annual Contract with 2 
Options to Renew Agent: MERENICA BANKS

Pro Cutters Lawnscapes Flex Landscaping ASAP Management Grp. Yellowstone Landscape

Item # Mowing Location

Proximity
Service 

Area 
Length

(in Miles)

Proximity
Service 

Area 
Width

(in Feet)

Cost Per 6 
Wk Cycle 

(mowing & 
herbicide)

Edging As 
Needed Only

Cost Per 6 
Wk Cycle 

(mowing & 
herbicide)

Edging As 
Needed Only

Cost Per 6 Wk 
Cycle (mowing 
& herbicide)

Edging As 
Needed Only

Cost Per 6 
Wk Cycle 

(mowing & 
herbicide)

Edging 
As 

Needed 
Only

Cost Per 6 
Wk Cycle 

(mowing & 
herbicide)

Edging As 
Needed 

Only

Cost Per 6 
Wk Cycle 

(mowing & 
herbicide)

Edging As 
Needed 

Only

Cost Per 6 
Wk Cycle 

(mowing & 
herbicide)

Edging 
As 

Needed 
Only

1

Rockbridge Road, 
includes:
islands and medians, 
cement medians. 12.01 5'-10'  $             6,005.00  $              1,201.00  360.30$                     9,007.50$                  2,101.75$                     6,605.00$             No Bid 14,412.00$            2,402.00$          6,605.50$           1,621.35$          6,720.00$            No Bid

2 Booker Avenue 0.04 5'-10'  $                  20.00  $                      4.00 16.00$                    1.20$                         30.00$                       7.00$                            250.00$                No Bid 280.00$                 100.00$             22.00$                5.40$                  22.80$                 No Bid
3 Kelly Street 0.17 5'-10'  $                  85.00  $                    17.00 68.00$                    5.10$                         127.50$                     29.75$                          250.00$                No Bid 280.00$                 100.00$             93.50$                22.95$               95.00$                 No Bid
4 Proctor Avenue 0.48 5'-10'  $                240.00  $                    48.00 192.00$                  14.40$                       360.00$                     84.00$                          250.00$                No Bid 576.00$                 100.00$             264.00$              64.80$               267.90$               No Bid
5 Rowland Road 2.03 5'-10'  $             1,015.00  $                 203.00 812.00$                  60.90$                       1,522.50$                  355.25$                        1,116.00$             No Bid 2,436.00$              406.00$             1,116.50$           274.05$             1,133.90$            No Bid
6 Allgood Circle 2 5'-10'  $             1,000.00  $                 200.00 800.00$                  60.00$                       1,500.00$                  350.00$                        1,100.00$             No Bid 2,400.00$              400.00$             1,100.00$           270.00$             1,118.90$            No Bid
7 Allgood Road 1.9 5'-10'  $                950.00  $                 190.00 760.00$                  57.00$                       1,425.00$                  332.50$                        1,100.00$             No Bid 2,280.00$              380.00$             1,045.00$           256.50$             1,060.00$            No Bid
8 Elam Road 0.9 5'-10'  $                450.00  $                    90.00 360.00$                  27.00$                       675.00$                     157.50$                        550.00$                No Bid 1,080.00$              180.00$             495.00$              121.50$             502.00$               No Bid
9 Ellis Road 0.64 5'-10'  $                320.00  $                    64.00 256.00$                  19.20$                       480.00$                     112.00$                        352.00$                No Bid 768.00$                 128.00$             352.00$              86.40$               356.90$               No Bid
10 Sheppard Road 1 5'-10'  $                500.00  $                 100.00 400.00$                  30.00$                       750.00$                     175.00$                        550.00$                No Bid 1,200.00$              200.00$             550.00$              135.00$             555.85$               No Bid

11

Hambrick Road, includes:
islands and medians
(See Note 5) 3.82 5'-10'  $             1,910.00  $                 382.00 1,528.00$               114.60$                     2,865.00$                  668.50$                        2,200.00$             No Bid 4,584.00$              764.00$             2,101.00$           515.70$             2,137.80$            No Bid

12 Rays Road 4.52 5'-10'  $             2,260.00  $                 452.00 1,808.00$               135.60$                     3,390.00$                  791.00$                        2,486.00$             No Bid 5,424.00$              904.00$             2,486.00$           610.20$             2,530.65$            No Bid
13 Alford Road 1.63 5'-10'  $                815.00  $                 163.00 652.00$                  48.90$                       1,222.50$                  285.25$                        896.00$                No Bid 1,956.00$              326.00$             896.50$              220.05$             910.00$               No Bid

14
Stephenson Road
(See Note 5) 9.44 5'-10'  $             4,720.00  $                 944.00 3,776.00$               283.20$                     10,384.00$                1,652.00$                     5,192.00$             No Bid 11,328.00$            1,888.00$          5,192.00$           1,274.40$          5,280.90$            No Bid

15
S. Deshon Road (See Note 
5) 6.4 5'-10'  $             3,200.00  $                 640.00 2,560.00$               192.00$                     7,040.00$                  1,120.00$                     352.00$                No Bid 7,680.00$              1,280.00$          3,520.00$           864.00$             3,582.75$            No Bid

16 N. Deshon Road 1.5 5'-10'  $                750.00  $                 150.00 600.00$                  45.00$                       1,125.00$                  262.50$                        825.00$                No Bid 1,800.00$              300.00$             825.00$              202.50$             830.00$               No Bid
17 Bermuda Road 3.38 5'-10'  $             1,690.00  $                 338.00 1,352.00$               101.40$                     2,535.00$                  591.50$                        1,859.00$             No Bid 4,056.00$              676.00$             1,859.00$           456.30$             1,890.75$            No Bid
18 Pleasant Hill Road 5.7 5'-10'  $             2,850.00  $                 570.00 2,280.00$               171.00$                     4,275.00$                  997.50$                        3,135.00$             No Bid 6,840.00$              1,140.00$          3,135.00$           769.50$             3,190.00$            No Bid

19
Rogers Lake Road
(See Note 5) 2.3 5'-10'  $             1,150.00  $                 230.00 920.00$                  69.00$                       2,530.00$                  402.50$                        1,265.00$             No Bid 2,760.00$              460.00$             1,265.00$           310.50$             1,250.00$            No Bid

20 Asbury Drive 1.44 5'-10'  $                720.00  $                 144.00 576.00$                  43.20$                       1,080.00$                  252.00$                        792.00$                No Bid 1,728.00$              288.00$             792.00$              194.40$             800.00$               No Bid
21 Union Grove Road 2.04 5'-10'  $             1,020.00  $                 204.00 816.00$                  61.20$                       1,530.00$                  357.00$                        1,122.00$             No Bid 2,448.00$              408.00$             1,122.00$           275.40$             1,135.75$            No Bid
22 Norris Lake Road 1.3 5'-10'  $                650.00  $                 130.00 520.00$                  39.00$                       975.00$                     227.50$                        715.00$                No Bid 1,560.00$              260.00$             715.00$              175.50$             720.50$               No Bid
23 Norris Lake Drive 0.74 5'-10'  $                370.00  $                    74.00 296.00$                  22.20$                       555.00$                     129.50$                        550.00$                No Bid 888.00$                 148.00$             407.00$              99.90$               410.50$               No Bid
24 Smith James Road 0.5 5'-10'  $                250.00  $                    50.00 200.00$                  15.00$                       375.00$                     87.50$                          250.00$                No Bid 600.00$                 100.00$             275.00$              67.50$               275.90$               No Bid
25 Giles Road 1.34 5'-10'  $                670.00  $                 134.00 536.00$                  40.20$                       1,005.00$                  234.50$                        737.00$                No Bid 1,608.00$              268.00$             737.00$              180.90$             735.00$               No Bid

26
S. Stone Mtn. Lithonia 
Road 12.7 5'-20'  $             6,350.00  $              1,270.00 5,080.00$               381.00$                     12,065.00$                2,222.50$                     6,985.00$             No Bid 15,240.00$            2,540.00$          6,985.00$           1,714.50$          7,110.50$            No Bid

27
N. Stone Mtn. Lithonia 
Road 6.3 5'-10'  $             3,150.00  $                 630.00 2,520.00$               189.00$                     4,725.00$                  1,102.50$                     3,465.00$             No Bid 7,560.00$              1,260.00$          3,465.00$           850.50$             3,525.00$            No Bid

28 King Road 1.57 5'-10'  $                785.00  $                 157.00 628.00$                  47.10$                       1,177.50$                  274.75$                        863.00$                No Bid 1,884.00$              314.00$             863.50$              211.95$             875.00$               No Bid
29 Sheppard Place 0.45 5'-10'  $                225.00  $                    45.00 180.00$                  13.50$                       337.50$                     78.75$                          250.00$                No Bid 540.00$                 100.00$             247.50$              60.75$               250.00$               No Bid
30 Redan Road 6.13 5'-20'  $             3,065.00  $                 613.00 2,452.00$               183.90$                     5,823.50$                  1,072.75$                     3,371.00$             No Bid 7,356.00$              1,226.00$          3,371.50$           827.55$             3,400.00$            No Bid
31 Miller Grove Lane 0.34 5'-10'  $                170.00  $                    34.00 136.00$                  10.20$                       255.00$                     59.50$                          250.00$                No Bid 408.00$                 100.00$             187.00$              45.90$               185.60$               No Bid

47,355.00$       $              9,471.00 33,080.00$            2,841.30$                  81,147.50$                16,574.25$                   49,683.00$           -$           113,960.00$          19,146.00$        52,090.50$         12,785.85$        52,859.85$          -$            

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING AND CONTRACTING

TOTAL (GROUP I: #1-31)

NGL Erosion Control Grp.Executive Realty Sol. K2R Legacy Group, LLC
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32 McDaniel Street 0.54 5'-10'  $                283.50  $                    54.00 216.00$                  16.20$                       405.00$                     94.50$                          297.00$                No Bid 648.00$                 108.00$             297.00$              72.90$               300.00$               No Bid
33 Conyers Street 0.86 5'-10'  $                451.50  $                    86.00 344.00$                  25.80$                       645.00$                     150.50$                        473.00$                No Bid 1,032.00$              172.00$             473.00$              116.10$             480.00$               No Bid
34 Rhodes Street 0.11 5'-10'  $                  57.75  $                    11.00 44.00$                    3.30$                         82.50$                       19.25$                          250.00$                No Bid 280.00$                 100.00$             60.50$                14.85$               60.00$                 No Bid
35 Maddox Road 4 5'-10'  $             2,100.00  $                 400.00 1,600.00$               120.00$                     3,000.00$                  700.00$                        2,200.00$             No Bid 4,800.00$              800.00$             2,200.00$           540.00$             2,235.00$            No Bid
36 Silver Hill Road 2.77 5'-10'  $             1,454.25  $                 277.00 1,108.00$               83.10$                       2,077.50$                  484.75$                        1,573.00$             No Bid 3,324.00$              554.00$             1,523.50$           373.95$             1,550.00$            No Bid
37 Lilburn S. Mtn Road 2.7 5'-10'  $             1,417.50  $                 270.00 1,080.00$               81.00$                       2,025.00$                  472.50$                        1,485.00$             No Bid 3,240.00$              540.00$             1,485.00$           364.50$             1,530.50$            No Bid

38
Mountain View 
Connector 0.42 5'-10'  $             2,205.00  $                    42.00 168.00$                  12.60$                       315.00$                     73.50$                          250.00$                No Bid 504.00$                 100.00$             231.00$              56.70$               425.75$               No Bid
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ITB No. 18-101022 Bid Opening: 10/22/2018
ITB 
Name:

Right of Way Mowing 
and Lawn Maint. BID TABULATION Price Schedule Opening: 10-30-18
Annual Contract with 2 
Options to Renew Agent: MERENICA BANKS

Pro Cutters Lawnscapes Flex Landscaping ASAP Management Grp. Yellowstone Landscape

Item # Mowing Location

Proximity
Service 

Area 
Length

(in Miles)

Proximity
Service 

Area 
Width

(in Feet)

Cost Per 6 
Wk Cycle 

(mowing & 
herbicide)

Edging As 
Needed Only

Cost Per 6 
Wk Cycle 

(mowing & 
herbicide)

Edging As 
Needed Only

Cost Per 6 Wk 
Cycle (mowing 
& herbicide)

Edging As 
Needed Only

Cost Per 6 
Wk Cycle 

(mowing & 
herbicide)

Edging 
As 

Needed 
Only

Cost Per 6 
Wk Cycle 

(mowing & 
herbicide)

Edging As 
Needed 

Only

Cost Per 6 
Wk Cycle 

(mowing & 
herbicide)

Edging As 
Needed 

Only

Cost Per 6 
Wk Cycle 

(mowing & 
herbicide)

Edging 
As 

Needed 
Only

39 Central Drive 2.59 5'-10'  $             1,359.75  $                 259.00 1,036.00$               77.70$                       1,942.50$                  453.25$                        1,424.00$             No Bid 3,108.00$              518.00$             1,424.50$           349.65$             1,410.50$            No Bid

40
Brer Rabbit Road
(See Note 5) 1.46 5'-10'  $                766.50  $                 146.00 584.00$                  43.80$                       1,606.00$                  255.50$                        803.00$                No Bid 1,752.00$              292.00$             803.00$              197.10$             810.50$               No Bid

41 Kensington Road 5.2 5'-10'  $             2,730.00  $                 520.00 2,080.00$               156.00$                     3,900.00$                  910.00$                        2,860.00$             No Bid 6,240.00$              1,040.00$          2,860.00$           702.00$             2,885.00$            No Bid
42 Porter Road 1.34 5'-10'  $                703.50  $                 134.00 536.00$                  40.20$                       1,005.00$                  234.50$                        737.00$                No Bid 1,608.00$              268.00$             737.00$              180.90$             745.60$               No Bid
43 Durham Parkway 0.64 5'-10'  $                336.00  $                    64.00 256.00$                  19.20$                       480.00$                     112.00$                        352.00$                No Bid 768.00$                 128.00$             352.00$              86.40$               355.00$               No Bid
44 George Luther Drive 1 5'-10'  $                525.00  $                 100.00 400.00$                  30.00$                       750.00$                     175.00$                        550.00$                No Bid 1,200.00$              200.00$             550.00$              135.00$             555.75$               No Bid

45 Memorial College  Avenue 0.92 5'-10'  $                483.00  $                    92.00 368.00$                  27.60$                       690.00$                     161.00$                        550.00$                No Bid 1,104.00$              184.00$             506.00$              124.20$             510.00$               No Bid
46 Norman Road 0.65 5'-10'  $                341.25  $                    65.00 260.00$                  19.50$                       487.50$                     113.75$                        357.00$                No Bid 780.00$                 130.00$             357.50$              87.75$               360.00$               No Bid

47 North Indian Creek Drive 1.7 5'-10'     $                 170.00 680.00$                  51.00$                       1,275.00$                  297.50$                        935.00$                No Bid 2,040.00$              340.00$             935.00$              229.50$             950.00$               No Bid
48 Snapfinger Road 3.22 5'-10'  $             1,690.50  $                 322.00 1,288.00$               96.60$                       2,415.00$                  563.50$                        1,771.00$             No Bid 3,864.00$              644.00$             1,771.00$           434.70$             1,800.00$            No Bid
49 Amsler Road 1.45 5'-10'  $                761.25  $                 145.00 580.00$                  43.50$                       1,087.50$                  253.75$                        797.00$                No Bid 1,740.00$              290.00$             797.50$              195.75$             810.00$               No Bid
50 Shadow Rock Drive 3.37 5'-10'  $             1,769.25  $                 337.00 1,348.00$               101.10$                     2,527.50$                  589.75$                        1,853.00$             No Bid 4,044.00$              674.00$             1,853.50$           454.95$             1,885.60$            No Bid
51 Stewart Mill Road 0.75 5'-10'  $                393.75  $                    75.00 300.00$                  22.50$                       562.50$                     131.25$                        550.00$                No Bid 900.00$                 150.00$             412.50$              101.25$             410.00$               No Bid
52 Swift Street 1.14 5'-10'  $                598.50  $                 114.00 456.00$                  34.20$                       855.00$                     199.50$                        627.00$                No Bid 1,368.00$              228.00$             627.00$              153.90$             635.00$               No Bid
53 Railroad Avenue 1.36 5'-10'  $                714.00  $                 136.00 544.00$                  40.80$                       1,020.00$                  238.00$                        748.00$                No Bid 1,632.00$              272.00$             748.00$              183.60$             760.00$               No Bid

54
Briarcliff Road (See Note 
5) 8.54 5'-10'  $             4,483.50  $                 854.00 3,416.00$               256.20$                     9,394.00$                  1,494.50$                     4,697.00$             No Bid 10,248.00$            1,708.00$          4,697.00$           1,152.90$          4,781.00$            No Bid

55 Briarcliff Way 0.31 5'-10'  $                162.75  $                    31.00 124.00$                  9.30$                         232.50$                     54.25$                          250.00$                No Bid 372.00$                 100.00$             170.50$              41.85$               172.00$               No Bid
56 Briarwood Road 1.18 5'-10'  $                619.50  $                 118.00 472.00$                  35.40$                       885.00$                     206.50$                        649.00$                No Bid 1,416.00$              236.00$             649.00$              159.30$             659.00$               No Bid
57 Biltmore Drive 1.4 5'-10'  $                735.00  $                 140.00 560.00$                  42.00$                       1,050.00$                  245.00$                        770.00$                No Bid 1,680.00$              280.00$             770.00$              189.00$             780.00$               No Bid  

58 Mercer University Drive 1.45 5'-10'  $                761.25  $                 145.00 580.00$                  43.50$                       1,087.00$                  253.75$                        797.00$                No Bid 1,740.00$              290.00$             797.50$              195.75$             810.00$               No Bid
 $           27,903.75  $              5,107.00 20,428.00$            1,532.10$                  41,802.00$                52,332.25$                   28,605.00$           -$           61,432.00$            10,346.00$        28,088.50$         6,894.45$          28,666.20$          -$            

59 Marjan Drive 0.31 5'-10'  $                170.50  $                    31.00 124.00$                  9.30$                         232.50$                     54.25$                          250.00$                No Bid 372.00$                 100.00$             170.50$              41.85$               1,735.00$            No Bid
60 Northlake Parkway 2.64 5'-10'  $             1,452.00  $                 264.00 1,056.00$               79.20$                       1,980.00$                  462.00$                        1,452.00$             No Bid 3,168.00$              528.00$             1,452.00$           356.40$             1,477.90$            No Bid
61 Northcrest Road 1.21 5'-10'  $                665.50  $                 121.00 484.00$                  36.30$                       907.50$                     211.75$                        665.00$                No Bid 1,452.00$              242.00$             665.50$              163.35$             800.00$               No Bid
62 Pleasantdale Road 5.61 5'-10'  $             3,085.50  $                 561.00 2,244.00$               168.30$                     4,207.50$                  981.75$                        3,085.00$             No Bid 6,732.00$              1,122.00$          3,085.50$           757.35$             3,584.00$            No Bid
63 Presidential Parkway 2.16 5'-10'  $             1,188.00  $                 216.00 864.00$                  64.80$                       1,620.00$                  378.00$                        1,188.00$             No Bid 2,592.00$              432.00$             1,188.00$           291.60$             1,300.00$            No Bid
64 Pangborn Road 2.55 5'-10'  $             1,402.50  $                 255.00 1,020.00$               76.50$                       1,912.50$                  446.25$                        1,402.00$             No Bid 3,060.00$              510.00$             1,402.50$           344.25$             1,460.00$            No Bid

65
Montreal Road
(See Note 5) 6.16 5'-10'  $             3,388.00  $                 616.00 2,464.00$               184.80$                     4,620.00$                  1,078.00$                     3,388.00$             No Bid 7,392.00$              1,232.00$          3,388.00$           831.60$             3,900.00$            No Bid

66 Montreal Circle 0.63 5'-10'  $                346.50  $                    63.00 252.00$                  18.90$                       472.50$                     110.25$                        346.00$                No Bid 756.00$                 126.00$             346.50$              85.05$               390.00$               No Bid

67

North Druid Hills Road. 
Note:  The parameter of 
North Druid Hills is from 
Valley Brook to I-85 
bridge ONLY.
(See Note 5) 7.47 5'-10'  $             4,108.50  $                 747.00 2,988.00$               224.10$                     8,217.00$                  1,307.25$                     4,108.00$             No Bid 8,964.00$              1,494.00$          4,108.50$           1,008.45$          4,800.00$            No Bid

68

Valley Brook Road, 
includes: 
islands and medians 2.9 5'-10'  $             1,595.00  $                 290.00 1,160.00$               87.00$                       2,175.00$                  507.50$                        1,595.00$             No Bid 3,480.00$              580.00$             1,595.00$           391.50$             1,800.00$            No Bid

69 DeKalb Ind. Way 2.31 5'-10'  $             1,270.00  $                 231.00 924.00$                  69.30$                       1,732.50$                  404.25$                        1,270.00$             No Bid 2,772.00$              462.00$             1,270.50$           311.85$             1,750.00$            No Bid

70 Winn Way 0.71 5'-10'  $                390.50  $                    71.00 284.00$                  21.30$                       532.50$                     124.25$                        550.00$                No Bid 852.00$                 142.00$             390.50$              95.85$               700.00$               No Bid

TOTAL (GROUP II: #32-58)

K2R Legacy Group, LLC

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING AND CONTRACTING

Executive Realty Sol. NGL Erosion Control Grp.
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71

North Arcadia Ave.:  
County
owned plot is located at 
the corner of Springdale 
St. and N. Arcadia Ave. 
contractor can mow 
further into this lot to 
ensure it is kept in good 
order. 0.5 5'-10'  $                275.00  $                    50.00 200.00$                  15.00$                       375.00$                     87.50$                          250.00$                No Bid 600.00$                 100.00$             275.00$              67.50$               400.00$               No Bid
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ITB No. 18-101022 Bid Opening: 10/22/2018
ITB 
Name:

Right of Way Mowing 
and Lawn Maint. BID TABULATION Price Schedule Opening: 10-30-18
Annual Contract with 2 
Options to Renew Agent: MERENICA BANKS

Pro Cutters Lawnscapes Flex Landscaping ASAP Management Grp. Yellowstone Landscape

Item # Mowing Location

Proximity
Service 

Area 
Length

(in Miles)

Proximity
Service 

Area 
Width

(in Feet)

Cost Per 6 
Wk Cycle 

(mowing & 
herbicide)

Edging As 
Needed Only

Cost Per 6 
Wk Cycle 

(mowing & 
herbicide)

Edging As 
Needed Only

Cost Per 6 Wk 
Cycle (mowing 
& herbicide)

Edging As 
Needed Only

Cost Per 6 
Wk Cycle 

(mowing & 
herbicide)

Edging 
As 

Needed 
Only

Cost Per 6 
Wk Cycle 

(mowing & 
herbicide)

Edging As 
Needed 

Only

Cost Per 6 
Wk Cycle 

(mowing & 
herbicide)

Edging As 
Needed 

Only

Cost Per 6 
Wk Cycle 

(mowing & 
herbicide)

Edging 
As 

Needed 
Only

76 Bancroft Circle 0.32 5'-10'  $                176.00  $                    32.00 128.00$                  9.60$                         240.00$                     56.00$                          250.00$                No Bid 384.00$                 100.00$             176.00$              43.20$               350.00$               No Bid
77 Fellowship Road 2 5'-10'  $             1,100.00  $                 200.00 800.00$                  60.00$                       1,500.00$                  350.00$                        1,100.00$             No Bid 2,400.00$              400.00$             1,100.00$           270.00$             1,200.00$            No Bid
78 McLendon Drive 0.91 5'-10'  $                500.50  $                    91.00 364.00$                  27.30$                       682.50$                     159.25$                        550.00$                No Bid 1,092.00$              182.00$             500.50$              122.85$             575.00$               No Bid
79 Juliette Road 1.26 5'-10'  $                693.00  $                 126.00 504.00$                  37.80$                       945.00$                     220.50$                        693.00$                No Bid 1,512.00$              252.00$             693.00$              170.10$             750.00$               No Bid

80
East Ponce de Leon 
Avenue 7.1 5'-20'  $             3,850.00  $                 710.00 2,840.00$               213.00$                     6,745.00$                  1,242.50$                     3,905.00$             No Bid 8,520.00$              1,420.00$          3,905.00$           958.50$             4,500.00$            No Bid

81 Idlewood Road 4.31 5'-10'  $             2,370.50  $                 431.00 1,724.00$               129.30$                     3,232.50$                  754.25$                        2,370.00$             No Bid 5,172.00$              862.00$             2,370.50$           581.85$             2,280.00$            No Bid

82 Sarr Parkway (See Note 5) 1.62 5'-10'  $                891.00  $                 162.00 648.00$                  48.60$                       1,782.00$                  283.50$                        891.00$                No Bid 1,944.00$              324.00$             891.00$              218.70$             1,000.00$            No Bid
83 Roadhaven Drive 1.34 5'-10'  $                737.00  $                 134.00 536.00$                  40.20$                       1,005.00$                  234.50$                        737.00$                No Bid 1,608.00$              268.00$             737.00$              180.90$             1,600.00$            No Bid
84 Belvedere Lane 0.77 5'-10'  $                423.50  $                    77.00 308.00$                  23.10$                       577.50$                     134.75$                        550.00$                No Bid 924.00$                 154.00$             423.50$              103.95$             750.00$               No Bid

85
Bouldercrest Road
(See Note 5) 8.04 5'-10'  $             4,422.00  $                 804.00 3,216.00$               241.20$                     8,844.00$                  1,407.00$                     4,422.00$             No Bid 9,648.00$              1,608.00$          4,422.00$           1,085.00$          4,690.00$            No Bid

 $           34,501.00  $              6,283.00 30,208.00$            2,265.60$                  54,538.00$                54,390.25$                   35,017.00$           -$           75,396.00$            12,640.00$        34,556.50$         8,481.65$          41,791.90$          -$            
86 Cedar Grove Road 2 5'-10'  $                890.00  $                      2.00 800.00$                  60.00$                       1,500.00$                  350.00$                        1,100.00$             No Bid 2,400.00$              400.00$             1,400.00$           310.00$             1,300.00$            No Bid

87
Constitution Road
(See Note 5) 3.35 5'-10'  $             1,490.75  $                 335.00 1,340.00$               100.50$                     3,685.00$                  586.25$                        1,842.00$             No Bid 4,020.00$              670.00$             2,345.00$           519.25$             1,895.00$            No Bid

88
Fayetteville Road
(See Note 5) 3.7 5'-10'  $             1,646.50  $                 370.00 1,480.00$               111.00$                     4,070.00$                  647.50$                        2,035.00$             No Bid 4,440.00$              740.00$             2,590.00$           573.50$             2,500.00$            No Bid

89 Key Road (See Note 5) 1.79 5'-10'  $                796.55  $                 179.00 716.00$                  53.70$                       1,969.00$                  313.25$                        984.00$                No Bid 2,148.00$              358.00$             1,253.00$           277.45$             1,500.00$            No Bid
90 East Conley Road 1.45 5'-10'  $                645.25  $                 145.00 580.00$                  43.50$                       1,087.50$                  253.75$                        797.00$                No Bid 1,740.00$              290.00$             1,015.00$           224.75$             900.00$               No Bid
91 Conley Road 1.51 5'-10'  $                671.95  $                 151.00 604.00$                  45.30$                       1,132.50$                  264.25$                        830.00$                No Bid 1,812.00$              302.00$             1,057.00$           234.05$             1,000.00$            No Bid
92 Moore Road 1.76 5'-10'  $                783.20  $                 176.00 704.00$                  52.80$                       1,320.00$                  308.00$                        968.00$                No Bid 2,112.00$              352.00$             1,232.00$           272.80$             1,200.00$            No Bid
93 Henrico Road 3.7 5'-10'  $             1,646.50  $                 370.00 1,480.00$               111.00$                     2,775.00$                  647.50$                        2,035.00$             No Bid 4,440.00$              740.00$             2,590.00$           573.50$             2,500.00$            No Bid
94 West Side Place 0.15 5'-10'  $                  66.75  $                    15.00 60.00$                    4.50$                         112.50$                     26.25$                          250.00$                No Bid 280.00$                 100.00$             105.00$              23.25$               350.00$               No Bid
95 Koppers Road 0.29 5'-10'  $                129.05  $                    29.00 116.00$                  8.70$                         217.50$                     50.75$                          250.00$                No Bid 348.00$                 100.00$             203.00$              44.95$               385.00$               No Bid
96 Oakvale Road 0.68 5'-10'  $                302.60  $                    68.00 272.00$                  20.40$                       510.00$                     119.00$                        374.00$                No Bid 816.00$                 136.00$             476.00$              105.40$             400.00$               No Bid

97
Panthersville Road
(See Note 5) 3.73 5'-10'  $             1,659.85  $                 373.00 1,492.00$               111.90$                     4,103.00$                  652.75$                        2,051.00$             No Bid 4,476.00$              746.00$             2,611.00$           578.15$             2,300.00$            No Bid

98 River Road (See Note 5) 10.78 5'-10'  $             4,797.10  $              1,078.00 4,312.00$               323.40$                     11,585.00$                1,886.50$                     5,929.00$             No Bid 12,936.00$            2,156.00$          7,546.00$           1,670.90$          6,800.00$            No Bid

99 Linecrest Road 3.62 5'-10'  $             1,610.90  $                 362.00 1,448.00$               108.60$                     2,715.00$                  633.50$                        1,991.00$             No Bid 4,344.00$              724.00$             2,534.00$           561.10$             2,300.00$            No Bid
100 Ward Lake Road 1.83 5'-10'  $                814.35  $                 183.00 732.00$                  84.90$                       1,372.50$                  320.25$                        1,006.00$             No Bid 2,196.00$              366.00$             1,281.00$           283.65$             1,300.00$            No Bid
101 Waldrop Road 1.33 5'-10'  $                591.85  $                 133.00 532.00$                  39.90$                       997.50$                     232.75$                        731.00$                No Bid 1,596.00$              266.00$             931.00$              206.15$             1,000.00$            No Bid
102 Lombard Road 2.9 5'-10'  $             1,290.50  $                 290.00 1,160.00$               87.00$                       2,175.00$                  507.50$                        1,595.00$             No Bid 3,480.00$              580.00$             2,030.00$           449.50$             1,500.00$            No Bid
103 Mosley Road 0.26 5'-10'  $                115.70  $                    26.00 104.00$                  7.80$                         195.00$                     45.50$                          250.00$                No Bid 312.00$                 100.00$             182.00$              40.30$               450.00$               No Bid

 $           19,949.35  $              4,285.00 $17,932.00 4,150.50$                  41,522.00$                7,845.25$                     25,018.00$           -$           53,896.00$            9,126.00$          31,381.00$         6,948.65$          29,580.00$          -$            
104 Weelaunee Road 1.19 5'-10'  $                714.00  $                 119.00 476.00$                  35.70$                       892.50$                     208.25$                        654.00$                No Bid 1,428.00$              238.00$             654.50$              160.65$             800.00$               No Bid
105 Line Street 0.97 5'-10'  $                582.00  $                    97.00 388.00$                  29.10$                       727.50$                     169.75$                        550.00$                No Bid 1,164.00$              194.00$             533.50$              130.95$             650.00$               No Bid
106 White Oak Drive 1.84 5'-10'  $             1,104.00  $                 184.00 736.00$                  55.20$                       1,380.00$                  322.00$                        1,012.00$             No Bid 2,280.00$              368.00$             1,012.00$           248.40$             1,300.00$            No Bid

107 Midway Road 1.54 5'-10'  $                924.00  $                 154.00 616.00$                  46.20$                       1,155.00$                  269.50$                        847.00$                No Bid 1,848.00$              308.00$             847.00$              207.90$             1,100.00$            No Bid

TOTAL (GROUP III: #59-85)

TOTAL (GROUP IV: #86-103)

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING AND CONTRACTING

K2R Legacy Group, LLCExecutive Realty Sol. NGL Erosion Control Grp.
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ITB No. 18-101022 Bid Opening: 10/22/2018
ITB 
Name:

Right of Way Mowing 
and Lawn Maint. BID TABULATION Price Schedule Opening: 10-30-18
Annual Contract with 2 
Options to Renew Agent: MERENICA BANKS

Pro Cutters Lawnscapes Flex Landscaping ASAP Management Grp. Yellowstone Landscape

Item # Mowing Location

Proximity
Service 

Area 
Length

(in Miles)

Proximity
Service 

Area 
Width

(in Feet)

Cost Per 6 
Wk Cycle 

(mowing & 
herbicide)

Edging As 
Needed Only

Cost Per 6 
Wk Cycle 

(mowing & 
herbicide)

Edging As 
Needed Only

Cost Per 6 Wk 
Cycle (mowing 
& herbicide)

Edging As 
Needed Only

Cost Per 6 
Wk Cycle 

(mowing & 
herbicide)

Edging 
As 

Needed 
Only

Cost Per 6 
Wk Cycle 

(mowing & 
herbicide)

Edging As 
Needed 

Only

Cost Per 6 
Wk Cycle 

(mowing & 
herbicide)

Edging As 
Needed 

Only

Cost Per 6 
Wk Cycle 

(mowing & 
herbicide)

Edging 
As 

Needed 
Only

113 Macedonia Road 0.18 5'-10'  $                108.00  $                    18.00 72.00$                    5.40$                         135.00$                     31.50$                          250.00$                No Bid 280.00$                 100.00$             99.00$                24.30$               350.00$               No Bid
114 Flat Rock Road 0.84 5'-10'  $                504.00  $                    84.00 336.00$                  25.20$                       630.00$                     147.00$                        550.00$                No Bid 1,008.00$              168.00$             462.00$              113.40$             850.00$               No Bid
115 Evans Mill Road 4.76 5'-10'  $             2,856.00  $                 476.00 1,904.00$               142.80$                     3,570.00$                  833.00$                        2,618.00$             No Bid 5,712.00$              952.00$             2,618.00$           642.60$             2,800.00$            No Bid
116 Woodrow Road 0.66 5'-10'  $                396.00  $                    66.00 264.00$                  19.80$                       495.00$                     115.50$                        363.00$                No Bid 792.00$                 132.00$             363.00$              89.10$               650.00$               No Bid
117 Woodrow Drive 1.15 5'-10'  $                690.00  $                 115.00 460.00$                  34.50$                       862.50$                     201.25$                        632.00$                No Bid 1,380.00$              230.00$             632.50$              155.25$             750.00$               No Bid
118 Salem Road 3.16 5'-10'  $             1,896.00  $                 316.00 1,264.00$               94.80$                       2,370.00$                  553.00$                        1,738.00$             No Bid 3,792.00$              632.00$             1,738.00$           426.60$             1,850.00$            No Bid
119 Bramble Vine Circle 0.87 5'-10'  $                522.00  $                    87.00 348.00$                  26.10$                       652.50$                     152.25$                        478.00$                No Bid 1,044.00$              174.00$             487.50$              117.45$             650.00$               No Bid
120 S. Goddard Road 2.5 5'-10'  $             1,500.00  $                 250.00 1,000.00$               75.00$                       1,875.00$                  437.50$                        1,375.00$             No Bid 3,000.00$              500.00$             1,375.00$           337.50$             1,500.00$            No Bid
121 N. Goddard Road 1.82 5'-10'  $             1,092.00  $                 182.00 728.00$                  54.60$                       1,365.00$                  318.50$                        1,001.00$             No Bid 2,184.00$              364.00$             1,001.00$           245.70$             1,100.00$            No Bid

122
Rock Springs Road
(See Note 5) 6.06 5'-10'  $             3,636.00  $                 606.00 2,424.00$               181.80$                     6,666.00$                  1,060.50$                     3,333.00$             No Bid 7,272.00$              1,212.00$          3,333.00$           818.10$             3,432.80$            No Bid

123 Hayden Quarry Road 2.21 5'-10'  $             1,326.00  $                 221.00 884.00$                  66.30$                       1,657.50$                  386.75$                        1,215.00$             No Bid 2,652.00$              442.00$             1,215.50$           298.35$             1,100.00$            No Bid

124
Rockland Road, includes:
traffic roundabout at 5.17 5'-10'  $             3,102.00  $                 517.00 2,068.00$               155.10$                     3,877.50$                  904.75$                        2,843.00$             No Bid 6,204.00$              1,034.00$          2,843.50$           697.95$             3,300.00$            No Bid

125 Ragsdale Road 0.75 5'-10'  $                450.00  $                    75.00 300.00$                  22.50$                       562.50$                     131.50$                        450.00$                No Bid 900.00$                 150.00$             412.50$              101.25$             650.00$               No Bid
126 Plunkett Road 1.13 5'-10'  $                678.00  $                 113.00 452.00$                  33.90$                       847.50$                     197.75$                        621.00$                No Bid 1,356.00$              226.00$             621.50$              152.55$             650.00$               No Bid
127 Panola Ind. Road 6.7 5'-10'  $             4,020.00  $                 670.00 2,680.00$               201.00$                     5,025.00$                  1,172.50$                     3,685.00$             No Bid 8,040.00$              1,340.00$          3,685.00$           904.50$             3,800.00$            No Bid

128

Klondike Road, includes: 
traffic roundabout at 
Klondike and Rockland 
intersect.
(See Note 5) 5.75 5'-10'  $             3,450.00  $                 575.00 2,300.00$               172.50$                     6,325.00$                  1,006.25$                     3,162.00$             No Bid 6,900.00$              1,150.00$          3,162.50$           776.25$             3,500.00$            No Bid

 $           29,550.00  $              4,925.00 19,700.00$            1,477.50$                  41,071.00$                52,014.00$                   27,377.00$           -$           59,236.00$            9,914.00$          27,096.50$         6,648.75$          36,332.80$          -$            

170,977.10$       $        30,071.00 $128,716.00  $             9,683.70     $         274,405.50 56,313.50$               176,432.00$      -$          386,844.00$       $     65,084.00 183,718.00$    44,337.85$     197,620.75$     

129

Cost per Mile to Service 
Mowing on Other County 
Right-of-Way Locations 

1 Mile 5'-10'  $                600.00 250.00$                  750.00$                     550.00$                 1,200.00$               700.00$              875.00$                

130

Cost per Mile to Service 
Edging on Other County 
Right-of-Way Locations 

1 Mile 5'-10'  $                200.00 30.00$                    175.00$                     No Bid  1,200.00$              185.00$              875.00$                

131

Cost per Mile to Apply 
Herbicide on Other 
County Right-of-Way 
Locations 1 Mile 5'-10'  $                500.00 150.00$                  250.00$                     No Bid  1,200.00$              162.50$              875.00$                

132

Cost per Mile for One 
Time Clean-up and 
Edging (See Note 4) 1 Mile 5'-10'  $                200.00 500.00$                    600.00$                        No Bid  1,200.00$              700.00$              875.00$                

 $             1,500.00 930.00$                    1,775.00$                    550.00$                4,800.00$              1,747.50$           3,500.00$            

133 Type of growth regulator Podium (Grass Retard) (ivy) Palisade EC - Primomaxx HY END Glyphosate Pro 41-15 T NEX Scott Weed Regula  

TOTAL Total Price of All Line     $    204,458.10 137,682.00$       332,494.00$          $   176,932.00 456,728.00$    229,803.35$  201,120.75$  

YES YES YES YES YES YES YES

YES YES YES YES YES YES

Southern AG Surfactant

7Number of Bids Received:                

TOTAL (GROUP V: #104-128)

GRAND TOTAL (GROUP I -V)

Have attended all Mandatory Meetings?

LSBE Participation Benchmark/GFE :  Have LSBE Participation or they are a LSBE

K2R Legacy Group, LLC

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING AND CONTRACTING

Executive Realty Sol. NGL Erosion Control Grp.
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