
ITB Number 21-101355
NAME Valve Boxes and Risers

DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING 
PRICE TABULATION

Price  Opening Date: October 26, 2021@10:30 a.m.  
AGENT NAME:  Judi Moore

ITEM 
No. DESCRIPTION

Estimated 
Number of 

Units

Unit of 
Measure Unit Price Total Price Unit Price Total Price

1
Box Section, 18 inches long, Gate Valve Cover Box, three-part per drawing as 
modified by dimensions and minimum specifications. 6,000 Set $51.05 $306,300.00 $56.34 $338,040.00

2
Valve Box, cast iron, two-piece, complete  with covers marked “Water”, slip 
type, 5-1/4 inches diameter, extensions to be not less than 24 inches nor greater 
than 38 inches; Part No. PSVB562SW

2,000 Set No Bid No Bid $125.85 $251,700.00

3
Cover only, for valve boxes described in Item No. 2, 5-1/4 inches diameter; Part 
No. 1VBLIDW 500 Each No Bid No Bid $18.11 $9,055.00

4 Riser, valve box, 1 inch; Part No. 1VBR514G 1,000 Each $16.15 $16,150.00 $11.43 $11,430.00

5 Riser, valve box, 1-1/2 inches; Part No. 1VBR514J 500 Each $21.06 $10,530.00 $17.17 $8,585.00

6 Riser, valve box, 2 inches; Part No. 1VBR514K 500 Each $21.06 $10,530.00 $25.75 $12,875.00

7 Riser, box, valve, 2-1/2 inches, Fig. #6016B; Bingham & Taylor 100 Each $25.27 $2,527.00 $37.44 $3,744.00

8
Riser, valve box, 3 inches - 6 inches;
3” inches- Part No. 1VBR514M 100 Each $27.38 $2,738.00 $74.36 $7,436.00

8-a
Riser, valve box, 3 inches - 6 inches;
4” inches-Part No. 1VBR514P 100 Each $30.89 $3,089.00

Witness Signature: _____________________________

Agent Signature: _______________________________

F.M. Shelton, Inc. provided pricing for both parts listed under Line Item No. 8.  Line Item No. 8a has been added to this bid tabulation as a way to denote the separate pricing.  Ferguson Waterworks did not separate pricing for each item.

GFELSBE-MSALSBE Participation: 
Number of Bid Received    2

Procurement Manager  
Signature:___________________________

Separate Sealed Price Schedule (Yes/No)
Bid pricing in separate sealed envelope
Attendance at the Mandatory LSBE Meeting (Yes or No) No

Yes
Yes

Notes:

FM Shelton, Inc.

TOTAL $351,864.00

Ferguson Waterworks

$642,865.00

Witness Signature: _____________________________

Agent Signature: _______________________________ Purchasing Director Signature:___________________________ BOC Award Approval Date: _____________________________

Judi Moore Digitally signed by Judi Moore 
Date: 2021.10.28 13:41:34 -04'00'

Crystal Creekmore Digitally signed by Crystal Creekmore 
Date: 2021.10.28 13:37:26 -04'00'

https://na2.documents.adobe.com/verifier?tx=CBJCHBCAABAASHRy90EC7S4FcdbK0y_9rwUEU5jzT0L7
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