



ITEM NO.	COMMODITIES OR SERVICES	ESTIMATED NUMBER OF UNITS	Stryker Medical		Municipal Emergency Services (MES)		Georgia Fire & Rescue Supply		Nafeco		Ten-8 Fire and Safety		Thomas J Madden & Associates		Bennett Fire Products Company																
			UNIT PRICE	TOTAL AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL AMOUNT															
1	KEY - RC50-600 - 5" High Pressure LDH 50ft - Green	20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$515.35	\$10,307.00	\$503.50	\$10,070.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid															
2	KEY - DP17-1000 - 1 3/4" Combat Ready Hose 50ft - Blue	100							\$225.57	\$22,557.00	\$214.00	\$21,400.00																			
3	KEY - DP17-100S - 1.78" Combat Sniper Hose 50ft Orange	100							\$192.05	\$19,205.00	\$189.50	\$18,950.00																			
4	MATEX - 2.30" Cobra Combat Fire Hose 50ft - Yellow	75							\$304.60	\$22,845.00	No Bid	No Bid					No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						
5	MATEX - 5" Nitrex/PVC Large Diameter Hose 30ft - Red	75							\$281.26	\$21,094.50																					
6	Alco-Lite - PEL-28 PEL Series Fire Ladder 2 section, 28ft.	10							No Bid	No Bid	\$900.00	\$9,000.00					\$883.00	\$8,830.00	\$1,158.41	\$11,584.10											
7	Duo-Safety - Series 900-A 2-section ladder 24 ft, Special width of 21"	10									\$775.00	\$7,750.00					\$833.00	\$8,330.00	\$996.59	\$9,965.90											
8	ParaTech - 22-796852 - Highway Vehicle Stabilization Kit	3									\$7,900.00	\$23,700.00					No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid											
9	Sterling - KTSEARCH61MSES Searchlite Kit w/ Markers and Bag	10							\$410.23	\$4,102.30	No Bid	No Bid					\$429.00	\$4,290.00	\$366.22	\$3,662.20											
10	Gemtor - 540 Ladder/Escape Belt with 18" long extension	30							\$18.66	\$559.80	\$190.00	\$5,700.00					\$174.11	\$5,223.30	\$16.60	\$498.00											
11	Gemtor - 541NYC Series Fire Service Harness - 541NYCL-0A, 541NYCL-2A, 541NYCL-4A	200							-0A: \$248.78 -2A: \$237.80 -4A: \$248.78	*\$49,756.00 \$47,560.00 *\$49,756.00	\$260.00	\$52,000.00					\$244.19	\$48,838.00	\$231.50	\$46,300.00											
12	Fire Hooks Unlimited - TAL-6 - Talon Hook 6ft	20							\$134.15	\$2,683.00	\$150.00	\$3,000.00					\$142.36	\$2,847.20	\$140.00	\$2,800.00											
13	Fire Hooks Unlimited - HR-2, Hydra Ram II 6" opening	10							\$2,200.00	\$22,000.00	\$2,195.00	\$21,950.00					\$2,229.00	\$22,290.00	\$2,035.00	\$20,350.00											
14	Fire Hooks Unlimited - K970 K12FD Rescue Saw, 14" with saw blades: (1) FANG-14, (1) 12"12Tip, (1) 12"24Tip, (1) 14"30Tip	20									\$2,155.00	\$43,100.00					\$2,047.11	\$40,942.20	\$1,944.72	\$38,894.40											
15	ARE - Deluxe Commercial Unit (DCU) MAX Truck Bed Cover. Crew Cab Long Bed, 26" High, Paint to Match, Interior Door Skins, No Front Window, Double Rear Doors, Full Length Side Doors (Both Sides), No Tool Boxes, Back Up Camera	10							No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid					No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						
16	Fab Fours - CH20-S4960-1 Front Bumper, Black with option M1650-1 Winch Mount.	10																													
17	Warn Industries - 95950 Winch: ZEON® 12-S; Vehicle Mounted; Vehicle Recovery Winch; 12 Volt Electric; 12000 Pound Line Pull Capacity; 80 Foot Spydura Synthetic Rope; Hawse Fairlead; Wired Remote; Convertible Control Pack; Planetary Gear Drive	10																								\$1,298.00	\$12,980.00				
18	EnforcerOne LLC. - ENF-30-SKID: Enforcer 30 gallon portable system skid unit, hose reel w/150 ft of 1/2" hose and nozzle, hoses and regulator set up for 4500 psi scba bottles	10																								\$11,526.00	\$115,260.00				
19	Whelen - BJ2LLLL Liberty 2 WECANX Series LED lightbar	10																													\$1,919.00
20	Blowhard - COMMANDO Battery Powered fan 25 1/4" 34,000 CFM	10							No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid					No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid						
21	Elkhart - 0033XD0F - XD 1.5" with pistol grip w/ auto shut off 1 1/8" discharge	50																								\$361.78	\$18,089.00	\$372.16	\$18,608.00	\$315.00	\$15,750.00
22	Elkhart - 04XD017F-0201020A - Chief Fog Nozzle Tip - RED 175 @ 50	50																								\$368.95	\$18,447.50	\$379.55	\$18,977.50	\$358.00	\$17,900.00



ITEM NO.	COMMODITIES OR SERVICES	ESTIMATED NUMBER OF UNITS	Stryker Medical		Municipal Emergency Services (MES)		Georgia Fire & Rescue Supply		Nafeco		Ten-8 Fire and Safety		Thomas J Madden & Associates		Bennett Fire Products Company	
			UNIT PRICE	TOTAL AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL AMOUNT
23	Stryker - 99577-001957 - LIFEPAK 15 V4 Monitor/Defib - Manual & AED.Trending, Noninvasive Pacing, SpO2, SpCO, NIBP, 12-Lead ECG, EtCO2, BT.	20	\$35,777.72	\$715,554.40	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
24	Stryker - Power Load System (639005550001) with Power-Pro Cot (650605550003)	10	\$45,277.25	\$452,772.50												
25	FERNO - Model 125 Kendrick Extrication Device	10														
26	Laerdal - Suction Unit, LCSU 4 (Laerdal Compact Suction Unit), 800ml w/carry case	10														
27	Pelican - 1550EMS Case, Orange with EMS organizer/djvider	20	\$259.23	\$5,184.60												
28	R&B Fabrications - RB-443 Entry Tool bag RED, NO letters	20														
29	Fire Research Corp - SSA200-A22 Ladder cover, Skullsaver, 22Hx5Wx8D, KEEPBACK	20	\$99.88	\$1,997.60												
30	Council Tool - C60FMS36 - FE6-FG Forcible Entry 6lb Flathead Fire Axe with 36 in Fiberglass Handle	20	\$55.17	\$1,103.40												
31	Council Tool - LW12-52FSS - Fire Rake; 52" Wooden Handle	20	\$45.51	\$910.20												
32	Fire Axe, Inc. - PHA 6lb Pick Head Axe "Seagrave" style with 32" brown fiberglass handle.	30	\$231.71	*6,951.30												
33	Task Force Tips (TFT) - XXC-52-HE - HE Blitzfire Combination Package: bracket & MF & 3 stack - XX111A Monitor, XX-B mount bracket, MF MD17A MAXMATIC, JSS13-CAFS TIP	10														
34	Kocheck - 32K0525-H52 - 3 WAY MANIFOLD 5 STZ X 5 STZ	10	\$1,249.14	\$12,491.40												
35	Bullard - QXTBUNDLE - Bullard QXT Thermal Imager Bundle, comes with truck mounted charger, XT320 UPGRADE to 320x240 and XTRETRACT Lanward	10														
36	Setcom Corp - IM-950 Intercom Mixer, Radio Interface	10														
37	Fire By Trade - Hose Straps 29" (Yellow) and 36" (Green)	100/100														
38	NRS - 45103.01 Standard Rescue Throw Bag - Orange 75' 3/8"	20	\$43.66	\$873.20												
39	WHELEN - LF35 Pioneer Life, Portable Scene Light	20														
40	Sill Tech - ENP5920, 20 Gallon Pop Up Containment Pool	20														
41	Tingley - Model 82330 Hazproof Boot Sizes 10-13	20														
42	Lakeland - Model 42130 ChemMax4 Coverall L-XXL	30														
42b	Milwaukee - 2727-21HD M18 Fuel 16" Chain Saw	20														
43	AMPCO - M51 Hazmat tool Kit - Non Sparking	2														
44	Ziamatic Corp - SAC-44E Folding Wheel Chock	20	\$245.45	\$4,909.00												



ITEM NO.	COMMODITIES OR SERVICES	ESTIMATED NUMBER OF UNITS	Stryker Medical		Municipal Emergency Services (MES)		Georgia Fire & Rescue Supply		Nafeco		Ten-8 Fire and Safety		Thomas J Madden & Associates		Bennett Fire Products Company	
			UNIT PRICE	TOTAL AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL AMOUNT
45	Stearns - 2000004520 - WorkMaster Vest Class III/IV 30"-52"	20	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
46	Smiths Detection - HazMatID Elite, Hand-held FT-IR chemical identifier	1														
47	Honeywell/Rae - W01A-11 AreaRAE Pro, Wireless Area Monitor	1														
48	DJI - Matrice 300 RTK Drone UAV	2														
49	Genesis - ART.109.173.6 S49-SL3 EFORCE	5														
50	Genesis - ART.109.351.0 ALL9-SL3 EFORCE with 365 Blades	5														
51	Genesis - ART.107.841.8 STABFAST ALU DELUXE KIT	5														
52	Agilent - Resolve Handheld Raman System	1														
53	Thermo Scientific - Gemini™ Analyzer	1														
54	CMC - 300430 - PMP Swivel Pulley	6														
55	PMI - RR125BW092UC - 300' 12.5mm Rope	3	\$303.63	\$910.89	\$330.00	\$990.00	\$317.00	\$951.00	\$301.00	\$903.00						

* Mathematical error with MES's TOTAL AMOUNT for line items 11 & 32. MES has acknowledged the error and have agreed to honor the correct prices.
 ** Mathematical error with Nafeco's TOTAL AMOUNT for line item 27. Nafeco has acknowledged the error and have agreed to honor the correct prices.
 *** Mathematical error with Ten-8 Fire and Safety's TOTAL AMOUNT for line items 28. Ten-8 Fire and Safety has acknowledged the error and have agreed to honor the correct prices.

Number of Bids Received: 9 (1 non-responsive; 1 late submittal)																
Vendor Attended Non-Mandatory Pre-Bid Meeting?			Yes	No	No	No	Yes	Yes	Yes							
Vendor submitted cost in separate sealed envelope?			Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes							
Vendor included cost in other areas outside of separate sealed envelope?			No	No	No	No	No	No	Yes							
Federal Disbarment			No	No	No	No	No	No	No							

Witness Signature: _____

Agent Signature: _____