



DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING AND CONTRACTING

BID TABULATION

ITB No.: 21-101466
ITB Name: RENTAL OF VARIOUS HEAVY EQUIPMENT

Bid Opening: February 1, 2022
Price Schedule Opening: February 1, 2022
Agent: Michele L. Smith

COMPANY:		Flint Equipment Co.			H & E Equipment Services, Inc.			Herc Rentals, Inc.			Mashburn Equipment, LLC			Sunbelt Rentals, Inc.			Yancey Bros. Co.		
ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UNIT	AMOUNT	UNIT	AMOUNT	UNIT	AMOUNT	UNIT	AMOUNT	UNIT	AMOUNT	UNIT	AMOUNT	UNIT	AMOUNT	UNIT	AMOUNT		
1	Rental EXCAVATOR, 24, 000 LB – 26,000 LB	Daily	\$ 750.00	Daily	\$ 544.00	Daily	\$ 673.00	Daily	\$ 475.00	Daily	\$ 400.00	Daily	\$ 675.00						
2	Rental EXCAVATOR, 24, 000 LB – 26,000 LB	Weekly	\$ 1,920.00	Weekly	\$ 1,415.00	Weekly	\$ 1,623.00	Weekly	\$ 1,400.00	Weekly	\$ 1,103.00	Weekly	\$ 1,700.00						
3	Rental EXCAVATOR, 24, 000 LB – 26,000 LB	Monthly	\$ 4,920.00	Monthly	\$ 3,800.00	Monthly	\$ 4,400.00	Monthly	\$ 3,800.00	Monthly	\$ 2,656.00	Monthly	\$ 3,950.00						
4	Rental EXCAVATOR, 42, 000 LB – 47,000 LB	Daily	\$ 810.00	Daily	\$ 714.00	Daily	\$ 853.00	Daily	\$ 600.00	Daily	\$ 841.00	Daily	\$ 1,270.00						
5	Rental EXCAVATOR, 42, 000 LB – 47,000 LB	Weekly	\$ 2,075.00	Weekly	\$ 1,675.00	Weekly	\$ 2,063.00	Weekly	\$ 1,750.00	Weekly	\$ 2,273.00	Weekly	\$ 2,900.00						
6	Rental EXCAVATOR, 42, 000 LB – 47,000 LB	Monthly	\$ 3,625.00	Monthly	\$ 4,757.00	Monthly	\$ 5,500.00	Monthly	\$ 5,000.00	Monthly	\$ 5,313.00	Monthly	\$ 5,200.00						
7	Rental EXCAVATOR, 53, 000 LB – 60,000 LB	Daily	\$ 1,370.00	Daily	\$ 969.00	Daily	No bid	Daily	\$ 675.00	Daily	\$ 736.00	Daily	\$ 1,145.00						
8	Rental EXCAVATOR, 53, 000 LB – 60,000 LB	Weekly	\$ 3,500.00	Weekly	\$ 2,400.00	Weekly	No bid	Weekly	\$ 2,000.00	Weekly	\$ 2,327.00	Weekly	\$ 3,410.00						
9	Rental EXCAVATOR, 53, 000 LB – 60,000 LB	Monthly	\$ 8,800.00	Monthly	\$ 5,200.00	Monthly	No bid	Monthly	\$ 5,800.00	Monthly	\$ 6,048.00	Monthly	\$ 7,172.00						
10	Rental EXCAVATOR, 75, 000 LB – 85,000 LB	Daily	\$ 1,580.00	Daily	\$ 2,000.00	Daily	\$ 1,405.00	Daily	\$ 900.00	Daily	\$ 780.00	Daily	\$ 1,510.00						
11	Rental EXCAVATOR, 75, 000 LB – 85,000 LB	Weekly	\$ 4,050.00	Weekly	\$ 3,327.00	Weekly	\$ 3,513.00	Weekly	\$ 2,400.00	Weekly	\$ 2,939.00	Weekly	\$ 4,485.00						
12	Rental EXCAVATOR, 75, 000 LB – 85,000 LB	Monthly	\$ 10,100.00	Monthly	\$ 8,088.00	Monthly	\$ 8,500.00	Monthly	\$ 7,200.00	Monthly	\$ 8,152.00	Monthly	\$ 9,324.00						
13	Rental EXCAVATOR, 95, 000 LB – 115,000 LB	Daily	\$ 1,880.00	Daily	\$ 5,800.00	Daily	No bid	Daily	\$ 1,250.00	Daily	\$ 1,520.00	Daily	\$ 2,100.00						
14	Rental EXCAVATOR, 95, 000 LB – 115,000 LB	Weekly	\$ 4,800.00	Weekly	\$ 5,800.00	Weekly	No bid	Weekly	\$ 3,750.00	Weekly	\$ 3,749.00	Weekly	\$ 6,230.00						
15	Rental EXCAVATOR, 95, 000 LB – 115,000 LB	Monthly	\$ 13,500.00	Monthly	\$ 14,025.00	Monthly	No bid	Monthly	\$ 11,000.00	Monthly	\$ 10,200.00	Monthly	\$ 12,948.00						
16	Rental DOZER; Caterpillar D2	550K Weekly	\$ 1,800.00	Weekly	\$ 2,734.00	Weekly	No bid	Weekly	\$ 1,950.00	Weekly	\$ 1,800.00	Weekly	\$ 2,200.00						
17	Rental DOZER; Caterpillar D6	850L Monthly	\$ 10,750.00	Monthly	\$ 5,468.00	Monthly	No bid	Monthly	\$ 5,800.00	Monthly	\$ 3,825.00	Monthly	\$ 10,336.00						
18	Rental ROLLER, Walk-Behind, Pad Foot w/Remote 33"	Weekly	\$ 790.00	Weekly	\$ 488.00	Weekly	\$ 840.00	Weekly	\$ 700.00	Weekly	\$ 835.00	Weekly	\$ 750.00						
19	Rental ROLLER, Walk-Behind, Pad Foot w/Remote 33"	Monthly	\$ 1,925.00	Monthly	\$ 1,150.00	Monthly	\$ 1,838.00	Monthly	\$ 1,800.00	Monthly	\$ 1,785.00	Monthly	\$ 1,450.00						
20	Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Pad Foot, 5 Ton, 54"	Weekly	\$ 1,125.00	Weekly	\$ 905.00	Weekly	\$ 1,090.00	Weekly	\$ 900.00	Weekly	\$ 1,110.00	Weekly	\$ 1,000.00						
21	Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Pad Foot, 5 Ton, 54"	Monthly	\$ 2,610.00	Monthly	\$ 2,163.00	Monthly	\$ 2,485.00	Monthly	\$ 2,700.00	Monthly	\$ 2,535.00	Monthly	\$ 2,450.00						
22	Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Pad Foot, 8 Ton, 66"	Weekly	\$ 1,400.00	Weekly	\$ 1,015.00	Weekly	\$ 1,340.00	Weekly	\$ 1,000.00	Weekly	\$ 1,175.00	Weekly	\$ 1,525.00						
23	Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Pad Foot, 8 Ton, 66"	Monthly	\$ 2,850.00	Monthly	\$ 2,468.00	Monthly	\$ 2,940.00	Monthly	\$ 3,000.00	Monthly	\$ 2,715.00	Monthly	\$ 3,275.00						
24	Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Pad Foot, 12 Ton, 84"	Weekly	\$ 1,700.00	Weekly	\$ 1,261.00	Weekly	\$ 1,640.00	Weekly	\$ 1,200.00	Weekly	\$ 1,323.00	Weekly	\$ 1,915.00						
25	Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Pad Foot, 12 Ton, 84"	Monthly	\$ 3,750.00	Monthly	\$ 3,000.00	Monthly	\$ 3,900.00	Monthly	\$ 3,500.00	Monthly	\$ 2,869.00	Monthly	\$ 3,976.00						
26	Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Smooth Drum, 5 Ton, 54"	Weekly	\$ 1,125.00	Weekly	\$ 905.00	Weekly	\$ 1,090.00	Weekly	\$ 900.00	Weekly	\$ 1,110.00	Weekly	\$ 900.00						
27	Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Smooth Drum, 5 Ton, 54"	Monthly	\$ 2,610.00	Monthly	\$ 2,163.00	Monthly	\$ 2,485.00	Monthly	\$ 2,700.00	Monthly	\$ 2,535.00	Monthly	\$ 2,300.00						
28	Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Smooth Drum, 8 Ton, 66"	Weekly	\$ 1,400.00	Weekly	\$ 1,015.00	Weekly	\$ 1,340.00	Weekly	\$ 1,000.00	Weekly	\$ 1,175.00	Weekly	\$ 1,400.00						
29	Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Smooth Drum, 8 Ton, 66"	Monthly	\$ 2,850.00	Monthly	\$ 2,468.00	Monthly	\$ 2,940.00	Monthly	\$ 3,000.00	Monthly	\$ 2,715.00	Monthly	\$ 2,999.00						
30	Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Smooth Drum, 12 Ton, 84"	Weekly	\$ 1,700.00	Weekly	\$ 1,261.00	Weekly	\$ 1,640.00	Weekly	\$ 1,200.00	Weekly	\$ 1,323.00	Weekly	\$ 1,870.00						
31	Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Smooth Drum, 12 Ton, 84"	Monthly	\$ 3,750.00	Monthly	\$ 3,000.00	Monthly	\$ 3,900.00	Monthly	\$ 3,500.00	Monthly	\$ 2,869.00	Monthly	\$ 2,884.00						
32	Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Smooth Drum, 1.5 Ton, 36"	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	\$ 600.00	Weekly	No bid	Weekly	N/A	Weekly	N/A	Weekly	\$ 600.00						
33	Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Smooth Drum, 1.5 Ton, 36"	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	\$ 1,400.00	Monthly	No bid	Monthly	N/A	Monthly	N/A	Monthly	\$ 1,300.00						
34	Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Double Drum, Smooth Drum, 2.5 Ton, 43"	Weekly	\$ 885.00	Weekly	\$ 550.00	Weekly	No bid	Weekly	N/A	Weekly	\$ 540.00	Weekly	N/A						
35	Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Double Drum, Smooth Drum, 2.5 Ton, 43"	Monthly	\$ 1,925.00	Monthly	\$ 1,300.00	Monthly	No bid	Monthly	N/A	Monthly	\$ 1,283.00	Monthly	N/A						
36	Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Double Drum, Smooth Drum, 3.5 Ton, 48"	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	\$ 550.00	Weekly	\$ 615.00	Weekly	N/A	Weekly	\$ 725.00	Weekly	\$ 715.00						
37	Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Double Drum, Smooth Drum, 3.5 Ton, 48"	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	\$ 1,350.00	Monthly	\$ 1,575.00	Monthly	N/A	Monthly	\$ 2,215.00	Monthly	\$ 1,800.00						
38	Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Double Drum, Smooth Drum, 12 Ton, 80"	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	No bid	Weekly	N/A	Weekly	N/A	Weekly	\$ 2,285.00						



DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING AND CONTRACTING
BID TABULATION

ITB No.: 21-101466
 ITB Name: RENTAL OF VARIOUS HEAVY EQUIPMENT

Bid Opening: February 1, 2022
 Price Schedule Opening: February 1, 2022
 Agent: Michele L. Smith

COMPANY:		Flint Equipment Co.			H & E Equipment Services, Inc.			Herc Rentals, Inc.			Mashburn Equipment, LLC			Sunbelt Rentals, Inc.			Yancey Bros. Co.		
ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UNIT	AMOUNT	UNIT	AMOUNT	UNIT	AMOUNT	UNIT	AMOUNT	UNIT	AMOUNT	UNIT	AMOUNT	UNIT	AMOUNT	UNIT	AMOUNT		
39	Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Double Drum, Smooth Drum, 12 Ton, 80"	Monthly	\$ -			Monthly	\$ -		No bid		N/A		N/A	Monthly	N/A		Monthly	\$ 4,748.00	
40	Rental, TRACTOR, (Track Type) Caterpillar Model 963C or acceptable equal: (Bidder state the Manufacturer and Model of Equipment)	Weekly	\$ 1,390.00	Rental, TRACTOR, (Track Type) Caterpillar Model 963C or acceptable equal: 755K DEERE (Bidder state the Manufacturer and Model of Equipment)	Weekly	\$ -	Rental, TRACTOR, (Track Type) Caterpillar Model 963C or acceptable equal: (Bidder state the Manufacturer and Model of Equipment)	Weekly	No bid	Rental, TRACTOR, (Track Type) Caterpillar Model 963C or acceptable equal: DEERE 755K (Bidder state the Manufacturer and Model of Equipment)	Weekly	\$ 2,525.00	Rental, TRACTOR, (Track Type) Caterpillar Model 963C or acceptable equal: (Bidder state the Manufacturer and Model of Equipment)	Weekly	N/A	Rental, TRACTOR, (Track Type) Caterpillar Model 963C or acceptable equal: (Bidder state the Manufacturer and Model of Equipment)	Weekly	\$ 4,260.00	
41	Rental ROLLER, CW16 Pneumatic, 9-Wheel, Compaction Width 68"	Weekly	\$ -			Weekly	\$ -		No bid		N/A		N/A	Weekly	N/A		Weekly	\$ 1,470.00	
42	Rental ROLLER, CW16 Pneumatic, 9-Wheel, Compaction Width 68"	Monthly	\$ -			Monthly	\$ -		No bid		N/A		N/A	Monthly	N/A		Monthly	\$ 3,052.00	
43	Rental, TRACTOR, (Track Type) Caterpillar Model 963C or acceptable equal: (Bidder state the Manufacturer and Model of Equipment)	Monthly	\$ 9,095.00	Rental, TRACTOR, (Track Type) Caterpillar Model 963C or acceptable equal: (Bidder state the Manufacturer and Model of Equipment)	Monthly	\$ -	Rental, TRACTOR, (Track Type) Caterpillar Model 963C or acceptable equal: (Bidder state the Manufacturer and Model of Equipment)	Monthly	No bid	Rental, TRACTOR, (Track Type) Caterpillar Model 963C or acceptable equal: (Bidder state the Manufacturer and Model of Equipment)	Monthly	\$ 6,800.00	Rental, TRACTOR, (Track Type) Caterpillar Model 963C or acceptable equal: (Bidder state the Manufacturer and Model of Equipment)	Monthly	N/A	Rental, TRACTOR, (Track Type) Caterpillar Model 963C or acceptable equal: (Bidder state the Manufacturer and Model of Equipment)	Monthly	\$ 8,844.00	
44	Rental, WHEEL LOADER, Caterpillar Model 953G or acceptable equal: (Bidder state the Manufacturer and Model of Equipment)	Weekly	\$ 3,300.00	Rental, WHEEL LOADER, Caterpillar Model 953G or acceptable equal: NOT A WHEEL LOADER 655K DEERE CRAWLER LOADER (Bidder state the Manufacturer and Model of Equipment)	Weekly	\$ 1,720.00	Rental, WHEEL LOADER, Caterpillar Model 953G or acceptable equal: 544 JD / DOOSAN DL250 (Bidder state the Manufacturer and Model of Equipment)	Weekly	\$ 1,962.00	Rental, WHEEL LOADER, Caterpillar Model 953G or acceptable equal: VOLVO L90H (Bidder state the Manufacturer and Model of Equipment)	Weekly	\$ 2,525.00	Rental, WHEEL LOADER, Caterpillar Model 953G or acceptable equal: DEERE 755K (Bidder state the Manufacturer and Model of Equipment)	Weekly	N/A	Rental, WHEEL LOADER, Caterpillar Model 953G or acceptable equal: (Bidder state the Manufacturer and Model of Equipment)	Weekly	\$ 3,670.00	
45	Rental, WHEEL LOADER, Caterpillar Model 953G or acceptable equal: (Bidder state the Manufacturer and Model of Equipment)	Monthly	\$ 8,025.00	Rental, WHEEL LOADER, Caterpillar Model 953G or acceptable equal: NOT A WHEEL LOADER 655K DEERE CRAWLER LOADER (Bidder state the Manufacturer and Model of Equipment)	Monthly	\$ 4,300.00	Rental, WHEEL LOADER, Caterpillar Model 953G or acceptable equal: 544 JD / DOOSAN DL250 (Bidder state the Manufacturer and Model of Equipment)	Monthly	\$ 5,000.00	Rental, WHEEL LOADER, Caterpillar Model 953G or acceptable equal: VOLVO L90H (Bidder state the Manufacturer and Model of Equipment)	Monthly	\$ 6,800.00	Rental, WHEEL LOADER, Caterpillar Model 953G or acceptable equal: DEERE 755K (Bidder state the Manufacturer and Model of Equipment)	Monthly	N/A	Rental, WHEEL LOADER, Caterpillar Model 953G or acceptable equal: (Bidder state the Manufacturer and Model of Equipment)	Monthly	\$ 7,020.00	
46	Rental, TRUCK, Off Road, Dump, Articulating 26 Ton	Daily	\$ 1,460.00		Daily	\$ 2,800.00		Daily	No bid		\$ 950.00		Daily	N/A		Daily	\$ 1,395.00		
47	Rental, TRUCK, Off Road, Dump, Articulating 26 Ton	Weekly	\$ 3,650.00		Weekly	\$ 5,000.00		Weekly	No bid		\$ 2,800.00		Weekly	N/A		Weekly	\$ 4,140.00		
48	Rental, TRUCK, Off Road, Dump, Articulating 26 Ton	Monthly	\$ 11,000.00		Monthly	\$ 11,036.00		Monthly	No bid		\$ 8,400.00		Monthly	N/A		Monthly	\$ 8,596.00		
49	Rental, WHEEL LOADER; Komatsu WA200-7 Wheel Loader DEERE 444	Daily	\$ 700.00		Daily	\$ 688.00		Daily	\$ 672.00		\$ 475.00		Daily	N/A		Daily	\$ 750.00		
50	Rental, WHEEL LOADER; Komatsu WA200-7 Wheel Loader	Weekly	\$ 1,875.00		Weekly	\$ 1,720.00		Weekly	\$ 1,719.00		\$ 1,400.00		Weekly	N/A		Weekly	\$ 1,900.00		
51	Rental, WHEEL LOADER; Komatsu WA200-7 Wheel Loader	Monthly	\$ 4,890.00		Monthly	\$ 4,300.00		Monthly	\$ 4,900.00		\$ 4,000.00		Monthly	N/A		Monthly	\$ 4,499.00		
52	Rental, WHEEL LOADER, 40,000 LB DEERE 644	Daily	\$ 950.00		Daily	\$ 688.00		Daily	\$ 695.00		\$ 650.00		Daily	\$ 500.00		Daily	\$ 1,365.00		
53	Rental, WHEEL LOADER, 40,000 LB	Weekly	\$ 2,550.00		Weekly	\$ 1,720.00		Weekly	\$ 1,962.00		\$ 1,950.00		Weekly	\$ 1,380.00		Weekly	\$ 4,050.00		
54	Rental, WHEEL LOADER, 40,000 LB	Monthly	\$ 8,025.00		Monthly	\$ 4,300.00		Monthly	\$ 5,000.00		\$ 5,800.00		Monthly	\$ 4,075.00		Monthly	\$ 8,336.00		
55	Rental, COMPACT EXCAVATOR, 10' Dig Depth	Weekly	\$ 650.00		Weekly	\$ 558.00		Weekly	\$ 756.00		\$ 850.00		Weekly	\$ 833.00		Weekly	\$ 880.00		
56	Rental, COMPACT EXCAVATOR, 10' Dig Depth	Monthly	\$ 1,800.00		Monthly	\$ 1,300.00		Monthly	\$ 1,625.00		\$ 2,000.00		Monthly	\$ 1,747.00		Monthly	\$ 1,700.00		
57	Rental, COMPACT EXCAVATOR, 11' Dig Depth	Weekly	\$ 805.00		Weekly	\$ 795.00		Weekly	\$ 861.00		\$ 850.00		Weekly	\$ 927.00		Weekly	\$ 900.00		
58	Rental, COMPACT EXCAVATOR, 11' Dig Depth	Monthly	\$ 1,920.00		Monthly	\$ 1,550.00		Monthly	\$ 2,025.00		\$ 2,000.00		Monthly	\$ 2,091.00		Monthly	\$ 1,950.00		
59	Rental, COMPACT EXCAVATOR, 12' Dig Depth	Weekly	\$ 935.00		Weekly	\$ 928.00		Weekly	\$ 975.00		\$ 1,000.00		Weekly	\$ 1,053.00		Weekly	\$ 900.00		
60	Rental, COMPACT EXCAVATOR, 12' Dig Depth	Monthly	\$ 1,980.00		Monthly	\$ 1,856.00		Monthly	\$ 2,405.00		\$ 2,500.00		Monthly	\$ 2,231.00		Monthly	\$ 1,950.00		
61	Rental, COMPACT EXCAVATOR, 14' Dig Depth	Weekly	\$ 1,010.00		Weekly	\$ 1,320.00		Weekly	\$ 1,150.00		\$ 1,250.00		Weekly	\$ 1,400.00		Weekly	\$ 1,400.00		
62	Rental, COMPACT EXCAVATOR, 14' Dig Depth	Monthly	\$ 2,400.00		Monthly	\$ 2,675.00		Monthly	\$ 3,010.00		\$ 3,000.00		Monthly	\$ 2,792.00		Monthly	\$ 3,375.00		
63	Rental, SKID LOADER, Rubber Tire, 1,600 LB	Monthly	\$ 1,685.00		Monthly	\$ 1,600.00		Monthly	\$ 1,275.00		N/A		Monthly	\$ 1,441.00		Monthly	\$ 1,550.00		
64	Rental, SKID LOADER, Rubber Track 1,900 LB	Monthly	\$ 1,900.00		Monthly	\$ 1,808.00		Monthly	\$ 2,050.00		N/A		Monthly	\$ 2,015.00		Monthly	\$ 1,795.00		
65	Rental, SKID LOADER, Rubber Track 2,500 LB	Daily	\$ 290.00		Daily	\$ 488.00		Daily	\$ 340.00		N/A		Daily	\$ 460.00		Daily	\$ 565.00		



DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING AND CONTRACTING
BID TABULATION

ITB No.: 21-101466
 ITB Name: RENTAL OF VARIOUS HEAVY EQUIPMENT

Bid Opening: February 1, 2022
 Price Schedule Opening: February 1, 2022
 Agent: Michele L. Smith

COMPANY:		Flint Equipment Co.			H & E Equipment Services, Inc.			Herc Rentals, Inc.			Mashburn Equipment, LLC			Sunbelt Rentals, Inc.			Yancey Bros. Co.		
ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UNIT	AMOUNT	UNIT	AMOUNT	UNIT	AMOUNT	UNIT	AMOUNT	UNIT	AMOUNT	UNIT	AMOUNT	UNIT	AMOUNT	UNIT	AMOUNT		
66	Rental, SKID LOADER, Rubber Track 2,500 LB	Weekly	\$ 725.00	Weekly	\$ 942.00	Weekly	\$ 850.00	Weekly	\$ 850.00	Weekly	N/A	Weekly	\$ 1,260.00	Weekly	\$ 1,115.00				
67	Rental, SKID LOADER, Rubber Track 2,500 LB	Monthly	\$ 2,025.00	Monthly	\$ 1,989.00	Monthly	\$ 2,200.00	Monthly	\$ 2,200.00	Monthly	N/A	Monthly	\$ 2,330.00	Monthly	\$ 2,400.00				
68	Rental CUTT OFF SAW, 14" with blade	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	\$ 225.00	Weekly	\$ 306.00	Weekly	\$ 306.00	Weekly	N/A	Weekly	\$ 378.00	Weekly	\$ 185.00				
69	Rental CUTT OFF SAW, 14" with blade	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	\$ 485.00	Monthly	\$ 703.00	Monthly	\$ 703.00	Monthly	N/A	Monthly	\$ 765.00	Monthly	\$ 455.00				
70	Rental CONCRETE SAW, Walk Behind, 57-60 HP with blade	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	No bid	Weekly	No bid	Weekly	N/A	Weekly	\$ 690.00	Weekly	N/A				
71	Rental CONCRETE SAW, Walk Behind, 57-60 HP with blade	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	No bid	Monthly	No bid	Monthly	N/A	Monthly	\$ 2,080.00	Monthly	N/A				
72	Rental BREAKER, Hydraulic, 2,100 LB	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	\$ 1,000.00	Weekly	\$ 1,755.00	Weekly	\$ 1,755.00	INCLUDING CARRIER	Weekly	\$ 2,600.00	Weekly	\$ 1,863.00	Weekly	\$ 3,040.00			
73	Rental BREAKER, Hydraulic, 2,100 LB	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	\$ 2,545.00	Monthly	\$ 3,825.00	Monthly	\$ 3,825.00	INCLUDING CARRIER	Monthly	\$ 7,000.00	Monthly	\$ 3,604.00	Monthly	\$ 5,760.00			
74	Rental BREAKER, Hydraulic, 3,500 LB	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	\$ 1,250.00	Weekly	\$ 2,295.00	Weekly	\$ 2,295.00	INCLUDING CARRIER	Weekly	\$ 3,000.00	Weekly	\$ 2,057.00	Weekly	\$ 3,040.00			
75	Rental BREAKER, Hydraulic, 3,500 LB	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	\$ 3,144.00	Monthly	\$ 4,930.00	Monthly	\$ 4,930.00	INCLUDING CARRIER	Monthly	\$ 8,100.00	Monthly	\$ 5,376.00	Monthly	\$ 5,760.00			
76	Rental, BREAKER, Hydraulic, 5,000 LB	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	\$ 2,250.00	Weekly	\$ 2,835.00	Weekly	\$ 2,835.00	INCLUDING CARRIER	Weekly	\$ 3,700.00	Weekly	N/A	Weekly	\$ 3,264.00			
77	Rental, BREAKER, Hydraulic, 5,000 LB	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	\$ 3,985.00	Monthly	\$ 6,630.00	Monthly	\$ 6,630.00	INCLUDING CARRIER	Monthly	\$ 9,500.00	Monthly	N/A	Monthly	\$ 5,920.00			
78	Rental SOD Cutter, 18"	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	\$ 304.00	Weekly	\$ 304.00	Weekly	N/A	Weekly	\$ 324.00	Weekly	\$ 144.00				
79	Rental SOD Cutter, 18"	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	\$ 641.00	Monthly	\$ 641.00	Monthly	N/A	Monthly	\$ 714.00	Monthly	\$ 432.00				
80	Rental, SOD Roller, Pull Behind	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	\$ 38.00	Weekly	\$ 38.00	Weekly	N/A	Weekly	N/A	Weekly	N/A				
81	Rental, SOD Roller, Pull Behind	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	\$ 77.00	Monthly	\$ 77.00	Monthly	N/A	Monthly	N/A	Monthly	N/A				
82	Rental, 6" Pump, Trash with 20' Suction and 50' Discharge	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	\$ 1,188.00	Weekly	\$ 875.00	Weekly	\$ 875.00	Weekly	N/A	Weekly	\$ 931.00	Weekly	\$ 700.00				
83	Rental, 6" Pump, Trash with 20' Suction and 50' Discharge	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	\$ 2,646.00	Monthly	\$ 2,015.00	Monthly	\$ 2,015.00	Monthly	N/A	Monthly	\$ 2,268.00	Monthly	\$ 1,650.00				
84	Rental, 8" Pump, Trash, with 20' Suction and 50' Discharge	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	\$ 1,086.00	Weekly	\$ 1,086.00	Weekly	N/A	Weekly	N/A	Weekly	N/A				
85	Rental, 8" Pump, Trash, with 20' Suction and 50' Discharge	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	\$ 2,829.00	Monthly	\$ 2,829.00	Monthly	N/A	Monthly	N/A	Monthly	N/A				
86	Rental, 10" Pump, Trash, with 20' Suction and 50' Discharge	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	No bid	Weekly	No bid	Weekly	N/A	Weekly	\$ 1,619.00	Weekly	N/A				
87	Rental, 10" Pump, Trash, with 20' Suction and 50' Discharge	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	No bid	Monthly	No bid	Monthly	N/A	Monthly	\$ 4,047.00	Monthly	N/A				
88	Rental 12" Pump Trash, with 20' Suction and 50' Discharge	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	\$ 1,767.00	Weekly	\$ 1,767.00	Weekly	N/A	Weekly	\$ 1,706.00	Weekly	N/A				
89	Rental 12" Pump Trash, with 20' Suction and 50' Discharge	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	\$ 4,776.00	Monthly	\$ 4,776.00	Monthly	N/A	Monthly	\$ 4,213.00	Monthly	N/A				
90	Rental, TRENCH BOX, 8' x 10'	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	No bid	Weekly	No bid	Weekly	N/A	Weekly	\$ 419.00	Weekly	\$ 222.00				
91	Rental, TRENCH BOX, 8' x 10'	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	No bid	Monthly	No bid	Monthly	N/A	Monthly	\$ 1,186.00	Monthly	\$ 660.00				
92	Rental, TRENCH BOX, 4' x 10'	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	No bid	Weekly	No bid	Weekly	N/A	Weekly	\$ 238.00	Weekly	N/A				
93	Rental, TRENCH BOX, 4' x 10'	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	No bid	Monthly	No bid	Monthly	N/A	Monthly	\$ 673.00	Monthly	N/A				
94	Rental Walk-Behind Vibratory Trench Roller with Remote Drum width 22"	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	\$ 488.00	Weekly	No bid	Weekly	No bid	Weekly	N/A	Weekly	\$ 835.00	Weekly	N/A				
95	Rental Walk-Behind Vibratory Trench Roller with Remote Drum width 22"	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	\$ 1,150.00	Monthly	No bid	Monthly	No bid	Monthly	N/A	Monthly	\$ 1,875.00	Monthly	N/A				
96	Rental Walk-Behind Vibratory Trench Roller with Remote Drum width 24"	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	\$ 488.00	Weekly	\$ 840.00	Weekly	\$ 840.00	Weekly	N/A	Weekly	\$ 835.00	Weekly	\$ 750.00				
97	Rental Walk-Behind Vibratory Trench Roller with Remote Drum width 24"	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	\$ 1,150.00	Monthly	\$ 1,838.00	Monthly	\$ 1,838.00	Monthly	N/A	Monthly	\$ 1,875.00	Monthly	\$ 1,450.00				
98	Rental Walk Behind Vibratory Trench Roller with Remote Drum width 32"	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	\$ 488.00	Weekly	\$ 840.00	Weekly	\$ 840.00	Weekly	N/A	Weekly	\$ 835.00	Weekly	\$ 750.00				
99	Rental Walk Behind Vibratory Trench Roller with Remote Drum width 32"	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	\$ 1,150.00	Monthly	\$ 1,838.00	Monthly	\$ 1,838.00	Monthly	N/A	Monthly	\$ 1,875.00	Monthly	\$ 1,450.00				
100	Rental Walk-Behind Vibratory Trench Roller with Remote Drum width 33"	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	\$ 488.00	Weekly	\$ 840.00	Weekly	\$ 840.00	Weekly	\$ 700.00	Weekly	\$ 835.00	Weekly	N/A				
101	Rental Walk-Behind Vibratory Trench Roller with Remote Drum width 33"	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	\$ 1,150.00	Monthly	\$ 1,838.00	Monthly	\$ 1,838.00	Monthly	\$ 1,800.00	Monthly	\$ 1,875.00	Monthly	N/A				
102	Rental, Single-Drum Ride-on vibratory Compactor Drum width 54" Smooth	Weekly	\$ 1,125.00	Weekly	\$ 895.00	Weekly	\$ 1,090.00	Weekly	\$ 1,090.00	Weekly	\$ 900.00	Weekly	\$ 1,110.00	Weekly	\$ 900.00				
103	Rental, Single-Drum Ride-on vibratory Compactor Drum width 54" Smooth	Monthly	\$ 2,620.00	Monthly	\$ 2,163.00	Monthly	\$ 2,485.00	Monthly	\$ 2,485.00	Monthly	\$ 2,700.00	Monthly	\$ 2,535.00	Monthly	\$ 2,300.00				



DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING AND CONTRACTING
BID TABULATION

ITB No.: 21-101466
 ITB Name: RENTAL OF VARIOUS HEAVY EQUIPMENT

Bid Opening: February 1, 2022
 Price Schedule Opening: February 1, 2022
 Agent: Michele L. Smith

COMPANY:		Flint Equipment Co.		H & E Equipment Services, Inc.		Herc Rentals, Inc.		Mashburn Equipment, LLC		Sunbelt Rentals, Inc.		Yancey Bros. Co.	
ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UNIT	AMOUNT	UNIT	AMOUNT	UNIT	AMOUNT	UNIT	AMOUNT	UNIT	AMOUNT	UNIT	AMOUNT
104	Rental, Single-Drum Ride-on vibratory Compactor Drum width 54" Pad-foot	Weekly	\$ 1,125.00	Weekly	\$ 895.00	Weekly	\$ 1,090.00	Weekly	\$ 900.00	Weekly	\$ 1,110.00	Weekly	\$ 1,000.00
105	Rental, Single-Drum Ride-on vibratory Compactor Drum width 54" Pad-foot	Monthly	\$ 2,620.00	Monthly	\$ 2,163.00	Monthly	\$ 2,485.00	Monthly	\$ 2,700.00	Monthly	\$ 2,535.00	Monthly	\$ 2,450.00
106	Drum width 54" Pad-foot	Weekly	\$ 1,125.00	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	No bid	Weekly	\$ 900.00	Weekly	\$ 1,110.00	Weekly	\$ 1,000.00
107	Drum width 54" Pad-foot	Monthly	\$ 2,620.00	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	No bid	Monthly	\$ 2,700.00	Monthly	\$ 2,535.00	Monthly	\$ 2,450.00
108	Rental, Single-Drum Ride-on Vibratory Compactor Drum width 66" Smooth	Weekly	\$ 1,400.00	Weekly	\$ 1,015.00	Weekly	\$ 1,340.00	Weekly	\$ 1,000.00	Weekly	\$ 1,175.00	Weekly	\$ 1,400.00
109	Rental, Single-Drum Ride-on Vibratory Compactor Drum width 66" Smooth	Monthly	\$ 2,850.00	Monthly	\$ 2,468.00	Monthly	\$ 2,940.00	Monthly	\$ 3,000.00	Monthly	\$ 2,715.00	Monthly	\$ 2,999.00
110	Rental, Single-Drum Ride-on Vibratory Compactor Drum width 66" Pad-foot	Weekly	\$ 1,400.00	Weekly	\$ 1,015.00	Weekly	\$ 1,340.00	Weekly	\$ 1,000.00	Weekly	\$ 1,175.00	Weekly	\$ 1,525.00
111	Rental, Single-Drum Ride-on Vibratory Compactor Drum width 66" Pad-foot	Monthly	\$ 2,850.00	Monthly	\$ 2,468.00	Monthly	\$ 2,940.00	Monthly	\$ 3,000.00	Monthly	\$ 2,715.00	Monthly	\$ 3,275.00
112	Rental, Single-Drum Ride-on Vibratory Compactor Drum width 84" Smooth	Weekly	\$ 1,700.00	Weekly	\$ 1,261.00	Weekly	\$ 1,640.00	Weekly	\$ 1,200.00	Weekly	\$ 1,323.00	Weekly	\$ 1,685.00
113	Rental, Single-Drum Ride-on Vibratory Compactor Drum width 84" Smooth	Monthly	\$ 3,750.00	Monthly	\$ 3,000.00	Monthly	\$ 3,900.00	Monthly	\$ 3,500.00	Monthly	\$ 2,869.00	Monthly	\$ 4,130.00
114	Rental, Single-Drum Ride-on Vibratory Compactor Drum width 84" Pad-foot	Weekly	\$ 1,700.00	Weekly	\$ 1,261.00	Weekly	\$ 1,640.00	Weekly	\$ 1,200.00	Weekly	\$ 1,323.00	Weekly	\$ 1,725.00
115	Rental, Single-Drum Ride-on Vibratory Compactor Drum width 84" Pad-foot	Monthly	\$ 3,250.00	Monthly	\$ 3,000.00	Monthly	\$ 3,900.00	Monthly	\$ 3,500.00	Monthly	\$ 2,869.00	Monthly	\$ 4,225.00
116	Rental, Concrete Bucket; One (1) Cubic Yard	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	\$ 180.00	Weekly	\$ 104.00	Weekly	N/A	Weekly	\$ 167.00	Weekly	N/A
117	Rental, Concrete Bucket; One (1) Cubic Yard	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	\$ 500.00	Monthly	\$ 270.00	Monthly	N/A	Monthly	\$ 425.00	Monthly	N/A
118	Rental, Concrete Bucket; Two (2) Cubic Yard	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	\$ 234.00	Weekly	No bid	Weekly	N/A	Weekly	\$ 203.00	Weekly	N/A
119	Rental, Concrete Bucket; Two (2) Cubic Yard	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	\$ 668.00	Monthly	No bid	Monthly	N/A	Monthly	\$ 565.00	Monthly	N/A
120	Rental, Slow Speed Shredder, Minimum 22 tons unit -- On tracks	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	No bid	Weekly	N/A	Weekly	N/A	Weekly	\$ 13,000.00
121	Rental, Slow Speed Shredder, Minimum 22 tons unit -- On tracks	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	No bid	Monthly	N/A	Monthly	N/A	Monthly	\$ 35,000.00
122	Rental, Direct Feed Scalper (Dirt Screen) -- Minimum 16'x5' screening box -- On tracks	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	No bid	Weekly	N/A	Weekly	N/A	Weekly	\$ 5,280.00
123	Rental, Direct Feed Scalper (Dirt Screen) -- Minimum 16'x5' screening box -- On tracks	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	No bid	Monthly	N/A	Monthly	N/A	Monthly	\$ 13,200.00
124	Rental, Jaw Crusher (Concrete Crusher) -- Minimum 46" Jaw -- On tracks	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	No bid	Weekly	N/A	Weekly	N/A	Weekly	\$ 9,865.00
125	Rental, Jaw Crusher (Concrete Crusher) -- Minimum 46" Jaw -- On tracks	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	No bid	Monthly	N/A	Monthly	N/A	Monthly	\$ 23,476.00
126	Rental, Skid Steer, Rubber Tire S630, Operating Capacity 7160 lbs. -- Preferred Bobcat 10229145 or Compatible brand.	DEERE 332 Weekly	\$ 725.00	Weekly	\$ 700.00	Weekly	\$ 642.00	Weekly	N/A	Weekly	\$ 891.00	Weekly	\$ 825.00
127	Rental, Skid Steer, Rubber Tire S630, Operating Capacity 7160 lbs. -- Preferred Bobcat 10229145 or Compatible brand.	Monthly	\$ 2,025.00	Monthly	\$ 1,438.00	Monthly	\$ 1,450.00	Monthly	N/A	Monthly	\$ 2,355.00	Monthly	\$ 1,825.00
128	High Lift Rubber Tire Loader 644 John Deere or Equivalent	Weekly	\$ 8,025.00	Weekly	\$ 2,948.00	Weekly	No bid	NON HIGH LIFT Weekly	\$ 2,000.00	Weekly	\$ 1,872.00	Weekly	N/A
129	High Lift Rubber Tire Loader 644 John Deere or Equivalent	Monthly	\$ 7,500.00	Monthly	\$ 6,500.00	Monthly	No bid	NON HIGH LIFT Monthly	\$ 6,000.00	Monthly	\$ 5,804.00	Monthly	N/A
130	Skid Steer 325G John Deere or Equivalent	CTL Weekly	\$ 1,110.00	Weekly	\$ 850.00	Weekly	\$ 794.00	Weekly	\$ 850.00	Weekly	\$ 1,165.00	Weekly	\$ 925.00
131	Skid Steer 325G John Deere or Equivalent	Monthly	\$ 2,600.00	Monthly	\$ 1,889.00	Monthly	\$ 2,050.00	Monthly	\$ 2,500.00	Monthly	\$ 2,450.00	Monthly	\$ 2,100.00
132	Airsweeper Vacuum/Sweeper Tymco 435 or Equivalent	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	No bid	Weekly	N/A	Weekly	\$ 4,050.00	Weekly	N/A
133	Airsweeper Vacuum/Sweeper Tymco 435 or Equivalent	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	No bid	Monthly	N/A	Monthly	\$ 7,863.00	Monthly	N/A
134	Rubber Tire Loader 644 High Reach or Equivalent	Weekly	\$ 2,400.00	Weekly	\$ 2,948.00	Weekly	No bid	NON HIGH REACH Weekly	\$ 2,000.00	Weekly	\$ 1,872.00	Weekly	N/A
135	Rubber Tire Loader 644 High Reach or Equivalent	Monthly	\$ 7,500.00	Monthly	\$ 6,500.00	Monthly	No bid	NON HIGH REACH Monthly	\$ 6,000.00	Monthly	\$ 5,804.00	Monthly	N/A
136	Track Loader 963 Caterpillar or Equivalent	Weekly	\$ 3,500.00	Weekly	\$ -	Weekly	No bid	Weekly	\$ 2,525.00	Weekly	N/A	Weekly	\$ 4,260.00
137	Track Loader 963 Caterpillar or Equivalent	Monthly	\$ 8,500.00	Monthly	\$ -	Monthly	No bid	Monthly	\$ 6,800.00	Monthly	N/A	Monthly	\$ 8,844.00



DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING AND CONTRACTING
BID TABULATION

ITB No.: 21-101466
 ITB Name: RENTAL OF VARIOUS HEAVY EQUIPMENT

Bid Opening: February 1, 2022
 Price Schedule Opening: February 1, 2022
 Agent: Michele L. Smith

COMPANY:		Flint Equipment Co.			H & E Equipment Services, Inc.			Herc Rentals, Inc.			Mashburn Equipment, LLC			Sunbelt Rentals, Inc.			Yancey Bros. Co.		
ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION		UNIT	AMOUNT		UNIT	AMOUNT		UNIT	AMOUNT		UNIT	AMOUNT		UNIT	AMOUNT		UNIT	AMOUNT
138	Dozier D-6 Caterpillar or Equivalent		Weekly	\$ 3,975.00		Weekly	\$ 1,974.00		Weekly	\$ 1,744.00		Weekly	\$ 1,950.00		Weekly	\$ 2,700.00		Weekly	\$ 4,975.00
139	Dozier D-6 Caterpillar or Equivalent		Monthly	\$ 10,750.00		Monthly	\$ 5,388.00		Monthly	\$ 4,269.00		Monthly	\$ 5,800.00		Monthly	\$ 7,650.00		Monthly	\$ 10,336.00
140	Dozier D-8T Caterpillar or Equivalent		Weekly	\$ 6,300.00		Weekly	\$ -		Weekly	No bid		Weekly	\$ 4,500.00		Weekly	\$ 4,860.00		Weekly	\$ 7,685.00
141	Dozier D-8T Caterpillar or Equivalent		Monthly	\$ 18,500.00		Monthly	\$ -		Monthly	No bid		Monthly	\$ 13,000.00		Monthly	\$ 13,600.00		Monthly	\$ 16,004.00
142	Excavator 490 Caterpillar or Equivalent		Weekly	\$ 4,500.00		Weekly	\$ 5,800.00		Weekly	No bid		Weekly	\$ 3,750.00		Weekly	N/A		Weekly	N/A
143	Excavator 490 Caterpillar or Equivalent		Monthly	\$ 12,700.00		Monthly	\$ 14,025.00		Monthly	No bid		Monthly	\$ 11,000.00		Monthly	N/A		Monthly	N/A
144	Off-Road Truck - 40 tons Caterpillar or Equivalent		Weekly	\$ 4,550.00		Weekly	\$ 5,860.00		Weekly	No bid		Weekly	\$ 4,000.00		Weekly	N/A		Weekly	\$ 5,880.00
145	Off-Road Truck - 40 tons Caterpillar or Equivalent		Monthly	\$ 13,250.00		Monthly	\$ 12,000.00		Monthly	No bid		Monthly	\$ 12,000.00		Monthly	N/A		Monthly	\$ 12,320.00
146	John Deere 644 High Lift rubber tire loader or equivalent.		Weekly	\$ 2,500.00		Weekly	\$ 2,948.00		Weekly	\$ 2,080.00		NON HIGH LIFT Weekly	\$ 2,000.00		Weekly	\$ 1,872.00		Weekly	N/A
147	John Deere 644 High Lift rubber tire loader or equivalent.		Monthly	\$ 7,500.00		Monthly	\$ 6,500.00		Monthly	\$ 6,350.00		NON HIGH LIFT Monthly	\$ 6,000.00		Monthly	\$ 5,804.00		Monthly	N/A
148	John Deere 325G skid steer or equivalent.		Weekly	\$ 1,110.00		Weekly	\$ 950.00		Weekly	\$ 1,048.00		Weekly	\$ 850.00		Weekly	\$ 1,165.00		Weekly	\$ 925.00
149	John Deere 325G skid steer or equivalent.		Monthly	\$ 2,600.00		Monthly	\$ 1,889.00		Monthly	\$ 2,500.00		Monthly	\$ 2,500.00		Monthly	\$ 2,450.00		Monthly	\$ 2,100.00
150	Tymco 435 Airweeper vacuum/sweeper or equivalent.		Weekly	\$ -		Weekly	\$ -		Weekly	No bid		Weekly	N/A		Weekly	\$ 4,050.00		Weekly	N/A
151	Tymco 435 Airweeper vacuum/sweeper or equivalent.		Monthly	\$ -		Monthly	\$ -		Monthly	No bid		Monthly	N/A		Monthly	\$ 7,863.00		Monthly	N/A
152	DELIVERY Charge		LOT	\$ 500.00	UNLESS PERMITTED	LOT	\$ 100.00		LOT	\$ 125.00		LOT	\$ 725.00	125 EACH WAY + 3.85 PER LOADED MILE	LOT	\$ 125.00		LOT	\$ 150.00
153	PICK- UP Charge		LOT	\$ 500.00	UNLESS PERMITTED	LOT	\$ 100.00		LOT	\$ 125.00		LOT	\$ 725.00	125 EACH WAY + 3.85 PER LOADED MILE	LOT	\$ 125.00		LOT	\$ 150.00
TOTAL AMOUNT				\$		\$	283,572.00		*	\$	197,681.00				**	\$	272,174.00		
Number of Bids Received:		9																	
LSBE Participation Benchmark/GFE:		Waived			Waived			Waived			Waived			Waived			Waived		
Attendance at the Mandatory LSBE Meeting (Yes/No):		N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A			N/A		
Submitted Revised Price Schedule (Yes/No):		Yes			Yes			Yes			Yes			Yes			Yes		

NOTES/DETAIL JUSTIFICATION:

Only responsive bids were tabulated.

* Herc Rentals elected to enter Total Amount on the Price Schedule-Revised form. It appears to have a calculation error entered as \$197,681.00. The correct Total Amount is \$197,682.00.

** Sunbelt Rentals elected to enter Total Amount on the Price Schedule-Revised form. It appears to have a calculation error entered as \$272,174.00. The correct Total Amount is \$272,874.00.

Vendors deemed Non-Responsive (only responsive bids are tabulated):

1. Border Equip. Co., 3185 Moreland Ave., Conley, GA 30281: Failure to submit completed forms required as the Bid Acknowledgement Form, Attachment E-Contractor Affidavit and Attachment F-Subcontractor Affidavit.
2. Sunstate Equip., 4460 Moreland Ave., Conley, GA 30288: Failure to submit completed forms required as the Price Schedule-REVISED and Attachment E-Contractor Affidavit.
3. Synergy Rents, LLC, 3660 Erindale Drive, Valrico, FL 33596: Failure to submit completed form required as Attachment E-Contractor Affidavit.

Witness: _____

Agent: _____