

ITEM No.	DESCRIPTION	ANNUAL ESTIMATED No. of UNITS	UNIT	Ferguson Waterworks		KHAFFRA Operations, LLC	
				UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED AMOUNT	UNIT PRICE	EXTENDED AMOUNT
1	Box, heavy traffic Panel Vault, CDR Systems No. B1B489648A, or acceptable equal.	30	EA	\$4,221.12	\$126,633.60	\$3,094.92	\$92,847.60
2	Cover, heavy traffic Panel Vault, CDR Systems No C1BB489603A or acceptable equal.	30	EA	\$3,160.98	\$94,829.40	\$2,317.63	\$69,528.90
3	Extension, heavy traffic Panel Vault, CDR Systems No. EOB489612A or acceptable equal.	10	EA	\$2,741.23	\$27,412.30	\$2,009.87	\$20,098.70
4	Wall Beam, heavy traffic Panel Vault, CDR No. B1A489602A or acceptable equal.	1	EA	\$2,741.23	\$2,741.23	No Bid	No Bid
5	Top Collar only, heavy traffic Panel Vaults, CDR No. B2A489603, or acceptable equal.	30	EA	\$2,741.23	\$82,236.90	No Bid	No Bid
6	Box of, heavy traffic Panel Vaults, CDR Systems No. B1B366024A, or acceptable equal.	20	EA	\$2,623.51	\$52,470.20	\$1,923.55	\$38,471.00
7	Box, heavy duty, CDR Systems No. B1B366036A or acceptable equal.	1	EA	\$2,358.05	\$2,358.05	\$1,728.92	\$1,728.92
8	Cover, heavy duty CDR System No. C1B366003A, or acceptable equal.	20	EA	\$1,059.48	\$21,189.60	\$776.81	\$15,536.20
9	Extension, heavy duty, CDR System No. EOA366012A, or acceptable equal.	1	EA	\$1,387.40	\$1,387.40	\$1,183.73	\$1,183.73
10	Top Collar Only, heavy duty, CDR No. EOB366005H, or acceptable equal.	20	EA	\$1,387.40	\$27,748.00	No Bid	No Bid
11	Box, meter, heavy traffic, 24-inches wide x 36-inches long x 18-inches deep CDR NO. B12243618A, or acceptable equal.	100	EA	\$814.82	\$81,482.00	\$597.42	\$59,742.00
12	Cover only, meter box, heavy traffic, must fit item 11, CDR No. C12243603A, or acceptable equal.	20	EA	\$346.43	\$6,928.60	\$254.00	\$5,080.00
13	Box, meter heavy traffic, 17 inches wide x 30 inches long x 18-inches deep, CDR Bi B12173018A or acceptable equal.	300	EA	\$548.74	\$164,622.00	\$402.34	\$120,702.00
14	Cover only, meter box, heavy duty, must fit item 13, CDR No. C12173002A.	60	EA	\$252.26	\$15,135.60	\$184.96	\$11,097.60
15	Panel Vault, 72-inches x 96 inches x 60 inches, with locking covers, Quazite Compositolite or acceptable	1	EA	\$20,130.33	\$20,130.33	\$9,346.49	\$9,346.49
16	Extension Assembly Panel Vault, 12-inches, to include four (4) panels with inserts, eight (8) corner brackets and 16-3/8 inch zinc-coated steel bolts and washers: Quazite Compositolite or acceptable equal.	1	EA	\$5,045.20	\$5,045.20	\$3,699.14	\$3,699.14
TOTAL ANNUAL AMOUNT				\$732,350.41		\$449,062.28	
Number of Bids Received: 2							
LSBE Participation Benchmark/GFE				Waived		Waived	
Attendance at the Mandatory LSBE Meeting (Yes/No)				Waived		Waived	
Separate Sealed Price Schedule (Yes/No)				Yes		Yes	
NOTES							
Items in red indicate corrected extended pricing amount as there were obvious miscalculation errors. In the event that extended pricing provided by a vendor does not equal the estimated quantity multiplied by the unit of pricing, the unit pricing is considered to be the accurate pricing.							

Witness Signature _____

Agent Signature _____