



DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING AND CONTRACTING
 BID TABULATION

RFQ No. 21-300189
 RFQ Name: Work Gloves for Sanitation and Beautification Division

Bid Opening: September 23, 2021
 Agent: Marion Dean

ITEM	ITEM DESCRIPTION	Estimated # of Units	Unit of Measure	Pyramid School Products		Safety Products Inc.		Premier Safety		Alternative Option 1 Premier Safety Pyramex#GL1002W		Alternative Option 2 Premier Safety Cordova #7240		Bison Production Company		Benchmark Health		Norfleet Distributors LLC		Conney Safety	
				Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price
1	Gloves, leather palm work, gauntlet long cuff, Size S Liberty Brand or Equivalent	20	Dozen	NO BID	NO BID	\$25.35	\$507.00	\$25.33	\$506.60	\$28.96	\$579.20	\$23.67	\$473.40	\$22.68	\$453.60	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$33.12	\$662.40
2	Gloves, leather palm work, gauntlet long cuff, Size M Liberty Brand or Equivalent	100	Dozen	NO BID	NO BID	\$25.35	\$2,535.00	\$25.33	\$2,533.00	\$28.96	\$2,896.00	\$23.67	\$2,367.00	\$22.68	\$2,268.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$33.12	\$3,312.00
3	Gloves, leather palm work, gauntlet long cuff, Size L Liberty Brand or Equivalent	100	Dozen	NO BID	NO BID	\$25.35	\$2,535.00	\$25.33	\$2,533.00	\$28.96	\$2,896.00	\$23.67	\$2,367.00	\$22.68	\$2,268.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$45.20	\$4,520.00	\$33.12	\$3,312.00
4	Gloves, leather palm work, gauntlet long cuff, Size XL Liberty Brand or Equivalent	700	Dozen	NO BID	NO BID	\$26.95	\$18,865.00	\$25.33	\$17,731.00	\$28.96	\$20,272.00	\$25.27	\$17,689.00	\$22.68	\$15,876.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$45.20	\$31,640.00	\$33.12	\$23,184.00
5	Gloves, leather palm work, gauntlet long cuff, Size XXL Liberty Brand or Equivalent	200	Dozen	NO BID	NO BID	\$30.50	\$6,100.00	\$25.33	\$5,066.00	\$28.96	\$5,792.00	\$26.20	\$5,240.00	\$22.68	\$4,536.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$35.06	\$7,012.00
6	Powdered Free, Latex Gloves, 4 - 4.5 Mil, Size S	10	Box	\$9.99	\$99.90	\$12.10	\$121.00	\$16.27	\$162.70	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$9.60	\$96.00	\$6.80	\$68.00	\$15.75	\$157.50	\$9.42	\$94.20
7	Powdered Free, Latex Gloves, 4 - 4.5 Mil, Size M	10	Box	\$9.99	\$99.90	\$8.50	\$85.00	\$16.27	\$162.70	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$9.60	\$96.00	\$6.80	\$68.00	\$15.75	\$157.50	\$9.42	\$94.20
8	Powdered Free, Latex Gloves, 4 - 4.5 Mil, Size L	25	Box	\$9.99	\$249.75	\$8.50	\$212.50	\$16.27	\$406.75	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$9.60	\$240.00	\$6.80	\$170.00	\$15.75	\$393.75	\$9.42	\$235.50
9	Powdered Free, Latex Gloves, 4 - 4.5 Mil, Size XL	100	Box	\$9.99	\$999.00	\$8.50	\$850.00	\$16.27	\$1,627.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$9.60	\$960.00	\$6.80	\$680.00	\$15.75	\$1,575.00	\$9.42	\$942.00
10	Powdered Free, Latex Gloves, 4 - 4.5 Mil, Size 2XL	20	Box	NO BID	NO BID	\$16.30	\$326.00	\$16.27	\$325.40	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$9.42	\$188.40
TOTAL		1,285			\$1,448.55	\$32,136.50		\$31,054.15		\$32,435.20		\$28,136.40		**\$26,793.60		\$986.00		*** \$38,443.75		****\$39,036.70	
Number of Bids Received: 7																					

* Mathematical error with Premier Safety Quote Form submission line item #9. Submitted total sum recorded: \$29,589.85 - Vendor acknowledged the error and confirmed corrected price will be honored.
 **Mathematical error with Bison Production Company Quote Form submission line item #4. Submitted total sum recorded: \$26,796.60. Vendor acknowledged the error and confirmed corrected price will be honored.
 *** Mathematical error with Norfleet Distributors Quote Form submission line items #4, #8, #9. Submitted total sum recorded: \$ left blank - Vendor acknowledged the error and confirmed correct prices will be honored.
 **** Mathematical error with Conney Safety Quote Form submission line item #8 The Estimated # of units is 25 units. Conney Safety is requiring orders in increments of ten (10). Submitted total sum recorded: \$39,083.80. Line #10 Per Conney Safety, the 2XL was quoted in error.

Witness Signature: *Saharah Allen*
 Agent Signature: *Marion Dean*