ITB 'Number: 21-101394 DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING Bid Opening Date: May 11, 2021
Anti-freeze BID TABULATION Tammy Shew

Antifreeze, Ethylene Glycol, [lcavy Duty, extended
life, to be packaged in 55 gallon drums, and in
$7.89/gal -$433.95 $4,339.50 $455.00 $4,550.00

accordance with enclosed Minimum Specifications
and notes on page 23,
$8.63/gal.
$1,864.08 (3x1gal CS) $4,315.00 No Bid No Bid
Pallet-72CS
§7.77/gal.
$1,537.92 (3x1gal CS)

(Estimated Qty: 10 Drums)
$23.31 (3x1gal CS)
No Bid No Bid
Pallet-72CS
o o

$9.61/gal.
$28.83 (3x1gal CS) $4,805.00 No Bid No Bid
$528.55/Drum

Antifreeze, Extended Life, packaged in one gallon
jugs, and in accordance with enclosed Minimum
Specifications and notes on page 24,

(Estimated Qty: 500 Gal)

$9.28/gal,
$27.84 (3x1gal CS)

$4,640.00

Antifrecze, Extended Life, to be packaged in onc-
gallon jugs in cases and in pallet lots, and in
accordance with enclosed Minimum Specifications
and notes on page 24,
(Estimated Qty: 500 Gal)

Antifreeze, Fluorescent Green, packaged in one
gallon jugs, and in accordance with enclosed
Minimuin Specifications and notes on page 25.
(Estimated Qty: 1500 Gal)

[—
(%]

$11,655.00

Antifreeze, Fluorescent Green, to be packaged in one
gallon jugs in cases and in pallet lots, and in
accordance with enclosed Minimum Specifications
and notes on page 25, (Estimated Qty: 1000 Gal)

$7.12/gal.

g

$7,120.00

Antifreeze, CNG Blue Extended Life (must be blue
coolant)- ES Compleat, Ethylene Glycol Premix

50/50, meets or exceeds all fully formulated heavy-
duty specifications including: TMC RP-329, TMC RP
338, ASTM D-6210 ASTM D-3306, and SAE J1941,
(Estimated Qty: 1000 Gal)

[—y

Antifreeze, Ford Yellow Concentrated{must be
yellow)- Ford Specifications WSS-M97B57-Al.,
Meets or exceeds ASTM D 3306. Contains ethylene
glycol (107-21-1): 2,2’-oxydiethanol (11 1-46-6):
sodium 2-cthylexanoate (19766-89-3): water (7732-
18-5): sodium ncodecanoate (31548-27-3).
(Estimated Qty: 500 Gal)

Pallets, Wooden, in accordance
specifications and notes.

Number of Solicitations Received: 2

to Minimum

—
~]

Witnhess Signature:

Agent Signature:




ITB Number: 21-101394 DEPARTMENT OF PURCHASING CONTRACTING Bid Opening Date: May11, 2021
Anti-freeze BID TABULATION Tammy Shew

I The McPherson Co. Napa Auto Parts

Total Price Unit Price Total Price
ITEM NO

$19,425.00 56,60
$7,120.00 $6,60 $6,600.00

$3,930.00 $6,60 $3,300.00

$7,210.00 $6,60 $6,600.00
$4,213.00 $382.14 $3.821.40
$4,210.00 $6.78 $3,390.00

$3,885.00 $6.78 $3,390.00
$4,185.00 $7.98 $3,990.00

$19,300.00 $7.98 $3,990.00

Unit Price

Description

Antifreeze, Ethylene Glycol, to be in accordance with
Speccifications ASTM D3306 and D4985, to be
packaged in onc-gallon jugs, and in accordance with
enclosed Minimum Specifications and notes on page
20.

(Estimated Qty: 2,500 Gal.)

$7.77/gal.
$23.31 (3x1gal CS)

$16,500.00'

Antifreeze, Ethylene Glycol, to be packaged in one-
gallon jugs in cases and in pallet lots, and in
accordance with enclosed Minimum Specifications
and noles on page 20,
(Estimated Qty: 1000 Gal)

$7.12/gal.
$1,537.92 (3x1gal CS)
Palet-72CS

Antifreeze, Ethylene Glycol, extended life, to be in
accordance with Specifications GM 6277M and Ford
WWS-M97B44-D, to be packaged in one gallon jugs,
and in accordance with enclosed Minimum
Specifications and noles on page 21,

(Estimated Qty: 500 Gal)

$7.86/gal.
523.58 (3x1gal CS)

Antifreeze, Ethylene Glycol, extended life, to be
packaged in one-gallon jugs in cases and in pallet lots,
and in accordance with enclosed Minimum
Specifications and notes on page 21.

(Estimated Qty: 1000 Gal)

$7.21/gal.
$1,557.36 (3x1gal CS)
Palet-72CS

Antifreeze, Ethylene Glycol, extended life, to be
packaged in 55 gallon drums, and in accordance with
enclosed Minimum Specifications and notes on page
21. (Estimated Qty: 10 Drums)

$7.66/gal.-$421.30

Antifreeze, Heavy Duty, Glycol, packaged in onc
gallon jugs, and in accordance with enclosed
Minimum Specifications and notes on page 22.
(Estimated Qty: 500 Gal)

$8.42/gal.
$25.26 (3x1gal CS)

Antifreeze, Heavy Duty, Glycol, to be packaged in
one-gallon jugs in cases and in pallet lots, and in

accordance with enclosed Minimum Specifications
and notes on page 22, (Estimated Qty: 500 Gal)

$7.77/gal,
$1,678.37 (3x1gal CS)
Palet-72CS

Antifreeze, Ethylene Glycol, Heavy Duty, Extended
Life, packaged in one gallon jugs, and in accordance
with enclosed Minimum Specifications and notes on
page 23. (Estimated Qty: 500 Gal)

$8.37/gal.
$25.11 (3x1gal CS)

Antifrceze, Ethylene Glyceol, Hcavy Duty, Extended

life, to be packaged in one-gallon jugs in cases and in
pallet lots, and in accordance with enclosed Minimum
Specifications and notes on page 23.(Estimated Qty:
2,500 Gal.)

$7.72/gal.
$1,667.52 (3x1gal CS)
Palet-72CS

Witness Signature:

Agent Signature:



