ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT STEPHEN'S
item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES COWIN YANCY L&M
e | e | et | coumnrco, | o | conte | f L oben |,
. DIV. CO. LLC
Rental EXCAVATOR, 24, 000 LB - 26,000 LB
Current number in stock;
A e/ :
1, | Average Age/ Hours Daily | $528.00 | $468.00 $550.00 $525.00 $400.00 | $475.00 | $585.00 | NOBID
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)
2. | Rental EXCAVATOR, 24, 000 LB - 26,000 LB: Weekly | $1,368.00 | $1,440.00 |  $1,500.00 g}’ggg'gg $1,190.00 | $1,260.00 | $1,532.00 | NOBID
3. | Rental EXCAVATOR, 24, 000 LB - 26,000 LB: Monthly | $3,712.00 | $3,188.00 |  $3.950.00 gg’gg'gg $3,570.00 | $3,200.00 | $4,302.00 | NOBID
Rental EXCAVATOR, 42, 000 LB — 47,000 LB
Current number in stock:
Ape/ H :
4. | Average Age/ Hours Daily | $672.00 | $693.00 $700.00 $840.00 | s$ss0.00 | $52500 | $1,009.00 | NOBID
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

Witness Signature: | ﬂ/‘"ﬂ @\

Agent Signature:




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18,2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
NEFF SUNBELT COWIN BORDER FLINT YANCY L&M STEPHEN'S
RENTALS RENTALS EQUIPMENT CO., EQUIPMENT | CONSTRUCTI BROTHERS, EQUIPMENT, | MECHANICAL
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES Uni¢ INC. ON & CO. LLC
No. FORESTRY
DIV,
$1,810.00 )
5. | Rental EXCAVATOR, 42, 000 LB — 47,000 LB Weekly | $1,740.00 | $1,784.00 $2,100.00 $1,760.00 | $1,600.00 | $1.750.00 | $2,621.00 | NOBID
6. | Rental EXCAVATOR, 42, 000 LB — 47,000 LB Monthly | $4.687.00 | $4,684.00 |  $5000.00 gi’;ﬁ‘gg $4,760.00 | $4.500.00 | $5,634.00 | NO BID
Rental EXCAVATOR, 53, 000 LB — 60,000 LB
Current number in stock:
7. | Average Age/ Hours: Daily | $752.00 | NOBID $890.00 $1,050.00 | $65000 | $850.00 | $1,313.00 | NOBID
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)
8. | Rental EXCAVATOR, 53, 000 LB — 60,000 LB Weekly | $1,956.00 | NOBID $2,500.00 $2,625.00 | $1,90000 | $2,700.00 | $3,623.00 | NO BID
9. | Rental EXCAVATOR, 53, 000 LB — 60,000 LB Monthly | $5308.00 | NOBID $5,700.00 $7.875.00 | $5525.00 | $6,500.00 | $10,185.00 | NO BID
Rental EXCAVATOR, 75, 000 LB - 85,000 LB
Current number in stock:
A /H :
Jo. | Average Age/Hours Daily | siu000 | NOBID | 110000 | 157500 | s9s0.00 | $1.000.00 | $1,20600 | NOBID
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

Witness Signature:




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711 DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT STEPHEN'S
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES COWIN YANCY L&M
| iR | T | soumerco, | sonoee | cowtre f GG f bt [ mechaen:
: i co. LLC

1L Rental EXCAVATOR, 75, 000 LB - 85,000 LB Weekly | $2,964.00 NO BID $3.000.00 $4,070.00 $2,800.00 $3,000.00 | $3,172.00 NOBID
12. | Rental EXCAVATOR, 75, 000 LB — 85,000 LB Monthly | $,7887.00 | NOBID $8,100.00 $9,975.00 | $8,200.00 | $7.900.00 | $9,249.00 | NOBID

Rental EXCAVATOR, 95, 000 LB - 115,000 LB

Current number in stock;
13, | Average Age/Hours: Daily | NOBD | NOBDD $1,500.00 NOBID | $1,200,00 | $2.000.00 | $1,750.00 [ NOBID

Bidding on:

(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

14, | Rental EXCAVATOR, 95,000 LB - 115,000 LB Weekly | NOBID [ NOBID $4,500.00 NOBID | g¢340000 | $4.500.00 | $4,550.00 | NOBDD
15. | Rental EXCAVATOR, 95, 000 LB — 115,000 LB Monthly | NOBID | NOBID $11,500.00 NOBID | g19,50000 | $12,000.00 | $16,780.00 [ NOBID

Rental BACKHOE, Full Size 4x2

Current number in stock:

Average Age/Hours 5 NOBID | $326.00 NO BID
16. Daily NO BID $256.00 NO BID $275.00 $175.00

Bidding on:

(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

Witness Signature: ( iLL/j_j@ ;
Agent Signam@"—f - ‘Z




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT STEPHEN'S
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES COWIN YANCY L&M
No. Unit RSN'::: :LS Snlé:'[;ilf; EQUIPMENT CO., Eg&':‘;ﬁ:% ﬁgﬁ'g?ﬁﬁ BROTHERS, | EQUIPMENT, | MECHANICAL
INC. DIV, co. LLC
2
17. | Rental BACKHOE, Full Size 4x2 Weekly | NOBID | $692.00 NO BID §70000 | ¢s55000 | NOBID | $977.00 | NOBID
i 7

Rental BACKHOE, Full Size 4x4

Current number in stock:
19. | Average Age/Hours Daily | $228.00 | $256.00 $225.00 $295.00 $175.00 | $20000 | $411.00 | NOBIDD

Bidding on:

(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)
9 $575.00 $958.00 NO BID

20. Rental BACKHOE, Full Size 4x4 Weekly £572.00 $692.00 $575.00 $725.00 $550.00
21. | Rental BACKHOE, Full Size 4x4 Monthly | $1,478.00 | $1,464.00 $1,400.00 $1,970.00 | $1,550.00 | $1,150.00 | $1,658.00 | NOBID

Rental BACKHOE, EXTENDAHOE, Full Size, 4x2

Current number in stock:

Average Age/Hours
22. Daily | NOBID | $260.00 NO BID $300.00 $175.00 | NOBID | $35800 | NOBID

Bidding on;

(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT STEPHEN'S
Ttem COMMODITIES OR SERVICES COWIN YANCY L&M
No. Unit R;Nﬁ."::l_s ;‘é’;ﬂi’l‘; EQUIPMENT CO., Eg&'::ﬁ:';_r gg:g-ﬁaﬁ BROTHERS, | EQuipMeNT, | MECHANICAL
INC. DIV, co. LLC
: 9

24. | Rental BACKHOE, EXTENDAHOE, Full Size, 4x2 Monthly | NOBID | ¢y 62409 NOBID $2,000.00 | $1,550.00 | NOBID | $1,957.00 | NOBID

Rental BACKHOE, EXTENDAHOE, Full Size, 4x4

Current number in stock:

A :
25, | AAverage Age/Hours Daily | $256.00 | $260.00 $275.00 $315.00 $17500 | $22500 | $416.00 | NOBID

Bidding on:

(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

26. | Rental BACKHOE, EXTENDAHOE, Full Size, 4x4 Weekly | $63600 | $692.00 $750.00 $895.00 $550.00 $600.00 | $963.00 NOBID
27." | Rental BACKHOE, EXTENDAHOE, Full Size, 4x4 Monthly | $1,676.00 | $1,684.00 |  $1,800.00 | $2,205.00 | $1,550.00 | $1,500.00 | $1,977.00 { NOBID

Rental DOZER, 70 HP

Current number in stock:

Average Age/Hours:

; $300.00 $608.00 NO BID
28. Bidding on: Daily $468.00 NO BID $500.00 $500.00 $350.00
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

Witness Signature:

Agent Signature:




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
vy £q
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT STEPHEN’S
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES COWIN YANCY L&M
| el [ S | coumimrco, | goroms | conTe | oagmiens | otifb, [ EcHcn
: DIV. : ¢

29, | Rental DOZER, 70 HP Weekly | s1.21600 | NOBID | g150000 | 131500 | $1,00000 | $900.00 | $1,656.00 | NOBID
30, | Rental DOZER, 70 HP Monthly | $3,224.00 | NOBID $3,600.00 $3,465.00 | $3,000.00 | $2:400.00 } $3,408.00 | NOBID

Rental DOZER, 80 HP

Current number in stock:
31. | Average Age/Hours: Daily | NOBID [ NOBDD $650.00 $580.00 | NOBID | NOBID | $61000 | NOBID

Bidding on:

(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

Rental DOZER, 80 HP NO BID NOBID $1,873.00 NO BID
32, Weekly NO BID NO BID $1,750.00 $1,450.00

Rental DOZER, 80 HP
1. Monthly | NOBID | NOBID $3,800.00 $404500 | NOBID | NOBID | $4,505.00 | NOBID

Winess Signature: M
s g

Agent Signature: %ﬁ[ — ~




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES . NEFF SUNBELT COWIN BORDER o YANCY L&M STEPHEN'S
No. = RENTALS | RENTALs | EQUIPMENTCO. | poipnent | Forestry | BROTHERS, | EQUIPMENT, | MECHANICAL
INC. B co. LLC
Rental DOZER, 90 HP
Current number in stock:
; $450.00 £641.00 NO BID
34, Average Age/Hours: Daily $536.00 NO BID $700.00 $685.00 $400.00
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)
L |z er2a SRl s Weekly | s140000 | NOBID | 5180000 | $1,575.00 | $120000 | 5120000 | $1,87400 | NOBID
36. | Rental DOZER, 90 HP Monthly | $3,657.00 | NOBID $4,200.00 $4,20000 | $3,400.00 | $3.600.00 | $4,687.00 | NOBID
Rental DOZER, 125 HP
Current number in stock:
A :
37, | AAverage Age/Hours Daily | $75200 | NOBID $900.00 $790.00 $650.00 | $680.00 | $778.00 | NOBID
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

12

Witness Signature:

g

Agent Signature@?’g =
7’




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT STEPHEN’S
COWIN YANCY L&M

e | wivins | R [ soumimrco, [ jgomen | conTe | i | coliier | wEcncn
No. INC. DIV, CO. LLC
S Weekly | 196000 | NOBID | 5510000 | s$1,84000 | $1,900.00 | $2.000.00 | $2.414.00 [ NOBID
39, | Rental DOZER, 125 HP Monthly | s5188.00 | NOBID | g550000 | $525000 | $5600.00 | $5.000.00 [ $591800 | NOBD

Rental DOZER, 185 HP

Current number in stock:
40. | Average Age/Hours: Daily | NOBID | NOBID $1,150.00 $895.00 | s$8so.00 | $1,325.00 | $1,02500 | NOBID

Bidding on:

(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

41. | Rental DOZER, 185 HF Weekly | NOBID | NOBID $3,100.00 $2,41500 | $2,600.00 | $3,300.00 | $2.850.00 | NO BID
42. | Rental DOZER, 185 HP Monthly | \oeo | NoBD $7,200.00 $6,720.00 | $7,600.00 | $7.900.00 & $8,510.00 | NOBID

Rental DOZER, 240 HP

Current number in stock:
43, | Average Age/Hours: Daily | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NOBD | NOBD | $2500.00 | $1,756.00 | NOBID

Bidding on:

(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

Witness Signature:




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT STEPHEN'S
COWIN YANCY L&M MECHANICAL
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES T R;'NE: :Ls f"é:ﬁ'[‘; EQUIPMENT CO., Eg&'::lii,r gg:g;%aﬁ BROTHERS, | EQUIPMENT,
No. INC. i) co. LLC
44, | Rental DOZER, 240 HP Weekly NOBID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID $5,500.00 | $5,267.00 NO BID
45 | Rental DOZER, 240 HP Monthly NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $14,000.00 | $10,534.00 NO BID
Rental DOZER, 580 HP
Current number in stock:
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number
47. | Rental DOZER, 580 HP Weekly | NOBID | NOBID NOBID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID
48. | Rental DOZER, 580 HP Monthly NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID
Rental ROLLER, Walk-Behind, Pad Foot w/Remote 33"
Current number in stock:
a9, | Average Age/Hour: Daily | si92.00 | $248.00 $235.00 $21000 | NoBmD | $20000 | $198.00 | NOBID
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

Witness Signature: ﬁ W

Agent Signa




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annuat Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
NEFF SUNBELT COWIN BORDER FLINT YANCY L&M STEPHEN'S
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES RENTALS RENTALS EQUIPMENT CO., EQUIPMENT CONSTR. & BROTHERS, EQUIPMENT, | MECHANICAL
No. Unit INC. FORESTRY co. LLC
DIV,

50. | Rental ROLLER, Walk-Behind, Pad Foot w/Remote 33" Weekly | $512.00 | $668.00 $575.00 $420.00 NOoBID | $500.00 | $49800 | NOBID
51. | Rental ROLLER, Walk-Behind, Pad Foot w/Remote 33" Monthly | $1,324.00 | $1,704.00 $1,300.00 $1,155.00 | NOBm | 31,000.00 | $1,178.00 | NOBID

Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Pad Foot, 5 Ton, 54"

Current number in stock:

Average Age/Hour: - $250.00 | $400.00 | NOBID
52. Daily | $304.00 | $360.00 $375.00 $500.00 $290.00 : :

Bidding on:

(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)
53. | Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Pad Foot, 5 Ton, 54” Weekly | $828.00 | $980.00 $1,100,00 $1LI5500 | ggs000 | $700.00 | $1,071.00 | NOBID
7

>4 | Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Pad Foot, 5 Ton, 54 Monthly | $2,32000 | $2,460.00 |  $2.200.00 3294000 | 5 55000 | $1,500.00 | $2,537.00 | NOBID

Witness Signature:

Agent Signatﬁr'_ :

U=




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711 DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
{Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT ,
COWIN YANCY L&M STEPHEN'S
NEFF SUNBELT BORDER CONSTR.
ll:le;n COMMODITIES OR SERVICES T T el EQU]P:\:‘EC:NT €0, | cquipMent | FoResTRY S EQULILJ\.;ENT. G L
' DIv. )
Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Pad Foot, 8 Ton, 66
Current number in stock:
55. | Average Age/Hours: Daily | $360.00 | $337.00 $425.00 $605.00 $350.00 | $325.00 | $405.00 | NOBID
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)
56. | Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Pad Foot, 8 Ton, 66” Weekly | $984.00 | $820.00 $1,300.00 $1,300.00 | $1,00000 | $900.00 } $1,356.00 | NOBID
57. | Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Pad Foot, 8 Ton, 66" Monthly | $2,692.00 | $2,100.00 |  $2,950.00 $3,570.00 | $3,00000 | $2:400.00 | $3,10400 | NOBID
Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Pad Foot, 12 Ton, 84"
Current number in stock:
58. | Average Age/Hours: Daily | $42000 | NOBID $540.00 NOBID | s$4s000 | $390.00 | 849600 | NOBID
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

Witness Signature: Q AR Q’
Agent Signamre:%‘i




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
COWIN YANCY L&M
NEFF SUNBELT BORDER FLINT
item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES Unit RENTALS | RENTALs | EQUIPMENTCO, | oo nionr | constra | BROTHERS, | EQuIpMENT, STEME
No. INC. FORESTRY co. — MECHANICAL
DIV.
NO BID NO BID $985.00 $1,736.00 NO BID

59. Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Pad Foot, 12 Ton, 84" Weekly | $1,140.00 $1,450.00 $1,300.00
60. | Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Pad Foot, 12 Ton, 84" Monthty | $3,252.00 | NOBID $3,400.00 NOBID | g3900.00 | $3/400.00 | $4,352.00 | NOBID

Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Smooth Drum, 5 Ton, 54”

Current number in stock:
61. | Average Age/Hours: Daily | $252.00 | $268.00 $375.00 $500.00 $275.00 | $250.00 | $400.00 | NOBID

Bidding on:

(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)
B ide- 3 » 2

62. | Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Smooth Drum, 5 Ton, 54 Weekly $692.00 $708.00 $1,100.00 $1,155.00 $800.00 $700.00 $1,071.00 NO BID
63. | Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Smooth Drum, 5 Ton, 54” Monthly | $1,996.00 | $1,652.00 $2,200.00 $2,940.00 | $2,400.00 | $1.500.00 | $2,537.00 | NOBID

Witness Signature: ﬁ A %
S T e —
Agent Signature%f_ 2_




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711 DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
{Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES COWIN FLINT YANCY L&M STEPHEN'S
| s | el [ soumentco, | gomer f commre | SN | LAY | e
INC. i co. LLC
Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Smooth Drum, 8 Ton, 667
Current number in stock:
64. | Average Age/Hours: Daily | $316.00 | $337.00 $425.00 $605.00 $35000 | $32500 | $40500 | NOBID
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)
65. | Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Smooth Drum, 8 Ton, 66” Weekly | $864.00 | $820.00 $1,300.00 $1,300.00 $950.00 | $900.00 | $1,356.00 | NOBID
66. | Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Smooth Drum, 8 Ton, 66 Monthly | $2316.00 | $2,100.00 |  $2,950.00 | $3,570.00 | $2,800.00 | $2:400.00 | $3,104.00 | NOBID
Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Smooth Drum, 12 Ton, 84"
Current number in stock:
A Agpe/Hours:
67. | fAverage Age/Hours Daily | $392.00 | $480.00 $540.00 NOBID | $400.00 | $45000 ; 349600 | NOBID
Bidding on:
{Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

Witness Signature: K}/‘/R i
Agent Slgnatul@*/ Q.. = __




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT STEPHEN'S
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES COWIN YANCY L&M
Unit NEFF SUNBELT BORDER CONSTR. & MECHANICAL

No. RENTALS | RENnTALs | EQUIP ?]:ENT €O. 1 gquipmeNT l-'m:)r:f/mv Bkogg_ms' EQULTéENr’
68.

Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Smooth Drum, 12 Ton, 84" Weekly | $1,076.00 | $1,300.00 $1,450.00 NOBID | ) 200,00 | $1,250.00 | $1,736.00 | NOBID
69. Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Smooth Drum, 12 Ton, 84 Monthly | $2,824.00 | $2,805.00 $3.400.00 NO BID $3,600.00 $3,400.00 | $4,352.00 Ny

Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Smooth Drum, 1.5 Ton, 36”

Current number in stock;
70, | Average Age/Hours: Daily | $196.00 | $157.00 NO BID NOBID | nopmp | $12500 | $21800 | NOBID

Bidding on;

(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

71. | Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Smooth Drum, 1.5 Ton, 36" Weekly | $516.00 | $400.00 NOBID NOBID NOBID | $400.00 | $762.00 NO BID
72. | Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Smooth Drum, 1.5 Ton, 36" Monthly | $1,336.00 | $1,057.00 NO BID NOBID NOBID | $900.00 | $1,64700 | NOBID

Witness Signature: ﬁﬂﬂd’?
= _—
Agent Signatm%)&/ {-. /g




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT STEPHEN'S
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES COWIN YANCY L&M
No. Unit RE“E" :LS :‘é:gi'l‘; EQUIPMENT co,, | 3&%:&:1;17 ?g:g?ﬁ BROTHERS, | EQUIPMENT, | MECHANICAL
INC. 5 co. LLC

Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Single Drum, Smooth Drum, 2.5 Ton, 43"

Current number in stock:
73. | Average Age/Hours: Daily | $236.00 | NOBID NO BID $400.00 NoBID | $23000 | $31000 | NOBID

Bidding on:

(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

74.

Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Double Drum, Smooth Drum, 2.5 Ton, 43" Weekly | $624.00 | NOBID NOBID $1,470.00 | NoBmD | $630.00 | $94500 | NOBID
75. | Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Double Drum, Smooth Drum, 2.5 Ton, 43" Monthly | 3162000 | 6B NO BID $2,24000 | NOBID | $2,500.00 | $2,466.00 | NOBID

Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Double Drum, Smooth Drum, 3.5 Ton, 48~

Current number in stock:

Average Age/Hours: ,
76. Daily $252.00 | NOBID $235.00 $450.00 $175.00 $360.00 | $313.00 NO BID

Bidding on:

(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

Witness Signature: _QMQQO

Agent Signature: QQJ/C.; Mi——




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT STEPHEN’S
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES COWIN YANCY L&M
| s | s | coumierco, | aomom | conma | G [ ohav . furcamen.
INC. DIV, co. LLC
77, Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Double Drum, Smooth Drum, 3.5 Ton, 48 Weekly $652.00 NO BID $700.00 $900.00 $475.00 $1,060.00 $776.00 NO BID
2
78. | Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Double Drum, Smooth Drum, 3.5 Ton, 48" | Monthly | $1,652.00 | NOBID $2,100.00 3225000 | g 40000 |$320400 | $1,649.00 | NOBID
Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Double Drum, Smooth Drum, 12 Ton, 807
Current number in stock:
. NO BID NO BID $443.00 $£750.00 NO BID
79. Average Age/Hours: Daily NOBID NO BID $550.00
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)
1 o $1,320.00 | $1,995.00 NO BID
80. | Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Double Drum, Smooth Drum, 12 Ton, 80 Weekly NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,600.00
81. | Rental ROLLER, Ride-on, Double Drum, Smooth Drum, 12 Ton, 80" Monthly | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NOBID | ¢4 60000 | $3.986.00 | $4,850.00 | NOBID

Witness Signature:

Agent Signature?




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT STEPHEN'S
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES COWIN YANCY L&M
Ne. Unit Rew:l.s ;‘é:.':ig EQUIPMENT CO,, | 3&';:&% gg:g%& BROTHERS, | EQUIPMENT, | MECHANICAL
INC. s co. LLC
Rental ROLLER, Double Drum, Landfill, 80,000 LB,400 HP
Current number in stock:
82, | Average Age/Hours: Daily NoBID | NOBID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)
83. | Rental ROLLER, Double Drum, Landfill, 80,000 LB., 400 HP Weekly NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
84. | Rental ROLLER, Double Drum, Landfill, 80,000 LB., 400 HP Monthly NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Rental ROLLER, Double Drum, Landfill, 110,000 LB., 550 HP
Current number in stock:
85 Average Age/Hours:
’ Daily NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

Witness Signature: VA) A/ﬁgﬁ
<_ =

Agent Signature:




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT STEPHEN'S
Ttem COMMODITIES OR SERVICES COWIN YANCY L&M
No. Unit RET’?IF:LS :'é:.‘:ig EQUIPMENT CO., Eg&';:ﬁ:% ggzg}r‘kﬁ BROTHERS, | EQUIPMENT, | MECHANICAL
INC. e co. LLC

86. | Rental ROLLER, Double Drum, Landfill, 110,000 LB., 550 HP Weekly | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID
87. | Rental ROLLER, Double Drum, Landfill, 110,000 LB., 550 HP Monthly | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID

Rental TRACTOR, (Track Type) Caterpillar Model 963C, or acceptable

equal;

Current number in stock:

: NO BID NO BID NO BID $797.00 $967.00 NO BID

88. Average Age/Hours: Daily NOBID $850.00

Bidding on:

(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

80, 5;1?;;!, TRACTOR, (Track Type) Caterpillar Model 963C or acceptable Weekly | NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2,500.00 $2,316.00 | $2,750.00 NO BID
90. 5;:;;1'1, TRACTOR, (Track Type) Caterpillar Model 963C or acceptable Monthly | NOBID | NOBD NO BID NO BID $7,300.00 $7,080.00 | $8,692.00 NO BID

Witness Signatll:e: ,( Lﬂ&( (74__ -
Agent Signa;/;-::;? /k/ € .;/Z/




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711 DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT STEPHEN'S
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES COWIN YANCY L&M MECHANICAL
No. Unit R&? :LS :‘é:_':ﬁg EQUIPMENT CO, | . 3&';';&% {53.’:2";%;? BROTHERS, | EQUIPMENT,
INC, DIV co. LLC
Rental WHEEL LOADER, Caterpillar Model 938G, or acceptable equal:
Current number in stock:
A :
g1, | Average Age/Hours Daily | $580.00 | NOBID $670.00 $760.00 | $575.00 | $636.00 | $40400 [ NOBID
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)
9. Rental WHEEL LOADER, Caterpillar Model 938G, or acceptable equal: Weekly | $1,592.00  NOBID $2.000.00 $1,780.00 $1.700.00 | $1.812.00 | $1,402.00 NO BID
93. | Rental WHEEL LOADER, Caterpillar Model 938G, or acceptable equal: | Monthly | 398790 | NOBID 3500000 | g4 62000 | $5,10000 |$4760.00 | $354600 | NOBID
Rental WHEEL LOADER, Caterpillar Model 950G, or acceptable equal:
Current number in stock:
94, | Average Age/Hours: Daily | $728.00 | NOBID $800.00 $920.00 $650.00 | $760.00 | $673.00 | NOBID
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

Witness Signature: &Wﬂ@i

Agent Signature:




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
LT STEPHEN'S
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES COWIN YANCY L&M MECHANICAL
| et | et | coumeco, | gomen | conie | Gk | colittr
INC. DIV. co. LLC
95. | Rental, WHEEL LOADER, Caterpillar Model 950G or acceptable equal: | Weekly | $1,096.00 | NOBID $2,400.00 $2,100.00 | $1,900.00 | $2,248.00 | $1,831.00 | NOBID
NO BID $6,736.00 | $4,619.00 NOBID
‘J T 1
= Rental WHEEL LOADER, Caterpillar Model 950G, or acceptable equal: 22 L0 SRUEHILY $5,600.00
Rental TRUCK, Off Road Dump, Articulating 26 Ton
Current number in stock:
. . $832.00 NO BID NO BID
97. | Average Age/Hours: Daily NO BID NO BID $1,335.00 NO BID $900.00
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)
98. | Rental, TRUCK, Off Road, Dump, Articulating 26 Ton Weekly | NOBID | NOBID $3,100.00 NoBD | $2700.00 | $2500.00 | NOBID | NOBD
99. | Rental, TRUCK, Off Road, Dump, Articulating 26 Ton Monthly | NOBID | NOBID $8,100.00 NOBID | $8000.00 | $7440.00 | NOBID | NOBD

Witness Signature: ___ {

%
Agent Signatun%ls/ é . =




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITBNAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT STEPHEN'S
item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES COWIN YANCY L&M
Unit NEFF SUNBELT BORDER CONSTR. & MECHANICAL
No. 3 RENTALS | RENTALS EQU"’:‘&” €0+ | equipmENT | FORESTRY Bnoggens, EQULT(':ENT’
’ DIV. :

Rental TRUCK, Off Road Dump, Articulating 30 Ton

Current number in stock:
100. | Average Age/Hours: Daily $2,04500 | NOBID $1,485.00 NO BID $950.00 $900.00 NOBID NO BID

Bidding on;

(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)
NO BID NO BID $2,720.00 | NOBID NO BID
LU Rental TRUCK, Off Road, Dump, Articulating 30 Ton Weekly | $4,500.00 Rl $2,900.00
NO BID NO BID $8,100.00 | NOBID NO BID
2] y

— Rental TRUCK, Off Road, Dump, Articulating 30 Ton s SR TR $3,500.00 $8,500.00

Rental WHEEL LOADER, 28,000 LB

Current number in stock:
103, | Average Age/Hours: Daily $516.00 | NOBID $585.00 NO BID $575.00 $544.00 | NOBID NO BID

Bidding on:

(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

Witness Signature: 0 AR &7

S

Agent Signature:




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT STEPHEN'S
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES COWIN YANCY L&M
o | | R [ coviico. | gonmen | corerie | st [ ol | wECh
' DIV, :

104. | Rental, WHEEL LOADER, 28,000 LB: Weekly | SL41600 | 0o S NOBID | $170000 | $1.59%6.00 | NOBD | NOBD
105. | Rental WHEEL LOADER, 28,000 LB Monthly | $3,654.00 | NOBID $4,200.00 NOBID | g500.00 |$4160.00 | NOBID | NOBID

Rental WHEEL LOADER, 40,000 LB

Current number in stock:
106. | Average Age/Hours: Daily | $728.00 | NOBID $985.00 NO BID $650.00 | $760.00 | NOBID | NOBID

Bidding on:

(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

107. | Rental, WHEEL LOADER, 40,000 LB Weekly | $1,996.00 ( NOBID $2,850.00 NOBID | ¢;99900 | $2:248.00 | $2,693.00 | NOBID
108. | Rental WHEEL LOADER, 40,000 LB Monthly | $325200 | NOBID $7,00.00 NOBID | g5600.00 | $6.736.00 | $6,75500 | NOBID

Witness Signature;

Agent Signature:




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
|
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES NEFF sunseLT | o T CO FLINT YANCY L&M STEPHEN'S
N Unit RENTALS | RENTALS O E(;!&I;:ELT gggz;%& BROTHERS, | EQUIPMENT, | MECHANICAL
i co. LLC
Rental LOADER, Track Type, 33,000 LB
Current number in stock:
109, | Average Age/Hours: Daily | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NOBID | ¢s7500 | $69200 | NOBID | NOBID
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)
110. | Rental, LOADER. Track Type, 33,000 LB Weekly | vomm | NOBD NO BID NoBD | SL.700.00 | 3207600 | NOBID | NOBID
111. | Rental, LOADER. Track Type, 33,000 LB Monthly | \oBm | NOBD NO BID NOBID | $510000 | 3610800 | NOBID | NOBID
Rental LOADER, Track Type, 43,000 LB
Current number in stock:
112, | AAverage Age/Hours: Daily | NOBD | nopmD NO BID NOBID | g75000 | $797.00 | NOBID | NOBID
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name apd Brand Name/Number)

Witness Signature: M Q )

Agent Signature? A




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT STEPHEN'S
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES COWIN YANCY L&M
| s | D | soummco. | omen | cowie | g | ot | MEewcn
: DIV, .

Rental, LOAD NOBID NO BID NO BID ” $2,316.00 | NOBID NO BID
113. ER. Track Type, 43,000 LB Weekly NO BID $2,200.00

Rental, LOADER. Track Type, 43,000 LB $7,080.00 NO BID NO BID
114, Monthly NOBID | NOBDD NO BID NO BID $6,400.00

Rental TRUCK, 20-ton capacity, with telescoping hydraulic boom:

International Model 2674, or acceptable equal.

Current number in stock:

A A :
115. | Average Age/Hours Daily | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID

Bidding on:

(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number

Rental TRUCK, 20-ton capacity, with telescoping hydraulic boom; NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
116. . Weekly NO BID

International Model 2674, or acceptable equal.

Rental TRUCK, 20-ton capacity, with telescoping hydraulic boom;
117. | International Model 2674, or acceptable equal. Monthly NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID NOBID

Ao

f%%d

Witness Signature:

Agent Signatu




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
{Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT STEPHEN'S
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES COWIN YANCY L&M
No. Unit R;NFI‘TLS ig::ig EQUIPMENT CO., Eg&';:ﬁ;_r ﬁgﬁgﬁﬁ BROTHERS, | EQUIPMENT, | MECHANICAL
INC. DIV. co. LLC
Rental COMPACT EXCAVATOR, 10’ Dig Depth
Current number in stock:
: $190.00 $273.00 $200.00
118. Average Age/Hours: Daily $212.00 $232.00 $235.00 $315.00 $175.00
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)
119. | Rental COMPACT EXCAVATOR, 10’ Dig Depth Weekly | $548.00 | $636.00 $700.00 LT $550.00 | $430.00 | $676.00 | $875.00
120. | Rental COMPACT EXCAVATOR, 10’ Dig Depth Monthly | $1,468.00 | $1,480.00 $1,600.00 $1,470.00 | $1,600.00 | $1,100.00 | $1,374.00 | $1,750.00
Rental COMPACT EXCAVATOR, 11’ Dig Depth
Current number in stock:
121. | Average Age/Hours: Daily | $272.00 | $304.00 $235.00 $370.00 $20000 | $190.00 | $318.00 | $235.00
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

Witness Signature:




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT STEPHEN'S
It COMMODITIES OR SERVICES COWIN YANCY L&M
No. Unit RENTALS :'é:.‘:i'l‘; EQUIPMENT CO., | _ g&';;’ﬁ:% ‘F:g::'sr.';ﬁ BROTHERS, | EQUIPMENT, | MECHANICAL
INC. DIV. CO. LLC

122."| Rental COMPACT EXCAVATOR, 11 Dig Depth Weekly | ¢708.00 | $804.00 $700.00 $73500 | $575.00 | $43000 | $796.00 | $975.00
123. | Rental COMPACT EXCAVATOR, 11’ Dig Depth Monthly | $1,697.00 | $1,830.00 $1,600.00 $1,945.00 | $1,700.00 | $1,100.00 | $1,608.00 | $1,900.00

Rental COMPACT EXCAVATOR, 12’ Dig Depth

Current number in stock:
124. | Average Age/Hours: Daily | $272.00 | $296.00 $280.00 $370.00 $250.00 | $250.00 | $321.00 | $250.00

Bidding on:

(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

125. | Rental, COMPACT EXCAVATOR, 12’ Dig Depth Weekly | $708.00 | $1,012.00 $800.00 $945.00 $700.00 | $600.00 | $960.00 | $1,050.00
126. | Rental, COMPACT EXCAVATOR, 12’ Dig Depth Monthly | $1,697.00 | $2,043.00 $1,800.00 $3,465.00 | $2,100.00 | $1,500.00 | $2,101.00 | $2,300.00

Witness Signat

Agent Signature:




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT
COWIN YANCY L&M ,
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES I NEFF sungeLt | EQUIPMENT co., BORDER gg:gf‘k‘:,‘ BROTHERS, | EQUIPMENT, MSETCE;::::‘iL
s RENTALS | RENTALS /25 EQUIPMENT DIV. L5 LS
Rental COMPACT EXCAVATOR, 14’ Dig Depth
Current number in stock:
127. | Average Age/Hours: Daily | $384.00 | $369.00 $390.00 $525.00 $35000 | 340000 | $670.00 | $300.00
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)
128. | Rental, COMPACT EXCAVATOR, 14’ Dig Depth Weekly | $1,000.00 | $956.00 $1,150.00 $1,260.00 | $975.00 | $900.00 | $1,350.00 | $1,100.00
129. | Rental, COMPACT EXCAVATOR, 14’ Dig Depth Monthly | $2,684.00 | $2,280.00 $2,700.00 $3,675.00 | $2,900.00 | $2,400.00 | $2,818.00 | $2,400.00
Renta] SKID LOADER, Rubber Tire, 1,600 LB
Current number in stock:
130. | Average Age/Hours: Daily | $180.00 | $195.00 NO BID $26500 | NOBID | $15000 | $29900 | NOBID
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

Witness Signature: a]ﬂ( Q;P

Agent Slgnatu




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
T
FLINT STEPHEN'S
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES COWIN YANCY L&NM
Uniit NEFF SUNBELT BORDER CONSTR. & MECHANICAL

No. ! RENTALS | RENnTALs | EQUIP ?;E,NT €O+ | EQuIPMENT FOl:)fif:Rv BRO; g.ERS’ EQ”:_':T:ENT’
131. | Rental SKID LOADER, Rubber Tire, 1,600 LB Weekly | $488.00 | $520.00 NO BID $525.00 NOBID | $400.00 | $727.00 NO BID

Rental SKID LOADER, Rubber Tire, 1,600 LB
132, Monthly | $1,12400 | §1,102.00 | NOBID st,47000 | NOBID | 590000 | $1,493.00 | NOBID

Rental SKID LOADER, Rubber Track, 1,900 LB

Current number in stock:
133. | Average Age/Hours: Daily | $256.00 | $263.00 $285.00 $315.00 | NOBID | $25200 | $33800 | NOBID

Bidding on:

(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

134, | Rental, SKID LOADER, Rubber Track 1,900 LB Weekly | $704.00 | $724.00 $800.00 $630.00 | NOBID | $620.00 | $960.00 | NOBID
135. | Rental, SKID LOADER, Rubber Track 1,900 LB Monthly | $1,754.00 | $1,63500 | 180000 $1,680.00 | NOBID | $1,350.00 | $2,101.00 | NOBID

——— e
& 3ot &

Agent Signatu

=
T =




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT STEPHEN’S
It COMMODITIES OR SERVICES COWIN YANCY L&M
No. Unit RENN!::I‘F:LS i‘é:_‘:ﬁ';:; EQUIPMENT CO., E(?&l;?ﬁ;rr gg:g:zﬁ BROTHERS, | £QuiPMENT, | MECHANICAL
INC. DIV. Cao. LLC
Rental SKID LOADER, RUBBER Track, 2,500 LB
Current number in stock:
e/H :
136, | Average Age/Hours Daily | $316.00 | $335.00 $365.00 $370.00 NOBID | $29500 | $670.00 | NOBID
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)
137. | Rental, SKID LOADER, Rubber Track 2,500 LB Weekly | $864.00 | $892.00 $900.00 $710.00 NOBID | $750.00 | $1,350.00 | NOBID
138. | Rental, SKID LOADER, Rubber Track 2,500 LB Monthly | $2,272.00 | $1,635.00 $2,100.00 $1,785.00 | NOBID | $1500.00 | $2,818.00 | NOBID
Rental CUTT OFF SAW, 14” with blade
Current number in stock:
139. | Average Age/Hours: Daily | $72.00 | $123.00 NO BID NoBmD | NOBID | §71.00 ' $29900 | NOBID
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

Witness Signature:

(AT
swnisimr'—e 7 & E




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
NEFF SUNBELT S BORDER col;—ﬂleTNl_!r. & L3 oA
MECHANICAL
ll:‘e: COMMODITIES OR SERVICES Unit RENTALS RENTALS EQUIP:\I:E‘::I'.'JT Co., EQUIPMENT FO]:;;?{TRY BR%"_«I{:{?;‘S‘ EQU:.T(':ENT’
b CO.

140. | Rental CUTT OFF SAW, 14" with blade Weekly | $184.00 | $345.00 NO BID NO BID NOBID | $171.00 | $727.00 | NOBID
141. | Rental CUTT OFF SAW, 14" with blade Monthly | $297.00 | $838.00 NO BID NOBID NOBID | $467.00 | $1,493.00 | NOBID

Rental CONCRETE SAW, Walk Behind, 57-60 HP with blade

Current number in stock:

- NOBID | NOBID | $338.00 $250.00

142. | A verage Age/Hours: Daily | NOBID | $298.00 NO BID NO BID

Bidding on:

(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

143. | Rental CONCRETE SAW, Walk Behind, 57-60 HP with blade Weekly | NOBID | gg66 00 NOBID NOBID NOBID | NOBID | $893.00 | NOBID

Rental CONCRETE SAW, Walk Behind, 57-60 HP with blade NO BID NO BID NOBID | \oBm | NoBD | $181900 | NOBD
144, ’ ' Monthly $2,214.00 819.

Witness Signature: ﬁ AA Qj
Agent Signature@z/ g ._)2_,




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT STEPHEN'S
COWIN YANCY L&M
NEFF SUNBELT BORDER CONSTR. & MECHANICAL
!l:‘em COMMODITIES OR SERVICES Unit RENTALS RENTALS EQUIPMENT CO., EQUIPMENT FORESTRY BROTHERS, | EQUIPMENT,
0. INC. e co. LLC
Rental BREAKER, Hydraulic, 2,100 LB
Current number in stock:
| 145, Average Age/Hours: Daily $568.00 $290.00 NOBID NO BID NOBID $475.00 $473.00 NO BID
Bidding on:
{Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)
146. | Rental BREAKER, Hydraulic, 2,100 LB Weekly | $1,480.00 | $800.00 NO BID NO BID NOBID | $1,250.00 | $1,162.00 | NOBID
Rental BREAKER, Hydraulic, 2,100 LB
147. Monthly | $2,878.00 | $1,950.00 NOBID NO BID NOBID $2,800.00 | $£2,400.00 NO BID
Rental BREAKER, Hydraulic, 3,500 LB
Current number in stock:
148. Average Age/Hours: Daily $696.00 $290.00 $400.00 NOBID NOBID $800.00 $81.00 NO BID
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

Witness Signature:

Agent Signature:




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT STEPHEN'S
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES COWIN YANCY L&M
Unit NEFF SUNBELT BORDER CONSTR. & MECHANICAL

Ne. RENTALS | RENTALS EQU"’?;E" €0- | EquipMENT FOl:ﬁfrTRY BRogg-ERS’ EQUL'L“(!ENT'

Rental BREAKER, Hydraulic, 3,500 LB
149. Weekly | $1,808.00 | $800.00 $1,660.00 NOBID NOBID | $1,500.00 | $249.00 | NOBID
150. | Rental BREAKER, Hydraulic, 3.500 LB Monthly | $3,872.00 | $1,950.00 |  $3,550.00 NOBID | NOBID | $4,00000 | $582.00 | NOBID

Rental BREAKER, Hydraulic, 5,000 LB

Current number in stock:
151. | Average Age/Hours: Daily | $684.00 | $290.00 $610.00 NO BID NOBID | §$1,500.00 | NOBID | NOBID

Bidding on:

(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

152. | Rental, BREAKER, Hydraulic, 5,000 LB Weekly | $1,776.00 | $800.00 $2,000.00 NO BID NOBID | $3,500.00 | NOBID | NOBID
153. | Rental, BREAKER, Hydraulic, 5,000 LB Monthly | $4257:00 | $1,950.00 | $5,800.00 NOBID | NOBID |$9,000.00 | NOBID | NOBD

Witness Signature:

(L
< =

Ll




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT STEPHEN'S
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES COWIN YANCY L&M
| e | et | coumrco, | gomen | cone f G fobaN | schicn
INC. DIV, co. LLC
Rental SOD Cutter, 18”
Current number in stock:
Average Age/Hours: $00.00
154. Daily NO BID . NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $101.00 NO BID
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)
155. | Rental SOD Cutter, 18" Weekly NO BID $272.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $341.00 NOBID
156. | Rental SOD Cutter, 18" Monthly NO BID $630.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $840.00 NO BID
Rental, SOD Roller, Pull Behind
Current number in stock:
157. | Average Age/Hours: Daily NO BID $25.00 NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID $27.00 NOBID
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

Witness Signature:

Agent Signature:




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT STEPHEN'S
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES COWIN YANCY L&M MECHANICAL
it et | et | quemewrco, | joowm | consmre | L Gh [ okt
INC. ) co. LLC

Rental, SOD Roller, Pull Behind

T o NOoBD | NOBID | NOBD | $67.00 | NOBDD
' Weekly NOBID $60.00 NO BID

Rental, SOD Roller, Pull Behind NO BID NO BID $205.00 NO BID
159. Monthly NO BID $630.00 NO BID NO BID

Rental, POWER Curber with Mold

Current number in stock:
160, | Average Age/Hours: Daily | NOBD | nomm NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID

Bidding on:

(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)
161. | Rental, POWER Curber with Mold Weekly NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID
162 Monthly | NOBID | NOBID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBD | NOBID | NOBID
~" | Rental, POWER Curber with Mold

Witness Signature: QVW[ ; )

Agent Signaturé;

g_)/"a:




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
ltem COMMODITIES OR SERVICES T NEFF T COWIN BORDER col;LSIFRT & YANCY L&EM NSTE"“EN'S
No. RENTALS | RENTALS EQU'P?;'(‘::NT €O+ | EQuIPMENT | FORESTRY Bnoggsns. EQ”:_':‘(':ENT , [ MECHANICAL
: DIV, -
Rental 6” Pump, Trash, with 20" Suction and 50’ Discharge
Current number in stock:
163, | Average Age/Hours: Daily | 332400 | $223.00 NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $390.00 | NOBID
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)
164. | Rental, 6” Pump, Trash with 20" Suction and 50’ Discharge Weekly | $860.00 | $405.00 NO BID NOBID NOBID | NOBID | $1,060.00 | NOBID
165. | Rental, 6” Pump, Trash with 20° Suction and 50" Discharge Monthly | $1,768.00 | $1,215.00 NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | $2,72500 | NOBID
$0,75-
DAY
L)
166. | Additional Suction LF vfz }Eéf[)( 30% off NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID $5.00 NO BID
$3.50-
MONTH
50.25-
DAY
167. | Additional Discharge LF S0 | 30% off NOBID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | 85.00 NO BID
$1.40-
~ MONTH

é//{@;(’

Witness Signataute:

Agent Signature®

Z,ég




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
COWIN L&M STEPHEN’S
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES T R é"N';:rFAFLS sungeLt | EQUIPMENT co, BORDER col:é'ﬁ N R?r,:lcy EQUIPMENT, | MECHANICAL
No. RENTALS INC. EQUIPMENT | FORESTRY [ B COERS’ LLC
DIV. .

Rental 8” Pump, Trash, with 20" Suction and 50° Discharge

Current number in stock:
168. | Average Age/Hours: Daily | NoBID | $338.00 NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBD

Bidding on:

(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

169. | Rental, 8” Pump, Trash, with 20’ Suction and 50’ Discharge Weekly | \opmp | $574.00 NOBID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID
170. | Rental , 8” Pump Trash, with 20’ Suction and 50’ Discharge Monthly NOBID $1,721.00 NOBID S NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID
171. | Additional Suction LF NOBID | 300, g NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID
172. | Additional Discharge LF | NOBD | 340 s NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | NOBD

Witness Signature; O Q—"
g@/:/%%

Agent Signature:




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT STEPHEN'S
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES COWIN YANCY L&M
No. Unit Rg:ﬁ:: AFLS i‘é:.‘:i’i; EQUIPMENT CO., E;&';:E';T gg:g%ﬁ BROTHERS, | EQUIPMENT, | MECHANICAL
INC. i co. LLC
Rental, 10" Pump, Trash, with 20° Suction and 50’ Discharge
Current number in stock:
: NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $500.00 NO BID

173. Average Age/Hours: Daily $338.00

Bidding on:

(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)
174. | Rental, 10” Pump, Trash, with 20’ Suction and 50’ Discharge Weekly | NOBID | ¢594 09 NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | $145500 | NOBID
175. | Rental, 10” Pump Trash, with 20’ Suction and 50’ Discharge Monthly NO BID $1,721.00 NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID $4,080.00 NOBDD
176. | Additional Suction LF | NOBID | 3000 o5p NOBID NOBID | NOBID |  $6.00 NOBID
NO BID

177. | Additional Discharge LF | NOBID | 300, opf AOLNS NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $6.00 NDEID

Rental, 12" Pump, Trash, with 20" Suction and 50° Discharge

Current number in stock:
178. | Average Age/Hours: Daily | NOBID | $506.00 NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | $485.00 NO BID

Bidding on:

(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

Witness Signature: ﬁ AN @

Agent Signature: y -




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT STEPHEN'S
[tem COMMODITIES OR SERVICES COWIN YANCY L&M
| alis | T | covmieo, | gomen | conTre | sugriens, | cotime, | MEGHwwER:
’ DIV. :
” . ) . . NO BID NOBID | $1,475.00 NO BID
2 ;
179. | Rental 12" Pump Trash, with 20" Suction and 50 Discharge Weekly | NOBID $810.00 NO BID NO BID
» . ) : ' Ty NO BID NOBID NOBID | $4,675.00 NO BID
180. | Rental, 12 Pump, Trash, with 20’ Suction and50’ Discharge Monthly NO BID $2,430.00 NO BID
NOBID 30% off NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID $7.00 NO BID
181. o . LF
Additional Suction
182. | Additional Discharge LF NOBID | 309 off NOBID NO BID NOBID | NOBID $7.00 NO BID
Rental, TRENCH BOX, 8’ x 10’
Current number in stock:
183. Average Age/Hours: Daily $92.00 $104.00 NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID $145.00 NO BID
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

Witness Signature;

>

Agent Signature?




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18,2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT STEPHEN'S
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES COWIN YANCY L&M
| el [ et | soumenrco, | jgomen | contre f L CREL | ol | necamca
INC. S co. LLC
NO BID NO BID NO BID $395.00 NO BID
184. Rental, TRENCH BOX, 8’ x 10" Weekly $259.00 $256.00 NO BID
1g5 | Rental, TRENCH BOX, 8" x 10 Monthly | $647.00 | $720.00 NO BID NOBD | NOBID | NOBID | $1,21000 | NOBID
Rental, TRENCH BOX, 4’ x 10°
Current number in stock:
: NO BID NO BID NOBID $115.00 NO BID
186. Average Age/Hours: Daily $64.00 $92.00 NO BID
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)
187. | Rental, TRENCH BOX, 4’ x 10’ Weekly | $169.00 | $220.00 NOBID nOA:Ie NOBID | NOBID | $360.00 | NOBID
185, | Rental, TRENCH BOX, 4’ x 10 Monthly | $424.00 | $688.00 NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $1,000.00 | NOBID

Witness Signatu

Agent Signature:




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT STEPHEN'S
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES COWIN YANCY L&M
Ne. " [ e | mevais | roumvenrco. | SRR | ConTy | smoriens, EQUIPMENT, | MECHANICAL
. DIV. :
Rental, Walk-Behind Vibratory Trench Roller with Remote $512.00 | $366.00 $575.00 $420.00 NO BID $500.00 | NOBID NO BID
189. . " Weekly
Drum width 22
190, Rental, Walk-B‘fhmd Vibratory Trench Roller with Remote Monthly | $1,324.00 $844.00 $1.300.00 $1,155.00 NO BID $1,000.00 NOBID NO BID
Drum width 22 \
Walk-Behind Vibratory Trench Roller with Remote
Drum width 22"
Current number in stock:
191. | Average Age/Hours: Daily | $19200 | $126.00 $235.00 $21000 | NOBID | 320000 | NOBID | NOBID
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)
Rental Walk-Behind Vibratory Trench Roller with Remote
192. Weekly | $512.00 | $366.00 $575.00 NO BID NOBID | NOBID | $74900 | NOBID
Drum width 24”
Rental Walk-Behind Vibratory Trench Roller with Remote
193. Monthly , NO BID NO BID NOBID | $1,496.00 NO BID
Drum width 247 $1,324.00 | $844.00 $1,300.00
Witness Signature: ’—\Cé‘/wk Q)

?5‘%_

Agent Signature:




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18,2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT STEPHEN'S
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES COWIN YANCY L&M
| s | et | coummmrco, [ oonen | cowma | SRR | oot | Eciavicas
INC. Bivl co. LLC
Rental Walk-Behind Vibratory Trench Roller with Remote
Drum width 24"
Current number in stock:
194. Daily $192.00 $126.00 $235.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $250.00 NOBID
Average Age/Hours:
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)
Rental Walk Behind Vibratory Trench Roller with Remote
195. o Weekly | $512.00 | $668.00 $575.00 NO BID NOBID | $50000 | NOBID | NOBID
Drum width 32
Rental Walk Behind Vibratory Trench Roller with Remote
196 Monthly | $1324.00 | $1,704.00 |  $1,300.00 NOBDD | NOBID |$1,00000 ( NOBID | NOBID
Drum width 32”
Witness Signature:




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711 DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT STEPHEN'S
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES COWIN YANCY L&M
Unit NEFF SUNBELT BORDER CONSTR. & MECHANICAL
No. 3 RENTALS | ReNTaLs | BQUIFMENTCO- I poupnient | FomesTRY BROTUERS, FQUIFMENT,
’ DIv. :

Rental Walk-Behind Vibratory Trench Roller with Remote

Drum width 327

Current number in stock:
197. | Average Age/Hours: Daily | $192.00 | $248.00 $235.00 NoBIp | NOBID | §20000 | NOBID | NOBID

Bidding on:

(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

Rental Walk-Behind Vibratory Trench Roller with Remote
198. Weekly $£512.00 $668.00 $575.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Drum width 337
199. | Rental Walk-Behind Vibratory Trench Roller with Remote Monthly | $1,324.00 | $1.704.00 $1.300.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Drum width 33”

Witness Signature:

Agent Signature:




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES NEFF SUNBELT COWIN BORDER coNR. & YANCY L&M STEPHEN'S
i L RENTALS | REnTaLs [ EQUIPMENTCO. | poypnent | Fomestay | BROTHERS, | EQUIPMENT, | MECHANICAL
INC. DIV, co. LLC
Rental Walk-Behind Vibratory Trench Roller with Remote
Drum width 337
Current number in stock:
: NO BID NO BID NO BID
200. Average Age/Hours: Daily $192.00 $248.00 $235.00 NO BID NOBID
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)
Rental, Single-Drum Ride-on vibratory Compactor
201. Weekly | $692.00 | $708.00 $1,100.00 NO BID $800.00 ( $700.00 | $1,071.00 | NOBID
Drum width 54" Smooth
Rental, Single-Drum Ride-on vibratory Compactor
202. . . Monthly | $1996.00 | $1,652.00 $2,200.00 NO BID $2,400.00 | $1,500.00 | $2,537.00 NO BID
Drum width 54 Smooth

Witness Signature:

Agent Signature;




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711 DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT STEPHEN'S
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES COWIN YANCY L&M
Unit NEFF SUNBELT BORDER CONSTR. & MECHANICAL
No, s RENTALS | RENTALS EQ”“’?;E“ €O 1 equipment | ForEsTRY BROESERS’ EQ”:_';‘“EENT '
: DIV, .

Rental, Single-Drum Ride-on vibratory Compactor

Drum width 54 Smooth

Current number in stock:
203. | Average AgeHours: Daily | $252.00 | $268.00 $375.00 $500.00 | s$27500 | $250.00 | $40000 | NOBID

Bidding on:

(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

Rental, Single-Drum Ride-on vibratory Compactor

$980.00 $700.00 | $1,071.00 | NOBID
2 . 071.

204"\ Drum width 54 Pad-foot Weekly | $828.00 SL10000 | g1 15500 | 985000

Rental, Single-Drum Ride-on Vibratory Compactor

2

205. | b width 547 Padfoot Monthly | 5232000 | $2460.00 | $2,20000 | $294000 | $%33000 | $1,500.00 | $2537.00 | NOBID

Witness Signature:

Agent Signatu =

¥




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711 DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT STEPHEN'S
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES COWIN YANCY L&m
Unit NEFF SUNBELT BORDER CONSTR. & MECHANICAL
Ne. " RENTALS | RENTALS EQU"'::%NT €0 | equirment | FORESTRY BROESERS' EQULT(!ENT , i
' DIv. :

Rental, Single-Drum Ride-on Vibratory Compactor

Drum width 54" Pad-foot

Current number in stock:

. $250.00 $400.00 NO BID

206. | Ay erage Age/Hour: Daily $304.00 $360.00 $375.00 $500.00 $290.00

Bidding on:

(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

Rental, Single-Drum Ride-on Vibratory Compactor
2 ) $900.00 | $1,366.00 NO BID
207. Drum width 66” Smooth Weekly $864.00 $820.00 $1,300.00 $1,300.00 $950.00

Rental, Single-Drum Ride-on Vibratory Compactor
208 Monthly $2,316.00 | $2,100.00 $2,950.00 $3,570.00 $2,800.00 $2,400.00 | $3,104.00 NO BID
“7" | Drum width 66 Smooth

Witness Signature:

Agent Signature?




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711 DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18,2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT STEPHEN'S
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES COWIN YANCY L&M
w Unit naw:l,s :‘é:gig EQUIPMENT co,, | . 331';2&';1, ﬁgﬁgﬁﬁ BROTHERS, | EQUIPMENT, | MECHANICAL
INC. i co. LLC
Rental, Single-Drum Ride-on Vibratory Compactor
Drum width 66” Smooth
ber i :
200, Current number in stock Daily $316.00 $337.00 $540.00 $605.00 $350.00 $325.00 $405.00 NO BID
Average Age/Hours:
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)
Rental, Single-Drum Ride-on Vibratory Compactor
$900.00 | $1,356.00 NO BID
210. Drum width 66” Pad-foot Weekly | $984.00 $820.00 $1,300.00 $1,300.00 $1,000.00
Rental, Single-Drum Ride-on Vibratory Compactor
211 Monthly $2,692.00 | $2,100.00 $2,950.00 $3,570.00 $3,000.00 | $2,400.00 | $3,104.00 NOBID
" | Drum width 66" Pad-foot

Witness Signature:

Agent Signature:




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT STEPHEN'S
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES COWIN YANCY L&M
) e | et | eoumimrco, | mowen | cowtie |G | ol [ Ecivicn
INC. DIV. Co. LLC
Rental, Single-Drum Ride-on Vibratory Compactor
Drum width 66 Pad-foot
Current number in stock:
. $360.00 $337.00 $540.00 $605.00 $325.00 $405.00 NO BID
212, Average Age/Hours Daily $350.00
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)
Rental, Single-Drum Ride-on Vibratory Compactor 7
213, Weekly | $1,076.00 | $1,300.00 |  $1,450.00 NOBID | $1:20000 | 3123000 | §1,736.00 | NOBID
Drum width 84" Smooth
Rental, Single-Drum Ride-on Vibratory Compacto
ana, | el Side-on Vibratory Compactor Monthly | 52:824.00 | $280500 | $3,40000 | NOBID | $3,60000 | $3400.00 | $435200 | NOBD
Drum width 84" Smooth

e o

Witness Signature:

c. &2

Agent Signature:




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES = NEFF SUNBELT COWIN BORDER Conemm & YANCY Lam | STEPHEN'S
No. - RENTALS | RENTALs | EQUIP :‘;ENT €0 | EQuipMENT | FORESTRY Bnoggsns, EQ”LT(;E“ [ MECHANICAL
: DIV. :

Rental, Single-Drum Ride-on Vibratory Compactor
Drum width 84" Smooth
Current number in stock:
A

215, | Average Age/Hours Daily | $392.00 | $480.00 $540.00 NO BID $400.00 | $450.00 | $496.00 | NOBID
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

216. | Rental, Single-Drum Ride-on Vibratory Compactor Weekly | $1,140.00 | NOBID $1450.00 $1,300.00 | 398500 | §$1,736.00 | NOBID

. = NO BID

Drum width 84" Pad-foot
Rental, Single-Drum Ride-on Vibratory Compactor

217. | Drum width 84” Pad-foot Monthly | $3252.00 | NOBID |  $3,400.00 NoBp | 3390000 | $3,400.00 | $4,352.00 | NOBID
Rental, Single-Drum Ride-on Vibratory Compactor
Drum width 84" Pad-foot
Current number in stock:

218. | Average Age/Hours Daily | $420.00 | NOBDD $540.00 NO BID $45000 | $390.00 | $496.00 | NOBID
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)

i
Witness Signature: _ @

Agent Signature: &g/ é:@__




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711

DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES - NEFF SUNBELT COWIN sorDER | comerns | vAnCY L&M STEPHEN'S
No. o RENTALS | RENTALs | EQUIPMENTCO, | .onovent | Forestry | BROTHERS, | EQuIPMENT, | MECHANICAL
INC. DIV, co. LLC
219. | Rental, Concrete Bucket; One (1) Cubic Yard Weekly | NOBID | $144.00 NO BID NO BID NoBID | NOBID | $222.00 NOBID
220. | Rental, Concrete Bucket; One (1) Cubic Yard Monthly | NOBID | $408.00 NO BID NO BID NOBID | NOBID | $613.00 | NOBID
Rental, Concrete Bucket
One (1) Cubic Yard
Current number in stock:
21, Daily | NOBID | $56.00 NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $9000 | NOBID
Average Age/Hours
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)
222. | Rental, Concrete Bucket; Two (2) Cubic Yard Weekly | NOBID | g9 g9 NO BID NOBID | NOBID | NOBID | $381.00 | NOBID
. ') 5
273, Rental, Concrete Bucket; Two (2) Cubic Yard Monthly NO BID $544.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $731.00 NO BID

Witness Signature: @

Agent Signature:%%&—{% @




ITB NUMBER: 16-100711 DEPARMENT OF PURCHASING & CONTRACTING

BID OPENING DATE: July 18, 2016

ITB NAME: Rental of Various Heavy Equipment BID TABULATION AGENT: Judi Moore
(Annual Contract W/Two One Year Option Renewal)
FLINT STEPHEN'S
Item COMMODITIES OR SERVICES COWIN YANCY L&M
| e | et [ coumrco, [ goneem | conra SRR | codiimer | nechaNicas
. DIV, co. LLC
Rental, Concrete Bucket; Two (2) Cubic Yard
Current number in stock:
Average Age/Hours
224, Daily NO BID $78.00 NOBID NO BID NOBID NO BID $123.00 NO BID
Bidding on:
(Manufacturer’s Name and Brand Name/Number)
Free on Varies by $100.00 TO
board . $100.00 ) $160.00
225, | DELIVERY Charge LOT (FOB) $125.00 $125.00 $150.00 equ;?zrgent 1000.00
Pick-up
$25.00
each way
Flatbed/Do
tail/Roll-
¥ :::Mko Varies by $100.00
226. | PICK- UP Ch LOT $127.00 equipment $£100.00 TO $£160.00
arge Sy $125.00 $125.00 $150.00 size 1000.00
Detach
/Drop Deck
: $178.00
cach way

Witness Signature; -

e )

Agent Signature;?




